H o

L . )
COUNTY PINAL AREA  PICACHO LEASE NO, FEE
WELL NAME EL PASO NATURAL GAS #1-21 ARTZONA GAS STORAGE

LOCATTON SW_NW SEC _ 21 TWP _78  RANGE 8E  FOOTAGE _1980' FNL & 660 ' FWL
ELEV _1527' @R kB seup pate /-3~ O & ggﬁ?’mmﬁ Eggﬁ;‘ s
CONTRACTOR ~ UNITED DRILLING INC, ROSWELL NM IA s sG

CASING IZE  DEPTH  CEMENT  LINFR SIZE & DEPTH DRILLED BY ROTARY

DRILLED BY CABLE TOOL
PRODUCTIVE RESERVOIR
INITIAL PRODUCTION

_ . SOURCE
FORMATION TOPS DEPTHS L.L, E,L. REMARKS

ELECTRIC LOGS PERFORATED INTERVALS PROD, INTERVALS] SAMPLE LOG
SAMPLE DESCRP,
SAMPLE NO. /9058
CORE ANALYSIS
DSTs

REMARKS s, e R APP, TO PLUG
PLUGGING REP,
COMP, REPORT

WATER WELL ACCEPTED BY

BOND CO,LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY BOND NO, 23-007-048

DATE 3/21/2005

BOND AMT., $ 25,000.00 CANCELLED ORGANIZATTON REPORT YES 2/16/2005

FILING RECEIPT 3139 LOC, PLAT X WELL BOOK X PLAT BOOK X

APL NO. 02-021-20009 DATE ISSUED  3/21/2006 DEDICATION N/A - STRAT TEST

PERMIT NUMBER 933

{over)




WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND WELL LOG
DESIGNATE TYPE OF COMPLETION

New Temporary Work- Plug Same Different
well L1 Abandon” P& oOver [] Deepen [ 1 mack [ Reservar [ Reservoir L1  on [0 @as 0 Dy O

DESCRIPTION OF WELL AND LEASE

Operator Address & Phpne No, AP EZom YEZS
£/ %50 /\/4??4;4:/ 605* ,7/\/ﬂﬂo=wa/r. Coly Spas Co  S6903
Federal, State or Indian Lease Number or name of lessor if fee lease Well Number Fistd & Reservoir ¥ ¢~
%5 - Oprized /-2 N
Location ;. , County ,
(950 FNC +660" Fad L v/

Sec. Township-Range or Block & Survay

Sec 2/ T 78 K5~

Date spudded Date total depth reached Di‘t? compieted, ready to Elovation (DF, KB, RT or Gr.} Ele\éagon of casing
E e - / -~
(-3 2W6 | Jo+E5-Zooe |0 [5275¢ 1557 My | Peadlenge 5 oy
Total depth ; PB.TD. Single, dual, or triple Eomp!enon? gm&issaeggg& énp%!?! gompelion
5787 - Sl -
Producing Intervai(s) for this completion , Rotary tools used (in[ervgi) Cable tools used (interval)
/ ; —_
Ogen Mle Sec0’ 8789 C-578Y
Was this well directicnally drilled? | Was directional survey made? Was copy of directional survey filed? | Date fited
Mo Ve s Yers [ O+ -Zovs
Type of electric or other iys run (check logs filed with the Commission) Date filed
/Za?'r’r/m ,J,,,,; oy éﬂmwe ﬂv . {/ | el e ftie o Vﬂ(m;”\, - (;mﬁ-r’:; S5 frr/ /;/"4"7:"&7 /0 ff‘g’"zaﬂd

Vi lerm sl  Cyprare; Wondevsr Bgnof,  CASING RECORD L vim e ble Mesroric foosomerc o

Casing {report all strings setin well — conductor, surface, intermediate, producing, etc.)

Purpose Size hole drifled Size casing set Weight ([b./it.) Depth set Sacks cement Amount pulied
Condiceror 30" - 20" 797 (7 yurdc [
Sarlice 7% /35" A )b/ (G0 B | S0 < V7
- + g ’ 7
Tuzerneditre (2 Fop ! v Ygvo- e | TECC LB | (728 sx o

TUBING RECORD yop’ - i LINER REGORD
Size Depth set Packer set at Size Top Bottom Sacks cement Screen (ft.)
in. ft. ft. in. ft. ft.
PERFORATION RECORD ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE RECORD
Number per ft. Size & type Gepth interval Amount & kind of material used Depth interval
N
INITIAL PRODUCTION
Date of first production /V 5 Producing method {indicate if flowing, gas lit or pumping — If pumping, show size & type of pump)
Date of tast | Hours fested Choke size Olf prod. during test Gas pred. during test Water prod. during test Qil gravity
bbls MCF bbls *AP|
Tubing pressure Casing pressure g“;,ﬁ',féﬁﬁ greﬁf b, Qil Gas Water Gas - oil ratio
bbls, MCF bbls.

Disposition of gas (state whether vented, used for fuel or sofd)

CERTIFICATE: 1, the undersigned, under the penaity of perjury, state that | am the /W G 41 :(;7 ey /_Ef'd // 7 f/ i /A i/  ofthe
/:.' / %10 /‘//; Fttamsy / 75 (company), and that | am authorized by said company fo make this report; and that this
report was prepared under my supervision and direction and that the facts stated therein are true, correct and complete to the best of my knowledge.

[0~/8 - 2604 Ao %Zéimfg

Date Slgnat
STATE OF ARIZONA
QIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSICN
é{d: aﬂcgngég%% iiastrator Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Well Log
ona Geok urvey File One Co
Permit No. _& 4&&‘;’6',\2 ess, #100 Form No. 4 e e oy

10/88




DETAIL OF FORMATIONS PENETRATED

FORMATION TOP BOTTOM DESCRIPTION ®
Uﬂ/mf A//qw‘a/ Um'f 0’— fwﬂa /, 5?01 Jnfer jga/m/ﬂ?/ _c,'/—r, sau.:// jmw/ -+ C‘/d7/
Vp/?er Peacho Solr| 1 590" | 3,060 " S+ c/a)/S?“aHe
/-0;7"' U;;:f o 30601 3 708 ﬁné/a/ri?"c, 6/4)’3?’0‘43 + .Ce/f
“fq Ge. e t )
[ower ﬁcac[@ Salt Z, 7673f %5/01 Salt, 6/67/5{0»@ wa‘ﬂr o 62»447/04”/ 7<

La e Uhl"f
//a)/c? facies
[ower (it

A//w;a/ Jacies

Y510’

1430

530"

g,78¢"

/jn l/a/ya'fz/ < ﬁ/:foqe jraa/f’ﬁ/ Jato

sia./‘f‘ s femne

S,‘/n o e

ar‘/fo/\‘:' 9

et 7‘4¢ fase

gaua/sﬂ"e {7,»-0/'4‘? 11T

panti € Wﬁ'Sé ('oﬂjzwn ore TS

* Show all Important zones of porosity, detail of all cores, and all drill-stem tests, Including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing
and shul-In prassures, and recoveriss,

INSTRUCTIONS:

Attach drillers log or other acceptable log of well,
This Well Completion or Recompletion report and well tog shall be filed with the Oil and Gas Program Administrator, Afizona Geological Survey,

416 W. Congress #100, Tucson, AZ 85701 not later than thifly days after completion pursuant io A.A.C, R12-7-121.

Form No, 4




SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

1. Name of Operator ,1[/ ﬂ fe7] Nq Tavra / é-‘dr.i' (a vt AP #r/&/

7 . é
2. OlLWELL [ GASWELL [] OTHER [XT (Specity) 5 7&e s j)lﬂ}ri e _7:‘5 vl

3. Well Name 46— S\ #/"Z/

Location /_?5?0’;/&/5/ é_é()’/‘a/(,

Sec, 2/ Twp. Z8 Rge. y E County ﬂ la. ] / , Arizona

4. Federal, State, or Indgian Lease Number, of lessor's name if fee lease

0&)»16’/ AIY /f/ %50

5. Field or Pool Name A A

6. Check Appropriale Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT--OFF WEEKLY PROGRESS
FRACTURE TREAT DIRECTIONAL DRIEL FRACTURE TREATMENT REPAIRING WELL
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE PERFORATE CASING SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ALTER CASING
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS TEM 1 PoRAR )/ ABANDONMENT
(OTHER) (OTHER)

(NOTE: Report resulls of muitiple complation on;Nell Complation

or Hecompletion Report and Log, Form 4)

1. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Glearly state all perlinent details, and give pertinent dates, Including estimated date
of starting any proposed work. If welt is directionally drilled, glve subsurface locations and measurec and true vertical dapths for all markers and

zenes pertinent to this work,

El Paso Natural Gas is requesting approval to temporarily abandon the AGS #1-21 fora
period of up to three years. This period of temporary abandonment is necessary to allow
for additional testing and to fully evaluate the options for converting this well to
beneficial use in association with the potential development of a salt cavern gas storage
facility at this site.

The wells casing integrity is evidenced by the presence of cement to surface on the
surface and intermediate casing strings. The well has not been stimulated and no well
tests been performed to date.

The well bore is full to the surface with 9.3 Ib/gallon drilling mud containing at least 15
Ib/barrel of bentonite with a viscosity of 53 seconds per quart. The well head has been
secured with a casing head flange with side valve and bolted plate steel.

L=k S

8. | hereby certify that the fo%wrmct.
Signed A%e/ Title ﬁm’r:gyftf’ Date -/0-

STATE OF ARIZONA
OlL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
Sundry Noiiqe and Reports On Wells
Permit No. ?—3 3 Form No. 25 File One Copy

5/36




SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

. Name of Operator /C/ %50 /\/‘? Toia / 6"& < dwr/?aﬂ o

. otwelr [ GASWELL [] OTHER [X (Specify) s 7;%:;1‘6’4/‘6— Y
. Well Name ﬁg—f 'ﬁ_,/”’Z/
Location [ 950 ! I . GoO Fdl
Sec. 2/ Twp. 75 Rge. y éﬂ County /ﬂ/ falkd / , Arizona

. Federal, State, or Indian Lease Number, or lessor’s name If fee lease

Ow»mr/ é?/ /”ﬂ/ %S@

. Field or Pool Name /V 4

. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:

TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT--OFF WEEKLY PROGRESS | ]
FRAGTURE TREAT DIRECTIONAL DRILL FRACTURE TREATMENT REPAIRING WELL ]
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE PERFORATE CASING SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ALTER CASING |
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS TEAMPURAR ¥ ABANDONMENT >
{OTHER) -

(OTHER)
{NOTE: Report results of muliple completion on Well Completion
or Recompietion Report and Log, Form 4)

1. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent detalls, and glve pertinent dates, including estimated date
of starling any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsuiface jocations and measured and frue vertical depths for all markers and

zones pertinent to this work.

El Paso Natural Gas is requesting approval to temporarily abandon the AGS #1-21 for a
period of up to three years. This period of temporary abandonment to allow for
additional testing and for El Paso to fully evaluate our options for converting the well to
other beneficial use in association with the potential development of a salt cavern gas
storage facility at this site.

The well is full to the surface of 9.3 lb/gal drilling mud containing at least 15 Ib /bbi of
sodium bentonite with a viscosity of 53 seconds per quart. The well head has been
secured with a casing head flange with side valve and bolted plate steel.

Signed

8. [ heraby certify that the foregolng Is true and correcl.
/}/;{ jﬁm~ 1we _ e ((/’1 28 e vate /O 5208

STATE OF ARIZONA

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
Sundry Notice and Reports On Wells

Permit No. ?3 3 Form No. 25 File One Copy

5/96




Core #1 Above Upper Cavern Interval
1700-1760 Rec. 58.25'

Box 1-1 0 1-20

RESPEC OMNI
Box FT. Box FT.
1.3 1752
1.6 1744
1.8 1736
1.11 1727
1.15 1717
1.18 1709

Balance of boxes to Casa Grande Turbine Sta.

Core #2 Above Upper Cavern Interval
1860-1920 Rec. 60.55'

Box 2-1 10 2-22

RESPEC OMNI
Box FT. Box FT.
2.1 1917-1920
2.4 1909-1911
2.6 1903-19086
2.11 1891-1893
2.14 1883.5
2.18 1872
222 1861

Balance of boxes to Casa Grande Turbine Sta.

Core #3 Above Upper Cavern Interval
2020-2080 Rec. 58,5

Box 3-1 to 3-21

RESPEC OMNI

Box FT. Box FT.
3.1 2078

3.4 2070

37 2062

3.9 2056
3.12 2048
3.16 2037
3.17 2034

3.19 2028

Salt & Salt/Clay chicken wire
more clay btm 30'

above cavern interval

Salt & Ciay higher % than core 1
50+% Clay 1874.5" -1879'

2' Clay/Anhy 1884’

1" Clay 1913’

Salt & Clay, >15% Clay fraction




Balance of boxes to Casa Grande Turbine Sta.

Core #4
2180-2240

Box 4-1 to 4-25

Above Upper Cavern Interval

RESPEC

Box FT.

4.1 2239
4.4 2231
48 2220
410 2215
4.14 2206
4.18 2198
423 2186

Rec. 61.1' 2' Clay 2181+/-
1' Clay 2204-2205'
1' Clay 2239.5-2240.5'
Balance Salt w/ Clay fraction

OMNI
Box FT.
4.5 2234
4.7 2223
422 2188

Balance of boxes to Casa Grande Turbine Sta.

Core #5
2340-2400

Box 5-1 to 5-24

Upper Cavern Interval

RESPEC

Box ET.

5.2 2398
54 23891
5.7 2383
5.9 2378
5.1 2373
5.12 2371
5.14 2366
517 2360
5.21 2350

Rec. 60.1'

OMNI
Box FT.
5.6 2386

Balance of boxes to Casa Grande Turbine Sta.

Core #6
2500-2560

Box 6-1 to 6-23

Upper Cavern Interval

RESPEC
Box FT.
6.2 25565
6.7 2541
6.12 2528
6.15 2521
6.19 2512

Rec. 57.95' Largely Sait w/Clay fraction
2518-2520.5"is Anhy

OMNI
Box FT.

Balance of boxes to Casa Grande Turbine Sta.

233




Core #7 Upper Cavern Interval
2660-2720 Rec. 57.25' All salt w/Clay fraction
6" Clear sait @ 2690.3'

Box 7-1 to 7-22

7
RESPEC OMN!} ?-g—-
Box FT. Box FT.

7.2 2712

7.5 2704

7.8 2698

7.12 2687

7.14 2684

7.18 2674

7.21 2664

Balance of boxes to Casa Grande Turbine Sta.

Core #8 Anhy/Clay Interval above lower salt
3500-3560 Rec. 59.6' Mostly Anhy w/ some Clay

Box 8-1 to 8-25

RESPEC OMNI
Box FT. Box FT.
8.1 35657 8.2 3555
8.10 3532 8.6 3533
8.13 3525 8.12 3525
8.17 3514 8.15 3514
8.21 3503 8.19 3508

Baiance of boxes to Casa Grande Turbine Sta.

Core #9 Lower Salt Interval
4088-4148 Rec. 57.85' Salt w/ Clay fraction but appears
cleaner than upper salt

Box 9-1 to 9-23

RESPEC OMNI
Box FT. Box FT.
9.3 4140
9.6 4133
99 4125
9.12 4117
9.16 4109
9.19 4100
9.22 4093

Balance of boxes to Casa Grande Turbine Sta.

Core #10




4251-4309

Rec.

Box 10-1 to 10-23 [ower Salt interval

RESPEC
Box
10.1
10.5
10.8
10.10
10.13
10.18
10.19

FT.
4308
4206
4288
4283
4275
4287
4269

Box

58'

OMNI
FT.

Balance of boxes to Casa Grande Turbine Sta.

Core #11
4251-4308

RESPEC
Box

FT.

Rec.

Box
11.2
11.6
11.8

58'

OMNI
FT.
4699
4668
4661

Balance of boxes to Casa Grande Turbine Sta.

Core #12
6,122-6,182"

RESPEC
Box

FT.

Rec.

Box
12.1
12.2
12.3
12.4
12,6
126
12.7
12.8
12.9
12.10
12.11
12.12
12.13
12.14
12.156
12.16
12.17
12.18
12.19
12.20

80’

OMN}

FT.
6182
6179
6176
6173
6170
6167
6164
6161
6158
61565
6152
6149
6146
6143
6140
6137
6134
6131
6128
6125

Salt w/ Clay fraction

3273

Anhydrite interbeded with clay stone

Conglomerate with red clays




Core #13

6,122-6,182"
RESPEC
Box FT.
LENTZ SAMPLES
Z1A SAMPLES BOX #1

Rec. &60'

CMNI
Box
13.1
13.2
13.3
13.4
13.5
136
13.7
13.8
13.8
13.10

2720
4000
5300
6400
7600

FT.
6940
6937
6934
6931
6928
6925
6922
8919
6916
6913

4000
5300
6400
7600
7922

Conglomerate with red clays

72




240 210 180 150 120 90 60 30 0

’_‘ E } L i 0
Arizona G‘as Storage' #1-21
- /,H/ K refelev. |
0,‘ q/'g KB=1540" |
(/ 95" 20" Conductor Pipe érouted to|Surface
Bit1-17.6 ", STC XRC3, 14x14x14
stirvey elevations
KB=1540"
RIF= 50
GL=1528"
=
o
@
o
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g
=
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o
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E
100
95-130 ss clr wh frds pk rd &y[at stn shang gns sm shrnd gtz & sm feld
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200

WZ’I-G-rZﬁﬁify—e!y—prlﬁrd—sﬁ—wfs&cfr-qt- E md=mc#€*wh&pnk—flfk—ang~————~ﬁ—~
w/mod calcite wh&pnk, yel fes after agid drys
220-230-more ss aa predominant
—%Bé%ﬁ'ﬁmst!y—pr k=orng-sity-cly-sftmod-calcite;yel res-aa
250
260-280-ss clr&frosmstly gtz sbrnd ovgths fgrn tr caicite, ye| res aa ﬁ
' 3
=)
2
=3
8
280-300-glty cly prk|bn sft £
rtr-caleite-wfabnt-gtz Enselr
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300
300-310-no smp!
310--320-slty ss rsty sft w/ss gtz
—clrwhrfros f-crs-w/ ngths*am*ark
{  mod calcite
¢
320-350-Cly&sit TSty Sit Sm IS6 Giz \4]
grns mod calcite
350
)
350-400-cly&slt 4a wifr amt
__calcite{&.abnt-qﬁ 7SS gris--
L 400
1240 210 180 150 120 90 80 30 0




240

e
. 400-450-cly&slt rdbn sft w/ fwr flgating
qkz grns sb rnd-rnd tr e;rkmod amt calcite
h-8erthycaliche als¢smwh-igjmmr©
orth?
] 450
450-470- aa witr mica | =
B B
el g
=)
2
=
470-500-cly & slt aa §
£
o ——
500
500-510-no smpl
510:600- .dbn_sft gumbo w/ahnt
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—
J, Eﬁf==== L\\ 550
|
jL__
WOB-15-20K
RPM 65 )
SPM.54 |
3
Q:_%
600
210 180 150 120 90 60 30 0

400




600

6.0.0:4100=cly_ltbn

vf qt4 & ark berr
smpliwas itr col

te_lssrgms

-sft gumbag-abnt calci

Lg sit sz, @ 630-50 a1lt acid dry

r buff-yelbf, diff cly ty

240

210 180 150

650
Lo
&
Lo
By ;
=
g
1=
700
DEV 1/4| AT 708
\NP
-
700-80?-“ bn-lt gnbn (70-90 wh cly) ab
aft acid dry smpl dkr gnbn 70-90 smpi
wh cly all smpl bemg mstly bn aftr acid
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800
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800-880-gly Itbn-bn sft gumbo {

rslt sz abn

t calcite wh

800

850

measured depth

900

830

. 880-9004cly ltbn-bn| sft gumbo|tr slt sz abnt calcite wh
-e-—"""'—J
"-u...,____-"
| 900-1000-no_samples
[
|&
1[:
f__u
812!2006|
210 180 150 120 90 60 30 0

240

1000




1000

—_——

1000~J

060-cly Itwa-bn & gnﬂn undr acid sft gumbo

abnt calcit eff uncjr acid but

not vis

1060107 0-clylaa wifwr gtz gns.f sbind-rnd._clr

1070-1100-cly|ltn-bn wet
undr acid not vis tr slt sz

tzagms

sft gumbo abnt calcite

440

rrv

~H20-clyiaalooks-brwet-but g I‘ys%&aff—vr"‘:

1050

measured depth

1100

1150

after acid
--'—"‘"‘————
—-——1120=1150-cly-ltbn-bn-{wet)-olive whe aftiacid
tr mica & gtz sit abnt calcjte ind by eff but not vis
————gumbo—
{
11 .5021'20Dﬁtﬂaﬁbﬂfwe#r*oﬁve‘aﬁ*zaﬁidmca‘aﬁd sit
ir it sz mica gtz ark
t.._______"
‘.___._-_‘,.g.-‘l-
8/2/2008!
240 210 180 150 120 80 60 30
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t 1200
1200-1230-CI)J off wh aftr acid sft thmmy bent j
cale ind by effinot vis tr sft sz pricls ;
) DEV 1/4 AT|1274'
1250
1250-60 Cly off wh after lacid aa 4....,._,___:)
' ]
£
Q.
—WOB-30K— JHSMSfBﬁcly-!tbnﬂyﬁsﬁgumJny cale S
PP 500 - 2
RPM 65K 5
|1
. £
1300
L\'
g
l
1300-1400 cly itbn-bn sft gummy calc aa —
**nearly all of thesf bn cly smpls drid lopk like
the surface sedim =nt
1350
7
-___—-‘"P
- 1400

240 210 180 150 120 90 60 30 0




1400

]
“"—--4’
—1400=1500¢ly It bp=bn drk-when wet sftsticky
gumbo s last huridreds of f# gd calc eff under r
—acidbutinovis-calcite g‘
‘7 1450
_—
mill
&=
B,
[+
o
=
[
5
8
8/3/2006 ] g
—
1500
1500-70 SOS P\{
3
—
; — - ? 1550
Trip for balled uplbit, bit had 6 feet of gumbo stuck to it J
mWOBﬁ'ZJlKi_’leOL’LBIOOﬁslb,Lth%gngrt%feei on-gummy
RPM 65 smpl when dried calc, tr any and dol salt on L
PP 600 rim of dimple dish|when dry
SPM 5 Dev 1/2 at 1572
1D surfjhole 18:5U 8/3/06, Circ 30 min|[TOOH for([logs
Log Sonic and Registivity Log to 1100' couldn't get
—deeper:
1600
240 210 180 150 120 80 60 30 0




240

: 1600
e/a.6i20bs  RUN|36its. 13 3/8" 54.5¢ }<55 STC set at 1604 KB
cmtiw/ 440 sx San Juan lead and 440 sx G. Disp
w/ 240 bbl fresh Plug not pumped, Qirc cmt to surf,
but lpst psi, cmt fell downhole -
Run temp svy found toc at 97' gl, couldn't gek below 1360' 817106
Drlemtrom 1420 to TP plus~10™of new hole S '
New Bi;t #2 STC XR+ (Mill Tiooth) I
ST T TIE T At 1622 1650
-—-1620-1650 mstlylcmt minoriamt cly
It dk ng sft, tr anhy & otz gep rnd <
3 el o
] =
o
1650-1700 smpls|mstly cmt) fr amt &
anhy @ 1700 R E
- 1700
- e®
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- ‘I“'_ —
G - timaied 1750
-
Drilli-1760-1860" RR Bit 2 r__________
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f
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210 180 150 120 90 60 30




240 21

0 180

150

120

a0

Em 1800
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| 3
e“"“"%
B
1850
[8/2006 |
] S
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e
mwﬂ? 1900
i
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N? 2000
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I N 2000

Drill 1920-2020" 2000-2010 It bi-bf, sft flocky, sl calg —r
w/ tr anhy abnt starch in smpi

2010-2080 no|smpl r”"

Core#3 2020-208(
Luminim innar hhl 1 2050

81912006

Core is[100% Salil Mud is on outside

£
o
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o
o
g
7
2080-2090 gly vit bn, sft flocky, siicalc w/ tr anhy o
]
2090-2100 no smp!
- 2100
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sl slty wh hd gritty ]

__J> 2150

2(100-2170 ¢ly vit bn-bn, v calc w/mod anhy s
) —

Core#d 2180:2240' —-—r‘—-
[

alyminum inper bbl, 2 _ —
[

- 22000
210 180 150 120 90 60 30 0




2200
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g
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COFQ#A 218022407 E
aluminum inner bbil. 2 E
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Date: 10-17-06 | Report No: 89 | Reported by: Mike Haynes e
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth: 8782’ | Ft. Cut: Formation: Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Laying down drill pipe,
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 Run open hole logs.
1730 11.5hrs | Rigged down wireline unit.
1730 0100 7.5hrs | TIH,
01060 0600 5hrs Started TOOH laying down drill pipe.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wi No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size Vis 1
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg WL 1
GPM Hrs DW Type Gels 1
Press Hrs Drlg Out Qil 1
In Solid 16
Fig. PH 1
Bit Wt 4
Ser/no. 1
TOTAL
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Date: 10-16-06 | Reported by: Mike Haynes

| Report No: 88

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County; Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth: 8782’ | Ft. Cut: 56’ Formation: Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Drilling
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 0830 2.5hrs | Drilled from 8726 to 8743°,
0830 0900 Shrs | Service rig.
0900 1400 Shrs Drilled from 8743 to 8782’
1400 1630 2.5hrs | Pumped sweep and circulated hole clean.
1630 0130 9hrs TOOH and 1aid down BHA.,
0130 Rigged up Schiumberger wireline unit.
0600 4.5hrs | Ran open hole logs.
93 hrs on bit and motor,
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 { No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 12 Wit 9.3 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin & St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Dilg Size 77/8” | Vis 54 1 Bit 1,00
SPM 30 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed | WL 20 1 Mud Motor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type TD52P | Gels i X over 3.48
Press 1150 Hrs Drlg Out 8784 | Oil i Float sub 2,17
In 7922° | Solid 16 DC 486.24
Fig. 860° | PH 6.5 I Jars 29.17
Bit Wt | 10,000 4 DC 120.91
Ser/no. | BN4906 i X over 1.41
TOTAL 670.18
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Date: 10-15-06

| Report No: 87

| Reported by: Mike Haynes

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth: 8726

| Ft. Cut: 168

Formation:

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — Drilling

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 1230 6.5hrs | Drilled from 8558’ to 8617°,
1230 1300 Shrs Serviced rig.
1300 1860 Shrs Drilled from 8617 to 8651°.
1800 0600 I2hrs | Drilled from 8651° to 8726°,
85.5 hrs on bit and motor,
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. ! | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 12 Wt 9.3 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 778" | Vis 54 1 Bit £.00
SPM 30 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed | WL 20 Mud Motor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type TD52P | Gels 1 X over 348
Press 1150 His Drlg Out QOil 1 Float sub 2.17
In 7922° | Solid 16 DC 486.24
Fig. 304 | PH 76.5 1 Jars 29.17
Bit Wt { 10,000 4 DC 12091
Ser/no. | BN4906 1 X over 141
TOTAL 670.18
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Date; 10-14-06 | Report No: 86 Reported by: Mike Haynes
Operator: EI Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal ] State: Arizona
Depth: §558’ | Ft. Cut: 198’ Formation; Tops New Form;
Activity at Report Time — Drilling
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 1530 9.5hrs | Driiled from 8360’ to 8476’.
1530 1630 1hr Circulate hole.
1630 1700 Shrs Short tripped 5 stands (Pulling 185,0001bs.).
1700 1800 thr Drilled from 8476’ to 8481°,
1800 0600 12hrs | Drilled from 8481 to 8558°.
61.5 hrs on bit and motor,
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit# i2 Wt 93 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 78" | Vis 55 i Bit 1.00
SPM 30 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed | WL 12 Mud Motor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type TD52P | Gels 1 X over 3.48
Press 1150 Hrs Drlg Out Qil 1 Float sub 2.17
In 7922 | Solid 16 DC 486.24
Ftg. 696° | PH 7 1 Jars 29.17
Bit Wt | 10,000 4 DC 120.91
Ser/no. | BN4%06 i X over 1.41
TOTAL 670.18
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Date: 10-13-06 f Report No: 85 Reported by: Mike Haynes
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth: 8360° | Ft. Cut: 235’ Formation: Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Drilling
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 1330 7.5hrs | Drilled from 8125 to 8206°.
1330 1400 Shrs Worked on mud pumps.
1400 1800 4hrs Drilled from 8206’ to 8250°,
1800 0600 12hrs | Drilied from 8250’ to 8360°.
39 hrs on bit and motor.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | HrsTrip Bit # 12 Wt 9.1 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin & 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 778" | Vis 38 1 Bit 1.00
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed | WL 12 1 | MudMotor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type TD52P | Gels I X over 3.48
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Qil 1 Float sub 2.17
In 7922 | Solid 16 DC 486.24
Ftg. 438 | PH 7 1 Jars 29.17
Bit Wt | 10,000 4 bC 120.91
Ser/no, | BN4906 1 X over 1.41
TOTAL 670.18
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Date: 10-12-06

’ Report No: 84

| Reported by: Mike Haynes

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth: 8125 | Ft. Cut; 203 Formation: Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time —~ Drilling
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 0900 3hrs Waiting on parts,
0900 1100 2hrs Installed new draw works clutch.
1100 1330 2.5hrs | TIH.
1330 1800 4.5hrs | Drilled from 7922’ to 8008°,
1800 1900 lhr Worked on rig,
1900 0600 11hrs | Drilled from 8008’ to §125°,
15.5hrs on bit and motor.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 [ No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 12 Wt 9.2 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 77/8” | Vis 40 | Bit 1.00
SFM 50 Hrs Misc Mig Reed | WL 15 1 | MudMotor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type TD32P | Gels 1 X over 3.48
Press 1000 Hrs Drig Out Qil 1 Float sub 2,17
In 7922’ | Solid 16 DC 486.24
Fig. 203° | PH 7.5 1 Jars 29.17
Bit Wt | 10,000 4 DC 120.91
Ser/no. | BN4906 1 X over 141
TOTAL 670.18
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Date: 10-11-06

] Report No: 83

l Reported by: Mike Haynes

7

Operator; El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth: 7922’ | Ft. Cut Formation: Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — TOOH
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 1500 9hrs Wait on orders.
1500 1800 3hrs Picked up BHA,
1800 2030 4.5hrs | TIH to 5600°.
2030 0600 9.5hrs | Waited on parts to repair drum clutch.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wt 9.2 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | HrsDrlg Size Vis 35 1 Bit 1.00
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg WL 12 1 Mud Motor | 25.80
GPM Hrs DW Type Gels 1 X over 3.48
Press Hrs Drlg Out Qil 1 Float sub 2.17
In Solid 16 bC 486.24
Ftg PH 7.5 i Jars 29.17
Bit Wt 4 DC 120,91
Set/no. 1 X over 141
TOTAL 670.18




SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ONWELLS

1, Name of Operator /:/ %-’0 M et / éﬂ < /;W? !/‘W? v

2.0Lwetl [1  GASWELL[]  OTHER[d Specity S 7“;/*@7*93 r;}/ Al Tes

3. Well Name /4 &8 / ~Z. /

Location /980 " FANL oo Ll

Sec, Z / Twp. 7S Rge. ? f County % a4 / , Arizona

4. Federal, Slate, or Indian Lease Number, or lessor's nams if fee lease ‘ﬁ [ d f&/ /.4‘;/ /”’ / %J‘ =

5. Fleld or Pool Name /\//g

6. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Repert, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT--OFF WEEKLY PROGRESS
FRACTURE TREAT DIRECTIONAL DRILL FRACTURE TREATMENT REPAIRING WELL
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE PERFORATE CASING SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ALTER CASING
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS ABANDONMENT
{CTHER}

{OTHER)

{NOTE: Repari resuits of multiple completion on Well Completion
of Recompletion Report and Log, Form 4}

1. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED QPERATIONS (Clearly state all perlinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date
of starting any proposed worke If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface localions and measured and true vertical depths for alt markers and
zones pertinent to this work,

C/}&de 7;‘)7'6’1/ ydf‘/f’/‘zf 7 %ﬁéﬁx

8. | hereby certify that the foregoing/f g and correct.
Signed ﬂm/ / Title A//; ‘ti/@ & Date /& '"'// /~/&ﬁé
STATE OF ARIZONA
OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
. Sundry Notice and Reports On Wells
Permit No. 75 S Form No. 25 File One Copy

5/986
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Date; 10-10-06 | Report No: 82 | Reported by: Mike Haynes !
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal f State; Arizona
Depth: 7922 | Ft. Cut Formation: Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — TOOH
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 1030 TOOH, Laid down 9 drilf collars, jars, motor, and bit.
1030 1330 Waited on Schlumberger wireline.
1330 Rigged up Schlumberger wireline unit.
0530 Ran open hole logs and CBL.,
0530 0600 Rigged down wirgline unit,
Total
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hirs Trip Bit# 11 Wt 9.2 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin&St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 77/8” | Vis 35 i Bit 1.00
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mig Reed | WL 12 ; Mud Motor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Milltooth | Geis I X over 3.48
Press 1000 Hrs Drig Out Qil 1 Float sub 2.17
In 6182° | Solid 16 DC 486.24
Ftg 1740 | PH 7.5 i Jars 29.17
Bit Wt | 10,000 4 DC 120.91
Ser/no. | ¥50498 1 X over I.41
TOTAL 670.18
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Date: 10-09-06 | Report No: 81 | Reported by: Mike Haynes
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth: 79227 [ Ft, Cut 322° Formation: Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — TOOH
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 0600 i2hrs | Drilled from 7595’ to 7796°.
0600 0130 7.5hrs | Drilled from 7796 to 7922,
0130 0330 2hrs Pumped sweep and circulated hole clean.
0330 0600 2,5hrs | TOOH.
91 hrs on bit,
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 11 Wt No | Description | Length | Depth Deyv,
Lin& 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | HrsDrlg Size 77/8 | Vis ; Bit 1.00
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed | WL 1 Mud Motor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Milltooth | Gels 1 X over 3.48
Press 1000 Hrs Drig Qut Qil 1 Float sub 2.17
In 6182" | Solid 16 DC 486.24
Fig 1740’ | PH ] 1 Jars 29.17
BitwWt | 10,000 4 DC 120.91
Ser/no, | 150498 1 X over 1.41
TOTAL 670.18
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Date: 10-08-06 [ Report No: 80 | Reported by: Mike Haynes T

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor; United Drilling

RigNo: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth; 7595°

| Ft. Cut 155’

Formation:

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — Drilling

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 0930 3.5hrs | Drilled from 7440’ to 7555°.
0930 1100 1.5hrs ] Rotary clutch went out. Circulate and worked pipe. Worked on rotary,
1100 1300 2hrs Pulled into 9 5/8” casing.
1300 0100 12hrs | Waited on parts to repair rotary. Slipped driil line.
06100 0200 1hr Repaired rotary.
0200 0330 1.5hrs | TIH and broke circuiation.
0330 0600 2,5hrs | Drilled from 7555’ to 7595,
71 1/2 hrs on bit.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 { His Trip Bit # 3] Wi 9 No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin & St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 77/8° | Vis 31 1 Bit 1.00
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed | WL 15 1 Mud Motor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Milltooth | Gels 1 X over 348
Press 1000 His Drlg Out Oil 1 Float sub 2.17
In 6182° | Solid 16 DC 486.24
Fig 1413 | PH 9 1 Jars 29.17
Bit Wt | 10,000 4 DC 120.91
Ser/fno. | J50498 1 X over 1.41
TOTAL 670,18
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Date: 10-07-06 | Report No: 79 | Reported by: Mike Haynes ;
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County; Pinal State: Arizona
Depth: 7440° | Ft. Cut 410° Formation: Tops New Forni:
Activity at Report Time — Drilling
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 1800 12hrs | Drilled from 7030 to 7300°.
1800 0600 12hrs | Drilled from 7300° to 7440°,
65 1/2 brs on bit.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 11 Wt 9 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev,
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 77/8" | Vis 3t ! Bit 1.00
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed | WL 15 1 Mud Motor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Millicoth | Gels 1 X over 3.48
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Qil 1 Float sub 2,17
In 6910° { Solid : 16 DC 486.24
Fig 1258° | PH 9 1 Jars 29.17
Bit Wt | 10,000 4 DC 120.91
Ser/no. | J50498 1 X over 141
TOTAL 670.18
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Date: 10-06-06

| Report No: 78

| Reported by: Mike Haynes

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal State; Arizona
Depth: 7030° ] Ft. Cut 88’ Formation: Tops New Form;
Activity at Report Time — Drilling
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 0730 1.5hrs | Finished in the hole with core barrel,
0730 0830 1hr Cored from 6910 to 6942°, Core barrel jammed,
0830 1430 6hrs TOOH,
1430 1800 3.5hrs | Laid down core barrels (31" of core recovered).
1800 1930 1.5hrs | Loaded coring {ools. Released DOWDCO.,
1930 2430 Shrs TIH.
2430 0600 5.5hrs | Broke circulation. Drilled from 6942* to 7030°.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.! | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # i1 Wt 8.7 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dey,
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 778 | Vis 29 1 Bit 1.00
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed | WL 20 1 Mud Motor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Militooth | Gels 1 X over 3.48
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Qil 1 Float sub 2.17
In 6910’ | Solid 16 DC 486.24
Fig 855 | PH 9 1 Jars 29.17
Bit Wt | 10,000 4 DC 120,91
Ser/no. | J50498 1 X over 141
TOTAL 670.18
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Date: 10-05-06 | Report No; 77 | Reported by: Mike Haynes -
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal [ State: Arizona
Depth; 6910’ | Ft. Cut 150° Formation; Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — TTIH with core barrel
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 1200 6hrs Drilled from 6752’ to 6910°.
1200 1400 2hrs Pumped sweep and circulated out,
1400 2030 6.5hrs | TOOH.
2030 2330 3hrs Laid down bit and motor. Picked up core barrel,
2330 0600 6.5hrs | TIH with core barrel.
Coring Assembly
I-bit L.00?
2-barrels 64.37°
1-jars 7.82°
1-x-over 1.62°
194d.c. 576,92
1-x-gver 141"
Total 653,14
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 11 Wt 8.7 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dey,
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 77/8” | Vis 28 1 Bit 1.00
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed | WL 14 1 | MudMotor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Milliooth | Gels i X over 3.48
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Qil 1 Float sub 2,17
In 6910° | Solid 16 DC 486.24
Fig 728° PH 9 i Jars 29,17
Bit Wt | 10,000 4 DC 120.91
Ser/no. | J50498 1 X over 141

TOTAL 670,18
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Date: 10-04-06

| Report No: 76

| Reported by: Mike Haynes

/'//

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth: 6752°

| Ft. Cut 277’

Formation:

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — TIH

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 0830 2.5hrs | TIH with bit drill collars and jars.
0830 1100 2.5hrs | Jet sand from shaker pits,
1100 1430 3.5hrs | Finish tripping in the hole.
1430 1630 2hrs Broke circulation and leveled the rig,
1630 1800 1.5hrs | Drilled from 6475 to 6531°.
1800 0600 12hrs | Drilled from 6531° to 6752°,
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 11 Wt 8.7 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Deyv,
Lin & 8t, | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 77/8” | Vis 28 | Bit 1.00
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed | WL 14 1 Mud Motor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Milltooth | Gels 1 X over 3.48
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Qit 1 Float sub 2.17
In 6122’ | Solid 16 DC 486.24
Ftg 570" | PH 9 1 Jars 29.17
Bit Wt | 10,000 4 DC 120.91
Ser/no. | J50498 | X over 141
TOTAL 670.18
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Date: 10-03-06

| Report No: 75

| Reported by: Mike Haynes

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor; United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth; 6475

| Ft. Cut 240°

Formation:

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — TIH

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 1030 4.5hrs | Drilled from 6235 to 6311°.
1030 1100 Shrs | Serviced rig and replaced guards on hydromatic break.
100 1800 7hrs Drilled from 6311* to 6440°.
1800 1930 1.5hrs | Drilled from 6440’ to 6475, Mud logger noticed an increase in gas at retums.
1930 2030 1hr Circulated bottoms up.
2030 0200 5.5hrs | TOOH.
0200 0330 1.5lrs | Removed flow line and nippled down bell nipple.
0330 0530 2hrs Nippled up and function tested BOP’s. Nippled up bell nipple and installed flow line,
0530 0600 Shrs | TIH.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 { No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 11 Wit 8.5 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin & St, | 6X16 | 6X16 | HrsDrlg Size 778" | Vis 32 1 Bit 1.00
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL 9 1 Mud Motor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Milltooth | Gels i X over 3.48
Press 1000 Hrs Drig Out Qil 1 Float sub 2,17
In 6122’ | Solid 16 DC 486.24
Fig 293 | PH 8 1 Jars 29.17
Bit Wt | 10,000 4 DC 120.91
Ser/no. | 350498 1 X over 141
TOTAL 670.18




Date: 10-

02-06

| Report No: 74

| Reported by: Mike Haynes

732

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig Ne: 22

County; Pinal

|

State; Arizona

Depth: 6235°

| Ft. Cut: 53’ Formation:

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — Drilling

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 0800 2hrs Finished TIH with coring tools.
0800 1130 3.5hrs | Tagged @ 6122°. Cored to 6182,
1130 1930 8hrs TOOH. Laid down cores.
1930 2030 thr Stood back core barrel, Made up new 7 7/8” bit and motor,
2030 0200 5.5hrs | TIH. Tagged @ 6122°.
0200 0300 1hr Reamed to 6182°,
0300 0600 3hrs Drilled from 6182’ to 6235°,
Coring Assembly
1-bit 1.00°
2-barrels 64.37°
1-jars 7.82°
1-x-over 1.62°
19d.c. 576.92°
I-x-over 141’
Total  653.14°
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 11 Wt 8.5 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 { Hrs Drig Size 77/8° | Vis 32 1 Bit 1.00
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mig Reed | WL 9 1 Mud Motor | 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Milltooth | Gels 1 X over 348
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Oil 1 Float sub 2.17
In 6122° | Solid 16 DC 486.24
Fig 53’ PH 8 1 Jars 29.17
Bit Wt | 10,000 4 DC 12091
Ser/no. | J50498 1 X over 1.41
TOTAL 670.18




il

PB Energy
Storage

== Services, Inc.

T C ) TR ICWCE

Date: 10-01-06

I Report No: 73

| Reported by: Mike Haynes

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth: 6122°

| Ft. Cut: 232°

Formation:

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — TIH with coring tools

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 1600 10hrs | Drilled from 5890’ to 6122,
1600 1900 3hrs Pumped sweep and circulated hole clean.
1900 2230 3.5hrs | TOOH.
2230 2430 2hrs Picked up and made up coring tools.
2430 0400 3.5hrs | TIH.
0400 0600 2hr Worked on hydromatic break,
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 10 Wit 8.5 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev,
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 77/8 | Vis 32 1 Bit 1.00
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mig HTC WL 9 1 Mud Motor { 25.80
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Millteoth | Gels 1 X over 3.48
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out 6122° Oil 1 Float sub 217
In 5650° Solid 16 DC 486.24
Fig 472 PH 8 1 Jarg 29.17
Bit Wt | 8,000 4 DC 120.91
Ser/no. | 5092166 1 X over 141
TOTAL 670,18




=== PB Energy
Storage
erilg_gs, Inc,

e e

gl

=75
et

935

Date: 9-30-06

] Report No: 72

| Reported by: Mike Haynes

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

7

Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth: 589¢° ] Ft. Cut: 240° Formation; Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Drilling 7 7/8” hole
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 0700 1hr Drilled cement and DV tool,
0700 1200 Shrs Drilled wiper plug, float collar, cement, and float shoe.
1200 1800 6hrs Drilled 7 7/8” hole from 5650” to 5737°.
1800 0600 12hrs | Drilled 7 7/8 hole from 5737 to 5890,
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 10 Wt 85 | No | Description [ Length | Depth Dev,
Lin& 8t, | 6X16 | 6X16 | HrsDrlg Size 7 7/8” Vis 32 1 Bit
SPM 50 His Misc Mfg HTC WL 9 1 Mud Motor
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Milltooth | Gels 1 X over
Press 1000 Hrs Drig Out Oil 1 Float sub
In 5650° Solid 1 18 DC
Tig 240 PH 8 I Jars
Bit Wt | 5,000 | 2DC
Ser/mo. | 5092166 18 X over
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Date: 9-29-06 | Report No: 71 | Reported by: Mike Haynes

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor; United Drilling Rig No; 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth: 5650° | Ft. Cut: Formation: Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — Drilling plug

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 0900 3hrs Waited on truck to pull mud from reserve pit.
0900 1400 Shrs Jet out mud pits,
1400 1800 4hrs Conditioning mud.
1800 THH with 7 7/8” bit, mud motor, DC’s. String was plugged,
2230 4.5hrs | TOOH and unplugged bit.
2230 0300 4.5hrs | TIH. Tagged plug @ 5400°.
0300 0500 2hrs Circulate and condition mud.
0500 0600 lhr Drill cement and plug,
1600-1800
Rigged up Halliburton cementing equipment.
Pumped 150sks (33bbis) into 9 5/8” x 13 3/8” annulus. Sbbis returned to surface,
Rigged down cementing equipment.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 10 Wt No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 78 | Vis i
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg HTC WL 1
GPM His DW Type Mitltooth | Gels 1
Press Hrs Drlg Out Qil 1
In 5391 Solid |
Ftg PH 1
Bit Wt 1
Ser/no. | D20958 18
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Date: 9-28-06 | Report No: 70 | Reported by: Mike Haynes e
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth: 5650° | Ft. Cut: Formation: Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — WOC

Time Log Elapsed

From To Time

Details of Operation

0600 0900 3hrs

wOC

0900

Pumped 40bbls pre flush, 1255sks (518bbls) lead cement, 200sks (55bbls) tail cement.

Displaced with 416bbls freshwater.

Bumped plug to 1230psi. Pressured up to 2402psi to close DV tool. Tool holding.

1230 3.5hrs

Did not get cement returns to surface.

1230 1330 ihe

Rigged down Halliburton,

1330 2460 10.5hrs

WOC. (Cleaning pits, Nippled down bell nipple, cut off 9 5/8” casing, Nippled up bell nipple.)

2400

Rigged up Southwest Exploration Services wireling unit.

Ran temperature log and found top of cement @ 402°.

0130 1.5hrs

Rigged down wireline unit,

0130 0600 5.5hrs

WOC., (Picked up 4 %" driil collars and stood in the derrick.)

Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pamp No.1 | No.2 | Hirs Trip Bit # 9 Wi 10.8 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin & 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12%“ | Vis |35 i 12 ¥ Bit 1.0
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Dowdco | WL | 22 1 motor 26.58
GPM 402 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels | 3-4 1 Float sub 3.90
Press 1200 Hrs Drlg Out Qil 1 UBHO SUB | 242
In - 5013 Solid | 19.25 [ 1 | NMDC 30.34
Fig 44 PH 8.5 1 | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 5-8K i X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no. | D20958 18 | 6" DC’s 520.02
Drill jar 32.30
2 6” DC’s 57.78




El Paso Natural Gas

Arizona Gas Storage
#1 - 21

APl Well No.:

Sec21/Twp 07 S/Rng 08 E

9/2712006
Pinal

County

9 6/8" 2 Stage Int.

Customer Representative:
Mike Haynes / Greg Gettman
Halliburton Operator:
Steve Stromberg
Ticket No.:

4629103




Job Type 9 5/8" 2 Stage Int.
WVeasured

Casing Size Weight Grade Depth  Total Casing
Surface 13 3/8 54.5 J-55 1,604
Intermediate 9 5/8 40 J-55 5,648
Production 9 5/8 36 J-55 808
Tubing
Drill Pipe
Open Hole 12 1[4
Spacer .5(‘} Bbis KCI wi L
Cement 1 50/50/1G/Poz 120 Sacks
Additives 1% Gel, 5# Gilsonite, 1/4# Flocele, .6% Halad 9, 15% Salt (BWOW)

Weight (Ib/gal) 13.10 Yield (cuft/sk) 1.55 Water (gal/sk) 6.51
Cement 2 HLC 1,255 Sacks
Additives 6% Gel, 16% Salt, 10# Gilsonite, 1/4if Flocele

Weight (Ib/gal) 12,30 Yield (cuft/sk) 2.32 Water (gal/sk) 11.56
Cement 3 50/1501GIPoz 200 Sacks
Additives 1% Gel, 5# Gilsonite, 1/4# Flocele, .6% Halad 9, 16% Salt (BWOW)

Weight (Ib/gal) 13.10 Yield (cuft/sk) 1.65 Water {gal/sk) 6.51

Displacement H20 8.33 Ib/gal

Provider
Guide Shoe
Float Shoe
Float Collar
DV Tool

HES

ea. Centralizers 95/8x121/4 25 ea,

1 ea. Plug Type 9 5/8 1 ea.

(| ea. Packer ft.
5432 ft, Retainer ft.




TICKET DATE

B _ . ‘P.a B R %
a"& &QWH&@ %j@? EQE}JEEEA@;EAR‘{ 4629103 September 27, 2006
NORTH AMERICA ROCKY MOUNTAIN Arizona Pinal
MEUIDFENFLE HES GHELOYEE takis PELCERPARTRAENT
217406 Steve Stromberg ZONAL I1SOLATION
LCTATION CONTENY. CUSTORER RERJFHONE
FARMINGTON, N E| Paso Ne}tural Gas Mike Haynes / Greg Gettman
TIZKET EFDUWT TR ivFE REGETE
02 GAS
WELL ECCATICH DEPARTIENT SA0 BONT NUBARER OB TYFC
Eloy, Arizona ZONAL ISOLATION 10003 9 518" 2 Stage Int.
TEASE HATIE e Ha sECT TP ! RIS
Arizona Gas Storage | #1 - 21 Sec 21 /Twp 07 5/ Rng 0B &
~Steve Stromberg 217406 Harry Shoats 329013 24.0 Steve Huber 223473 24.0 David Core 335668 24.0
Tate Hili 342673 24,0 John Ace 308040 24.0
10829446 1050 10823383 1050 10195436/ 10025081 1050 107245797 10025039 1050
10759930 1050 16192900/ 10025061 1050
Form. Name e TVD@ R XS ITEREER o D L R e T
Form. Thickness “Frorm Called Out On Location | Job Staited Job Completad
Packer Type _ Set At Ddte 9]25!06 9!26!06 9127106 9!27!06
Bottom Hole Temp. Pressure Sy D R L L T :
Retainer Depih Total Depth T rmek 17 00 ! 13 30 ] 01:42 | 13 37
R L “Well Data o TR :
—dools and Accessories TR Casmg NewlUsed Weight Size | Grade | From To Iotal Casmq
Type a 1d Size Qly Make Surface New 54,5 J-55 1,604
Float Collar 9 5/8 1 Super Seal li nfermediate New 46.0 95/8; J-55 | 808.22} 5648
Ficat Shoe 9 5/8 1 Super Seal li Intermediate Now 36.0 | 95/8] J-58 0 808
Cenlralizers Lrill Pipe
Flug 8 5/8 1 2 Stage Set Tlbing
Limit Clamp D c- Opent Hole 12114 5,650 S
Stage Tool 9 5/8 1 Type P Perforations Holes
fnsert Float Perforations
Glide Shoe Perforations
WeidA 958 4 Howco Hours On Location - - “Operating Hours - CDISCHRHOR OF Job s
I | 1 21 5 1] C Date lHours Date Holrs
fiid Tvpe BalfMud  Denaily, 11 l b/Ga! 92606 9.50 9126/086 1.50 PLEASE SEE JOB LOG
Disp. Fluid H20 Density 8,33  1b/Gal _a7ios 14.00 9127106 6.20
Prop. Tvpe Size Lb
Prop. Type Size Lo B
Acid Type Gal, % -
Acid Type Gal, Yo
Surfactant Gal, fry
NE Agent Gal, In
Fluid Loss Gali.b In
Gelling Agent Gal/L.b In ]
GalfLb Total .0 23.50 Total 7.70
Breaker GaliLb
Blocking Agent Galflb ] +Hydraulic Horsepower
Perfpac Balis Qty. Ordered Avail.
Other “Average Rates in BPM
KCL subslitute Treatling Disp. Overall
Other _ srComent Lafi in Pipa
Other Feel 41.50 Reason Customer Request
_ T Cemani Dat LI
Stage | Sacks Cemeant Bulk/5ks Addililves WiRg. Yield ! bs/GGa! Bhls
1 120 50/50/G/Poz BULK 1% Gel, §# Gilsonite, 1/4# Flocele, .6% Halad 9, 15% Sait {BWOW) 6.51 1.55 13.1 33
2 1255 HLC BULK 6% Gel, 15% Salt, 10# Gilsonite, 1/4# Fiocele 11.56 2.32 12.3 518
2 200 50/50/G/Poz BULK 1% Gel, 5% Gilsonite, 1/4% Flocele, .6% Halad 9, 15% Sait (BWOW) 6.51 1.55 13.1 55
| BULK
; BULK
!Circulating RIG UG Displacement HES PUMP “Fliid Ahead G?I B | _ 50 Type: KCTwi LGC-387 20 H20
‘Breakdown _NO _Maximum Caic.Relurn/Pit Bb! Calc.Disp Bbl 427 .
Lost Returns __NO_ " Actual TOC SURFACE Calc Return/Pit Sks Actual Disp. ARy T
“Cmt Rtrn#Bhl Calc. Tot SURFACE Cmint. Slurry bbls 607
Cmt Rirn#Sks Frac. Gradient N/A Total Vclume hbls 1526
Averaqe Rate Shut Jn PS|

IHE;, !NI’OFQEV}ATION S‘IATFD HF’RFIN I‘% LORRLCT
CUSTOMER REPRESENTATIVE




REGICH

NORTH AMERICA LAND

FARLE D ERPL

217406

LOCATION

FARMINGTON, NM

TICKET ALSOUHT

Bhakvanw

TCHET o

[ S—
CERFER JoBLOG 4629103
. RAf COUHTRY BOA FSTATE
ROCKY MOUNTAIN Arizona

HE S FAMPLOYEE MM
Sieve Stromberg
CONPLY
El Paso Matural Gas
VVELL TYE

02 GAS

TICKEY DATE

HLTI2006
COWITY
Pinal

PEL DERARTLIEN Y

ZONAL [SOLATION

CUSTCLER REP £ FHONE

Vike Havnes ! Greg Geltman

AP #

WELL EGTATION T BEPARTRIENT JOB PURFOSE CODE Descriplion
Eloy, Arizona ZONAL ISQLATION 10003 9 5/8" 2 Stage Int.
LEASE SVWELL B et Ho SEC/ TP f RS
Arizona Gas Siorage #1-21 Sec 21/ Twp 07 S/ Rag 08 B
P oBhart. o Thine 5o Rate - sVolume:Pmpsi - Press (P81 o0 dol Deseription / Reinarks .
NG ) S mmiteal 1 6 g sy BE
25-Sep : 16:30 - i A : “Arrive on location v/ DV, Tool and Plug Set.
: : "Rig making wiper trip, Wailing... .
CORGI2006 ¢ 0840 ¢ :Stanl Gasing in the hole,
: AR5 ‘Make up DV, Tool in casing string,
S 1100 ¢ ‘Chrculale casing at J4. # 6.
©14:30 "HES orew on Location.
©14:35 ¢ ‘:Wailing on rig crew to finish running casing.
T 16:30 _-:Hold Safety meeling, rig up HES as far as possible.
17:15 “Wait on rig crew Lo finish 1unning pipe.
AR ‘Casing Landed. Swap out well head equipment, Set Slips.
F 225 ‘;Altempt to cireulate v/ rig pump.
C o310 310 310 BBIs away. No Circulation,
: F2316 0 & 98 50 ;Aitempt to break circUlation v HES pump. Unsuccessiul.
942712006~ 0050 20 210 fCircu!aiEon established w/ rig pump. Tumn over to HES.
: FOmS5 6 190 ‘Circulate w/ HES pump.
- 01:26 160 ::Shuidnwn Cireufation. Prepare for first stage.
C 0143 ; Pressure test Pump/ Lines lo 2000 psi. Test Good,
S 0146 0 2 22.09 Stert preflush down casing.
F01:54 5 56 40 © 234.5 ‘Slait cement down casing @ 13.1#/ gal.
L 02:04 ° 33 : _:Shui down cement, release Boltom Shul O Plug.
FO21t 0 hoe 65 ‘Start H20 Displacement dovin casing,
0217 0 Lo 20 - 260.3 Switch to Well fluid. (11.1#/Cal).
S 03:59 ¢ 3 420 191 ‘Slow Rate, Prepare (o bump Plug.
S 04:01 426, 580 fPIug humped @ 188 psi, Prossure up lo 580 PSI.
P 0402 ‘ Walt t min, test Floats. Test Gaod.
04:04 fDrop Cpening Plug, Waiting.... Wash up Pump to the #it.
T04:61 0 2 ~4  *Pressure up casing fo Open DV Tool.
04:52 G 0.2 210 fToo! opened @ 583 psi, Circulate 40 Bbls v/ HES pump.
S 05:00 ¢ 40 “Shut down. Turn Well over fo the rig for 4 Hrs,
05:10 ‘Prepare for second stage,
: Returned 5 Bbls cement o surface from first stage,
ERLEEE ‘Hold PJSM v Co. Reps., Rig Crew.
R FO T BN -1.9 Start Prefiush down casing.
10:51 ° 5.5 4{ 48.9 Stait Lead cement down casing @ 12.3% gal.
CA2:02 5 45 ¢ 5163 68.8 ‘Switoh to tail cement & 13.1#/ gal.
12:14 © B -35.8 Shut down cement, refease lap elosing plug,
R F R F 244 stan displacement down casing.
12:33 7 ;1258 58.06 Displacement reached cement, continue v/ Displacement.
F13:31 ¢ 416 2402 ?I’-’Iug Bumped @ 1230 psi, Pressure up (o 2402 psi,
T332 Test Tool. Tool closed.

f 1345

_ "Hold Safely meating, rig dovin HES,
15:00

"Hold Post Joh Safety meeting.




TICKET & TICKET DATE
JOB LOG 4629103 9/27/2006
REGION KA | COUNTRY BOA 1 STATE COUNTY
NORTH AMERICA LAND ROCKY MOUNTAIN Arizona Final
HBU D /EMPL & HES ERPLOYEE NARE PSI DEPARTMENT
217406 Steve Stromberg ZONAL ISOLATION
LOCATION COMPANY CUSTOMER REP { PHGNE
FARMINGTON, NM El Paso Natural Gas Mike Haynes [ Greg Geftman
TICKET AKOUNT YELL TYRPE APLUV 8
32 GAS
VWELL LOCATION DEPARTRIENT JOB PURPQSE CODE DESCfipliDﬂ
Eloy, Arizona ZONAL ISOLATION 10003 9 5/8" 2 Stage Int.
TEASETWELL 7 Vel No. SEG T THP T REG
Arizona Gas Storage #1 - 21 Sec 21 ITWD 07 8/ Rng 08 E

< Chart = Time Rate Volume[Pmps[ _ Press, {PS!) :
oMo [ e e eeies [T o | Tee . Uosg i T Sl o i BAtR,
No Cement circulated to surface off of second siage.

35 Bbis+/- of preflush to surface on second stage.

Final ift pressure would indicate that cement Is within 100"
of surface,

5 Bbls cement circulated off of first stage.,

dob_ Descriptlon I Remarks

Thanks for calling HALLIBURTON 1
Steve, Harry, Tate, David, John, and Steve H.
WE REALLY APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS 11
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Cementing Calculations for Multistage Longstrings Customer El Paso Natural Gas

NOTE: Only Green Highlighted Number Need Be Inputed Well Name Arizona Gas Storage

Well Information Lease #1-21
County Pinal

Hole Size S0# 4820103
TD Cementer Steve Stromberg
Casing Length
Casing Size galilin.ft lin.ft/gal bbleflin.ft  Hnftbbl cuftiiinit linfticuft
Casing Weight Annulus
1st StageDV Tool Caslng
2nd Stage DV Tool
Float Collar B MixH20  395.02 bbis
Shoe Joint Plg Disp. 839.00 byis
Wellbore Fluid Totat H2O  1234.02 bbls
Displacement Fluid
Spacer Fluid

Amoun

First Stage Lead BBLS Slurry 5,52

Density Ht.of Cmt 72.82

Yield BBLSWater .. 3.10 ~'TOC . 5213.06 1t

Water Requirements BBLS Spacer 60.00 ft

Excess eslTLE 0 -13.99

First Stage Tail BBLS Slurry 27.61 Plug Displacement | 426,0 hbls
Density “SHSIy - 0.00

Yield BBLS Water . 15,50 Htof Cmt 364.12

Water Requirements BBLS Spacer 0.00 Toc - ~5285.88 1

E£xcess ft

Second Stage Lead BBLS Slurry  518.56

Density Ibslgat Ht.of Cmt 6839.75

Yield cuftisk BBLSWater 34542 Toc - . 0.00 #

Water Requirements galisk BBLS Spacer 60.00 ft

Excess bibls PITLE 1763.03

Second Stage Tail #sks BBLS Slurry 55.21 Plug Displacement 413.0 bbis
Density Ibsfgal Ht.of Cmt 728.23

Yield cuft/sk BBELS Water 31.00 - roc 4703.77 #

Water Requirements gatisk ft

Excess

Third Stage Lead BBLS Sturry - 0.00

Density Ht.of Cmt 6.00

Yield BBLS Water 0.00 ‘ToOC ~0.00

Water Requirements BBLS Spacer 0.00 ft

Excess PSITLR 0.00

Third Stage Tail BBLS Sturry 0.00 Plug Displacement 0 hivls
Density Ht.of Cmt 0.00

Yield BBLS Water 0.00 TOC 0.00 1

Water Requirements BBLS Spacer 0.00 ft

Excess




Height of Wellbore Fluid in Annulus

4421.66 ft
0.00 #t
0.00 #t

1st Stage
2nd Stags
3rd Stage

Amount of Spacer in Annulus

791.40 #
0.00
0.00 #t

1st Stage
2nd Stage
3rd Stage

TOC 2nd Stg.

TOC Lead

TOG Tall

Stg. Tool @
TOC 1st Stg
TOC Lead

TOG Tall

Fit. Collar @

Caslng @

0.00

£.00

4704

5432,0
54320
52131

5285.9

6608

£648

335.16 pbls
0.00 bwis
0.00 bbis

59.99 bhis
0.00 bbls
0.00 bbis

Hydrostatic Values, psi

0 fi.

X

TVD = 5850

lead
49,59

4373.11

0.00
spacer
423.72

0.00

0.00

Casling size
Hole size

tail

217.30
495.89

0.00
wh fluid
2528.27

0.00

0.00

9625
12.25
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Date: 9-27-06 | Report No: 69 | Reported by: Mike Haynes
Operator; El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County; Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth: 5650° | Ft. Cut: Formation: Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time - WOC

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 0800 2hrs Laid down drill coliars.
0800 0900 Thr Rigged up 9 5/8” casing tools,
0900 Ran 129 joints 9 5/8” (109 joints 40#, J-55, LTC & 20 joints 36#, J-55, STC) with float shoe, float

collar, and DV tool,

1930 10.5hrs

Rigged down lay down machine and casing tools.

1930 2030 Thr

Set 9 5/8” x 13 5/8” wellhead slips.

2030 | 2130 lhr

Rigged up Halliburton cementing equipment and tested lines to 2,000psi,

2130 2400 2.5hrs

Filled casing and circulated.

2400

Pumped 40bbls pre flush, 120sks (33bbls) cement. Displaced with 20bbls freshwater, 406bbls mud.

Bumped plug to 550psi. Floats were holding. Dropped DV opening tool, Waited 30 minutes,

0400 4hrs

Tool opened at 560psi. Circulated 40bbls of mud with Halliburton pump,

0400 (600 2hrs

Circulated with rig pump.

9 5/8" casing set @ 5640.08",

DV @ 5418.41°.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 9 Wt 10.8 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12%“ |Vis |35 1 12 % Bit 1.0
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Dowdeco | WL | 22 1 motor 26.58
GPM 402 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels | 3-4 i Float sub 3.90
Press 1200 Hrs Drlg Out Qil 1 |{UBHOSUB | 242
In . | 5013 Solid | 1925 | 1 | NMDC 30,34
Fig 44 PH 8.5 i [ Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 5-8K [ X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no. | D20958 18 | 6”DC’s 520.02
1 Drill jar 3230
2 | 6"DC’s 57.78
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Date: 9-26-06 | Report No: 68 | Reported by: Mike Haynes
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No; 22 County: Pinal ! State: Arizona
Depth: 5650° | Ft. Cut: Formation: Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Rigging up lay down machine,
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 Running open hole logs,
1430 8.5hrs | Rigged down wireline unit.
1430 1800 3.5hrs | TIH with 12 ¥ bit.
1800 2200 4hrs Finish TIH.
22060 2300 thr Washed down from 5600°-5650°.
2300 0130 2.5hrs | Pumped sweep and circulated hole clean,
0130 0530 4hrs TOOH
0530 0600 Shrs Rigging up Bull Roger’s fay down machine.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit# 9 Wt 10.8 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin & St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12%“ | Vis |35 1 12 Y4 Bit 1.0
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Dowdco | WL | 22 1 motor 26.58
GPM 402 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels | 3-4 1 | Float sub 3.90
Press 1200 Hrs Drlg Out Oil I UBHO SUB | 242
In 5013 Solid | 1925 [ 1 | NMDC - | 30.34
Fig 44 PH 8.5 1 | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 5-8K i X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no. | D20958 18 | 6" DC’s 520.02
1 Drill jar 32.30
2 6” DC’s 57.78
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Date: 9-25-06 | Report No: 67 | Reported by: Mike Haynes

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth: 5650° | Ft. Cut: 117’ Formation: Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — Logging

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 0730 1.5hrs | Circulate hole clean.
0730 1330 6hrs Tripped out of the hole, Tight @ 5650°- 4693° & 2486°- 2454°,
1330 1530 2hrs Laid down directional tools, motor and bit.
1530 1730 2hrs Removed flow line and beil nipple, Nippled up BOP.
1730 Pressured up to 550psi. Leaked down to 350psi. Did not find any surface leaks,
Pressured up to 550psi. Leaked down to 350psi in 3 minutes, Pressure was still gradually dropping.
1830 lhr Bled pressure off.
1830 2030 2hrs Nippled down BOP. Nippled up bell nipple. Installed flowline.
2030 0130 Shrs Waited on Schlumberger Wireline.
0130 Rigged up Schlumberger wireline unit.
0600 4.5hrs | Running open hole logs (wireline TD} 5651°).
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.! | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 9 Wt 10.8 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev,
Lin & 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12W* |Vis |35 1 12 Vi Bit 1.0
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Dowdco | WL | 22 1 motor 26.58
GPM 402 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels | 34 1 Float sub 3.90
Press 1200 Hrs Drlg Out Oil 1 UBHO SUB | 2.42
In 5013 Solid | 19.25 |1 NMDC 30.34
Fig 44 PH 8.5 1 | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 5-8K I | X-oversub 1.00
Ser/no. | D20958 18 | 6" DC’s 520.02
| Drill jar 32.30
2 6 DC’s 5778
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Date: 9-24-06 | Report No: 66 | Reported by: Mike Haynes L
QOperator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth: 5650’ ] Ft. Cut: 117 Formation; Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — Circulating

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 1800 12hrs | Slide drill 5533" to 5566°,
1800 0430 10.5hrs | Slide and rotate drill 5566° to 5650°,
0430 0600 1.5hrs | Pump sweep and circulate hole.
Sirvey
MD Inc. AZl TVD_ N. E V.Sec, D.leg Build Turn
3600  2.70 34630 559659 72.82 -15.01 72.82 0.41 041 0,06
5650 2,70 34630  5646,54 75.11 -15.07 75.11 0.00 000  0.00
Bottomn Hole Closure 76.70ft Along Azimuth 348,29
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pamp No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 9 Wt 10.8 | No | Description | Length { Depth Deyv,
Lin & St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12%“ | Vis |35 1 12 V4 Bit 1.0
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Dowdco | WL | 22 I | motor 26.58
GPM 402 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels | 3-4 1 Float sub 3.90
Press 1200 Hrs Drig Out Oil 1 UBHO SUB | 2.42
in 5013 Solid | 1925 |1 | NMDC 30.34
Fig 44 PH 8.5 1 | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 5-8K 1 X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no. | D20558 18 | 6”DC’s 520,02
1 | Drilijar 3230
2 6” DC’s 57.78
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Date: 9-23-06 | Report No: 65 | Reported by: Mike Haynes I
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal ] State: Arizona
Depth: 5533° | Ft. Cut: 145’ Formation: Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — Drilling (rotating)

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 1800 12hrs | Slide and rotate drill 5388’ to 5451°.
1800 0600 12hrs | Slide and rotate drill 5451* to 5533",
Survey
MD Inc, AZL TVD N. E V.See, D.leg Build Turn
5429 3.40 34620 542584 63.98 -12.85 63.98 0.33 032 0.147
Boitom Hole Closure 65,26 Along Azimuth 348.64
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 9 Wt 10.8 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 2% |[Vis |35 1 12 Y Bit i.0
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Dowdeo | WL | 22 1 motor 26.58
GPM 402 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels | 34 1 Float sub 3.90
Press 1200 Hrs Drlg Out Oil 1 UBHO SUB | 2.42
In 5013 Solid { 1925 | I NMDC 30.34
Fig 44 PH 8.5 1 | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 5-8K 1 X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no. | D20958 i8 | 6" DC’s 520.02
I Drill jar 3230
2 6" DC’s 57.78
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Date: 9-22-06 | Report No: 64 | Reported by: Mike Haynes P
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21 ¢
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal [ State: Arizona
Depth; 5388’ | Ft. Cut: 193’ Formation: Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Drilling (rotating)
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 1800 12hrs | Slide and rotate drill 5195’ to 5290°.
1800 0600 12hrs | Rotate drill 5290° 10 5388°.
Survey
MD Inc, AZL TVD N. E V.See, D.leg Build _Turn
5084 4.70 34690  5081.65 4097 -197 40.97 0.63 -0.62  0.62
5145 4.00 349.00 514270 4549 -8.94 45,49 1.18 -L15 0 344
5208 4.00 34890 520532 49.80 -9.78 49.80 0.01 0.00 -0.16
5271 4,00 34850  5268.16 54.11 -10,65 54.11 0.04 0.00 -0.63
5334 3.70 347.60  5331.02 5825 -11.52 5825 0.49 -048 -143
Bottom: Hole Closure 59.381t Along Azimuth 348.81
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1l | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 9 Wt 10.8 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | HrsDrlg Size 12%“ | Vis |35 1 12 14 Bit Lo
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mig Dowdco | WI, | 22 1 motor 26,58
GPM 402 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels | 34 1 Float sub 3.90
Press 1200 Hrs Drig Qut Oil i UBHO SUB | 2.42
in 5013 Solid | 1925 |1 | NMDC 30.34
Fig 44 PH 8.5 i | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 5-8K X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no. | D20958 i8 | 6°DC’s 520.02
Drill jar 3230
2 [6°DC’s 57.78
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Date; 9-21-06 | Report No: 63 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell/Mike Haynes /j’—"""
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name: Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor; United Drilling Rig No; 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth: 5195° | Ft. Cut: 110° Formation: Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Drilling (rotating)
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 Waited on ¢rossover sub.
1160 Shrs Serviced rig while waiting,
1100 Made up crossover sub. Finished in with BHA, Installed MWD tools.
1300 2hrs Broke circulation, Tested MWD tools. Adjusted tool face
1300 1700 4hrs TIH,
1700 1800 thr Broke circulation and took survey.

1800 0600 12hrs | Slide and rotate drill 5085’ to 5195,

Survey

MD Inc, AZL TVD N. E V.Sec, D.leg Build _Turn
4958 6.10 34600  4956.18 29.67 5.44 29.67 0.71 -0.63 -3.12
4989 5.60 34740  4987.02 3275 -6.16 32.75 1.68 -1.61  4.52
5012 5.20 34890 501888 35.69 -6.78 35.69 1.33 -125  4.69
5021 5.20 34890 5018.883 35.69 -6,78 35.69 1.33 -1.25 4,69
5052 4.90 346,770  5049.76 3836 -7.36 3836 115 -097 -L10

Bottom Hole Closure 39.06ft Along Azimuth 349,14

Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 9 Wt 10.8 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev,
Lin & 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | HrsDrlg Size 12U [Vis |35 1 12 Y4 Bit 1.0
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Dowdco | WL | 22 1 motor 26,58
GPM 402 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels |34 | Float sub 3.90
Press 1200 Hrs Drlg Out Qil 1 UBHO SUB | 242
In 5013 Solid | 19.25 [ 1 NMDC 30.34
Ftg 44 PH 8.5 1 | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 5-8K i X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no. | D20958 18 | 6" DC’s 520.02
Drill jar 32.30
2 6” DC’s 31.78
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Date 9-20-06 | Report No 62 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell -

Operator: EI Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Namie Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth 5085

| Ft.Cut 28

Formation

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — Wait on cross over sub

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 18:00 12.0 Slide drill from 5057 to 5081 ft,
18:00 21:00 3.0 Slide drill from 5081 to 5085 ft
21:00 00:30 3.5 Trip out of hole to change mud motors
00:30 02:30 2.0 Lay down 8” motor and pick up 6.250 motor make up Dowdco PDC bit on motor attempt to make
Up drill collar (non mag) to motor have wrong sub,
02:30 06:00 3.5 Wait on crossover sub
Survey:
MD in¢ azi tvd north cast  Vsect Dleg build furn
4958 6.10 346,00 4956.18 29.67 544  29.67 0.71 -0.63 -3.12
4989 5.60  347.40 4987.02 3275 -6.16  32.75 1.68 -1.61 4.52
5012 520 34890 5018.88 35.69 -6.78  35.69 L33 -1.25 4,69
Bottom hole closure 36.33 #. along Azimuth 349.24
Sub should be here by noon. Increase in drill rate expected to be in the 5-6 FPH range and should
Be in the 10 to 15 FPH rotating . Due to being out of hole Waiting time on cross over sub should
Be made up in increased drill rate
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. i | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 9 Wt 10.8 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 { 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 12%*“ | Vis |35 1 12 ¥4 Bit 1.0 -3213° ¥
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg dowdeo | WL, | 22 1 motor 28.57 | 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels | 3-4 1 Float sub 3.78
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Gil i UBHOSUB | 2.42
In 5013 Solid | 1925 |1 [ NMDC 30.34
Fig 72 PH 8.5 I | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no. | D20958 18 [ 6" DC’s 596.44
1 Drill jar 32.30
2 | 6’DC’s 57.78

Total

686.52
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Date 9-19-06 ] Report No 61 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell i:i/
Operator: EI Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21 )
Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 5057 | Ft.Cut 43 Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Drilling rotating
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 08:00 2.0 Finish tripping in hole
08:00 09:00 1.0 Brake circulation calibrate MWD tools get Tool Face adjusted
09:00 18:00 9.0 Slide drill from 5013’ to 5032°
18:00 20:30 2.5 Slide drill from 5032 to 5035’
20:30 23:00 2.5 Circulate with # 2 pump while working on # T pump Change out packing and liner
Pump # 2 would not pump enough GPM to get signal fromn MWD to surface
23:00 06:00 7.0 Drill Slide driil and rotate drill from 5035’ to 5057
Survey’s
MD Inc. AZIl TVD N. V.Sec, Ddeg  Build Turn
4926 6.30 34700 492437 2631 -4.63 26.31 1.60 -0.94 11.56
4958 6.10 346.00  4956.18 29.67 -544 29,67 0.71 -0.63 -3.12
4989 5.60 347.00 _ 4987.02 32.75 -6.16 32.75 1.68 -1.61 4,52
Cuttings: no cement /Anhydrite —SS —-Shale
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No,2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 9 Wt 10.8 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin & St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12%“ | Vis |35 1 12 Y4 Bit 1.0 3213 W
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Dodco WL |22 i moftor 28.57 3477 3%
GPM 402 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels | 34 1 Float sub 3.78
Press 1200 Hrs Drlg Out 0il 1 UBHO SUB | 2.42
In 5013 Solid | 1925 |1 | NMDC 30.34
Fig 44 PH 8.5 1 } Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 5-8K I X-over sub 1,00
Ser/no. | D20958 18 | 6" DC’s 596.44
1 Drill jar 32.30
2 |6°DC’s 57.78
Total 686.52




iy,
il

PB Energy

Sforage
Date 9-18-06 I ReportNo 60 Reported by: Curtis Bagwell =
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Weil Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 5013 | Ft.Cut 10 Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Trip in hole with motor and 12 %4 “ bit
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 18:00 12,0 Drili Stide dritl from 5003° to 5013°
18:00 00:00 6.0 Trip out of hole to change bit
00:00 01:00 1.0 Change out bit ran Dowdco PDC 12 % * bit test MWD
01:00 02:30 1.5 Run in hole with drill coilars
02:30 03:00 0.5 Test motor and MWD at 700 ft.
03:00 06:00 3.0 Tripping in hole with new bit (Trip time Ionger due to bent motor has some drag)
New bit info: 12 ¥4 “ Dowdco PDC Type SIMS566B / SN # D20958
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 3 Wt 10.9 | No | Description | Length { Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12%“ | Vis 35 1 12 V4 Bit 1.0 3213 W
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL |22 1 motor 28.57 13477 3%
GPM 423 Hrs DW Type Tnsert Gels | 3-4 1 Float sub 3.78
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Qut 5013 Oil 1 UBHO SUB | 2.42
In 4481 Solid | 1925 |1 | NMDC 30.34
Fig 132 PH 8.5 1 | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 8-20K 1 X-over sub 1,00
Ser/no. | M430Imx I8 | 6" DC's 596.44
Drill jar 3230
6” DC’s 57.78
Total 686.52
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Date 9-17-06 | Report No 59 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell C/?')? ‘3

Operator:  El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21 -

Centractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal j State: Arizona

Depth 5003 | Ft.Cut 51 Formation anhydritt | Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — Time drilling

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation

From To Time

06:00 06:00 24.0 Time drifl from 4952’ to 5003’ ( Time drill @ 2 fi per hr. rate )
MD INC AZI TVD N E V. SEC D.LEG BUILD
4863 7.2 350,60 4861 19.11 -3.33 19,11 0.65 -0.65
4894 6.60 350.70 4892  22.79 -3.94 22,79 1.94 -1.94
4926 6.30 34700 4924 2631 -4.63 26.31 1.60 -0.94

projected | 5250 0.0 347.00 5247  43.65 -8.63 43.65 1.94 -1.94

Above is projected at current rates and will be 18 ft out from fish, At present drilling in

Mostly anhydrite and rates will be slow while time drilling wiil look at next survey and

Decide on rotating which will increase drill rate next survey in 3 hrs.

Bit # 8 HAS 103 HRS

Note : Halliburton cement bin on location and loaded with cement; frac tank full of fresh

Water fo change over mud

Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No, ! | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 8 Wt 10.9 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 12%“ 1 Vis 35 1 12 % Bit 1.0 3213’ LN
SPM 57 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL |22 1 maotor 28.57 | 3477 3%
GPM 402 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | % 1 Float sub 3.78
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Qil 1 UBHO SUB | 2.42
in 4881 Solid | 1925 | 1 NMDC 30.34
Ftg 122 PH 8.5 1 | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 20K I X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no, | M430Imx 18 | 6°DC’s 596.44
1 | Drilljar 32.30
6” DC’s 57.78

Total 686.52
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Date 916-06 | Report No 58 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell U

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 4952 | Ft.Cut 23 Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Time drifl
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 06:00 240 Time drill at 1 &, per hr. from 4929 to 4942’ and 2 ft. per hr from 4942 to 4952’
Due to Anhydrite could not get 2 fi per min without adding excess weight . Have anhydrite section
From 4940 tko 4950 that appears to be solid and was hard drilling on pass with 7 7/8” bit
At report time appears we are through this section and drilling should be better, Is rate increases
Will start rotating this morning
MD INC. AZI  TVD N. E. V.SEC. D.LEG BUILD
4863  7.20 35060 4861 19.11 -3.33 19.11 0.65 0.65
4894 6.60 350.70 4892 22.79 -394 22.79 1,94 -1.94
Bit # 8 has 79 hrs
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Maud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 [ No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 3 Wi 10.8 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12%“ | Vis |32 1 12 V4 Bit 1.0 3213 W
SPM 57 Hrs Misc Mifg Reed WL | 124 |1 | motor 28.57 | 3477 3
GPM 402 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | % 1 Float sub 3.78
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Qut Oil 1 UBHO SUB | 242
In 4881 Solid } 185 |1 |[NMDC 30.34
Fig 71 PH 10 1 | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 6-20K 1 X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no. [ M430Imx 18 | 6" DC’s 596.44
Hrs 79 1 | Drill jar 32.30
2 16°DC’s 57.78
Total 686.52
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Date 9-15-06 | ReportNo 57 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell 7z
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth #9272 | FtCut 24 | Formation Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — Time driiling

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 06:00 24.0 ‘Time drill from 4909° to 4933’ (24 ft. /24 hrs / 1 foot per hour )
Will continue to time drill for 10 +- ft. and start moving up on feet per hour at present getting 100%
Formation if this continues will start increase drill rate early 10 ft will get MWD in dev. hole
Bit #8 -- 55 hrs
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 { No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 8 Wt 10.7 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | HrsDrlg Size 12%“ | Vis |37 1 12 Y4 Bit 1.0 3213’ ¥
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL [1645 |1 | motor 28.57 | 3477 3k
GPM 423 Hrs DW Type Tnsert Gels | 2/3 i Float sub 3.78
Press 1600 Hrs Drig Out Oil 1 UBHO SUB | 2.42
In 4881 Solid { 17,00 | 1 | NMDC 30.34
Fig 55 PH 9.0 1 | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 6-8K 1 [ X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no. | M430Imx 18 | 6” DC's 596.44
1 | Drilljar 32.30
2 | 6”°DC% 57.78
Total 686.52
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Date 9-14-06 | Report No 56 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell
Operator:  E] Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 4909 | Ft.Cut 23 Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Time Drill at ! fi per hr.
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 18:00 12.0 Time drill from 4886 to 4898’
18:00 06:00 12,0 Time drill from 489 to 4909
Bit has 31 hrs
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No.1 | No,2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 8 Wt 10.8 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin & St, | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 12%“ | Vis |37 i 12 % Bit 1.0
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL 1196 |1 | mofor 28.57
GPM 423 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | 2/3 1 Float sub 3.78
Press 1200 Hrs Drlg Out il 1 UBHO SUB | 242

In 4881 Solid | 17.75 |1 | NMDC 30.34

Ftg 31 PH 9.0 1 | Shock sub 9.31

Bit Wt | 4-6K 1 | X-over sub 1.00

Ser/no. | EN3100 18 | 6" DC’s 596.44

type M4301mx I | Drill jar 32.30

2 | 6°DC’s 57.78
Total 686.52
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Date 9-13-06 | Report No 55 { Reported by: Curtis Bagwell —_—
Operator: EI Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County; Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 4887 | Ft.Cut 30° Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Time drilling
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 11:00 5.0 Drill Rotate and slide from 4857 to 4881 start getting cement in returns up to 90%. Bit had
37.5 hrs and was a re-run decide to pull bit and start kick off again
11:00 15:00 4.0 Trip out ofhole
15:00 16:30 1.5 Change bit and reset and test MWD and motor
16:30 18:00 1.5 Trip in hole test directional tools at 2000 ft. OK
18:00 22:00 4,0 Finish trip in hole
22:00 23;00 1.0 Brake circulation and get directional tools working get survey
23:00 06:00 7.0 Time drill at 1 f. per hr rate to Kick off from 4881’ to 4887’

Bit # 7 had 37.5 hrs and was a re-run bit made 125 ft. (Weatherford Directional on Location)

Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No,1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 7 Wt 9.9 No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 124 {Vis |38 1 12 Y4 Bit 1.0 3213 Wh
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mifg Reed WL [196 |1 motor 28.57 | 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels 1 Float sub 3.78
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Qut 4381 Oil 1 UBHO SUB | 2.42
In 4756 Solid 1 | NMDC 3034
Ftg 125 PH 1 | Shock sub 9.31
Bitwt 20K 1 X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no. | PP332 18 | 6" DC’s 596.44
Drill jar 32.30
6" DC’s 57.78

Total 686.52
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Date 912-06 | Report No 54 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell Lq'/
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 4857 | Ft.Cut 92 Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time : Drilling (Slide drill building curve for kick off')
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 16:00 10.0 Drili / stide driil and rotate drill from 4765’ to 4788’ (slide drill no rotation of rotary table drill with
Motor only to rotate bit)
16:00 18:00 2.0 Drill Slide drill from 4788’ to 4803’
18:00 06:00 12.0 Drill slide and rotate drill from 4803” to 4857’
Note: Ine. 4706 ft. 6,8 degree / 4738 ft. 6.9 degree / 4769 ft, 6.9 degree / 4801 ft. 7.3 degree
Azimuth 351,00 350.3 350.10 348.60
Dog leg 00.0 0.41 0.08 1.38
Bit # 7 has 32.5 hrs. /101 ft.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Prilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 7 Wt 10.8 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev,
Lin & 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 124« |Vis |37 1 12 ¥4 Bit 1.0 4706 6.8
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL [196 {1 | motor 28.57 | 4738 6.9
GPM 423 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | 2/3 1 Float sub 3.78 4769 6.9
Press 1200 Hrs Drlg Out Oil 1 UBHO SUB | 242 4801 7.3
In 4756 Solid { 17.75 |1 | NMDC 30.34
Fig 101 PH 9.0 1 | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt I X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no. | PP332 : 18 | 6 DC’s 596.44
Drill jar 32.30
2 6" DC’s 57.78

Total 686.52
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Date 9-11-06 | Report No 53 | Reported by; Curtis Bagwell ) j;fm“"
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 4765 | Ft.Cut 9 Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Time drill to kick off round fish
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 09:00 3.0 On bottom try to get Directional tools to work (MWD) could not get signal to start drilling
09:00 13:30 4.5 Trip out of hole had 2 tight spots at 4260 and 4285 ream thru both cleaned up
13:30 15:00 1.5 Change out MWD change out one jet in bit / program MWD
15:00 20.30 5.5 Trip in hole (triping pipe slow due to bent motor)
20:30 21:00 0.5 Brake circulation calibrate tools getting signal to surface working OK Survey 6.8 degrees
21:00 06:00 9.0 Time drill / drill ¥ “ every 2.5 min. drill with motor from 4756 to 4765’ made 9* / 9 hrs /1FPI
At report time bringing drill rate to 2 fi/ per hrs
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No. 1 [ No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 6 Wt 10.8 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 124 | Vis |33 1 12 Y4 Bit 1.0 3213 ¥
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL [196 |1 motor 28.57 {3477 3k
GPM 423 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | 2/3 1 Float sub 3.78
Press 1200 Hzs Drlg Out Oil 1 UBHO SUB | 242

In 4756 Solid | 17.75 | 1 NMDC 30.34

Ftg 9 PH 9.0 1 | Shock sub 9.31

BitWt | 45K I X-over sub 1.00

Ser/mo. | PP332 18 [ 6°DC’s 596.44

1 Drill jar 32.30
2 |6’DC’s 57.78

Total

686,52




Date 9-10-06

| Report No 52

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

937
T

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth

4756

| Ft.Cut 37

Formation

Tops New Form;

Activity at Report Time — Trip in hole with motor and insert bit to kick off

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 15:30 9.5 Drill open hole to 12 % * from 4719’ to 4756’
15:30 21:00 5.5 Trip out of hole
21:00 00:30 35 Brake out motor and fioat sub lay down motor . Pick up new motor and bit (re run)install MWD
And test at surface (had to work on sleeve to install MWD,
00:30 06:00 5.5 Lay out [ stand drill pipe . Trip in hole with 12 %4” bit motor and directional equipment . Testing
Directional tools on way in hole getting signal from tool. Have to go in slow with bent motor.
Note: Bit # 6 had 45 hrs and cut 157 ft. can not yun bit again due to cones fvose.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 6 Wt 10.7 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12%* {Vis [33 i 12 ¥ Bit 1.0 321% W
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL | 196 1 motor 2857 13477 - |3
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | 2/3 1 Float sub 3.78
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out 4756 0il 1 UBHO SUB | 2.42
In 4592 Solid {1775 | 1 NMDC 30.34
Ftg 164 PH 9.0 i | Shock sub 9,31
Bit Wt |20k 1 X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no. | K41806 18 | 6”DC’s 596.44
1 Drill jar 32.30
6” DC’s 57.78
Total 686.52
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Date 9-9-06

, Report No 51

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth 4719

| Ft.Cut 96

Formation

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — Drilling open hole to 12 ¥4 ¢

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 13:00 7.0 Drill open hole to 12 % “ from 4623 to 4661 f. (38 fi / 7 hrs / 5.4 FPH)
13:00 13:30 0.5 Rig service
13:30 06:00 16.5 Drill open hole to 12 % “ from 4661’ to 4719° (58 ft / 16.5 hrs / 3.5 FPH )
Note: no cement at report fime
BHA—12 ¥  bit — float sub — 8" shock sub — X-over -18 6” drill collars — Drilling jars -2 6" Drill
Collars -- total length 624.94
Bit # 6-- 35.5 hrs 120 fi.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.i | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit# 6 Wit 910.7 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12%“ | Vis 33 I 12 Y4 Bit 1.0 321% E
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL 19.6 1 motor 28.57 | 3477 34
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | 2/3 1 Float sub 3.78
Press 1600 Hrs Drlg Qut Oil 1 UBHO SUB | 2.42
In 4592 Solid [ 17.75 |1 | NMDC 30.34
Fig 120 PH 2.0 1 | Shock sub 9.31
Bit Wt | 25k 1 X-over sub 1.00
Ser/no, | K41806 18 | 6”DC’s 596.44
Dritl jar 32.30
8 DC’s 57.78

Total

686.52
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Date 9-8-06

] Report No 50 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

<

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona

Depth 2623

| Ft.Cut 24 Formation Anhydrite | ‘Tops New Form;

Activity at Report Time — Drilling open hole to 12 4

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 07.00 1.0 Finish trip in hole with motor
07:00 14:30 7.5 Prill open hole te 12 ¥4 * with motor and insert bit from 4592 to 4599” ( 9/10 ft per hr.)
Could not make hole with motor (bent) make 5 fi. to get bend in new drilled hole still no drill rate
14:30 18:00 3.5 ‘Trip out of hole
18:00 20:00 2.0 Stand back maotor in derrick retrive MWD tool { were not working ) rearrange BITA
20:00 01:00 5.0 Trip in hole
01:00 01:30 0.5 Pick up Kelly brake circulation
01:30 06:00 4.5 Drill open hole from 7 7/8 * to 12 Y “ from 4599° to 4623 (24 ft. / 4.5 hrs / 5.3 fi.per hr.)
Bottom hole assembly ; 1 — 12 % * bit — float sub — §” shock sub — cross over sub— 18 6 DC’s
Drilling jar -2 6” DC’s Total 624.94 ft.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 6 Wt 10.7 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev,
Lin & 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12%« | Vis [33 1 12 Y4 Bit 1.0 3213 W
SPM 50 Hrs Mise Mfg Reed WL [196 1 | motor 28.57 | 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels |23 1 | Float sub 3.78
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg QOut Qil I UBHO SUB | 2.42

In 4592 Solid | 1775 [ 1 | NMDC 30.34

Fig 31 PH 9.0 1 | Shock sub 9.31

Bit Wt 1 X-over sub 1.00

Ser/no. | K41806 18 16°DC’s 596.44

1 Drill jar 32.30
2 |6”DC’s 57.78

Total 686.52
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Date 9-7-06 [ ReportNo 49 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell .

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County; Pinal | State: Arizona

Depth 4592

| Ft.Cut 29

Formation -Anhydrite

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — Trip in hole with motor and 12 ¥ * bit

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 09:30 3.5 Drill open hole to 12 % “ from 4563 to 4592 ft. (29 fi. / 3.5 hrs 8.4 FPH)
09:30 11:30 20 Pump sweep and circulate hole ¢lean
11:30 15:00 35 Trip out of hole
15:00 18;00 3.0 Pick up and make up directional tools
18:00 23:30 5.5 Wait on Weatherford to get tools make up and made adjustments to MWD tools. Calibrate tools
23:30 03:30 4.0 TFrip in hole picking up shock bit / motor / shock sub drill collars / jars
03:30 05:30 2.0 Tight spot at 2427 to 2991 pick up Kelly and ream thru area cleaned up no drag or tight spots
05:30 06:00 0.5 Trip in hole
Bit # 6 /94 hrs 1207 ¢
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 6 Wt 10,7 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 12%“ | Vis |33 1 12 % Bit 1,0 3213 ¥
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL [ 196 |1 motor 28.57 {3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels 12/3 1 Float sub 3.78
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out 4592 Qil I UBHO SUB | 2.42

In 3325 Solid | 17.75 | 1| | NMDC 30.34

Fig 1207 PH 9.0 1 | Shock sub 9,31

BitwWt | 20k 1 X-over sub 1.00

Ser/no. 18 [ 6"DC’s 596.44

i Driil jar 32.30
2 | 6°DC’s 57.78

Total 686.52
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Date 9-6-06 | Report No 48 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell !
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21 g
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 4563 | Ft.Cut 178 Formation anby Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — Open hole to 12 %4 ¢

Time Log Elapsed

From To Time

Details of Operation

06:00 14:30 8.5

Drill open hole to 12 % “ from 4385 to 4497" (112* /8.5 hrs/ 13.2 FPH )

14:30 15:00 0.5

Rig service

15:00 06:00 15.0

Drill open hole to 12 Y “ from 4497 to 4563 * (66 * / 15 hrs / 4.4 FPH ) tight spot @ 4560 ream

Thru and cleaned up

Note; bit has 90.5 hrs Top of cement 4716’ need 153 * will need to make bit trip

Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 6 Wit 10.7 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12 ¥4 Vis | 37 1 12 % bit L0 3213 #°
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL |22 t X-over sub 3.0 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | 4/7 1 X-over sub 3.0
Press 1000 Hrs Drig QOut 0il 20 | 6”DC’s 577.80

In 3325 Solid | 17.75

Ftg 1238’ PH 7.5

BitWt | 20K

Total 582.80
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Date 9-5-06 | Report No 47 { Reported by: Curtis Bagwell P

Operator; EI Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State; Arizona
Depth 4385 | Fr.Cut 605 Formation Salt Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time -- Openholet 2 4

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation

From To Time

06:00 13:30 7.5 Drill open hole from 7 7/8” to 12 ¥4 ** from 3780° to 4055’ (275 ft /7.5 hrs / 36.6 FPH )

13:30 14:30 1.0 Circulate sweep and bottoms up

14:30 18:00 3.5 Wiper trip pull 40 stands check for drag hole in good condition run back in hole no tight areas.
18:00 06:00 12.0 Drill open hole to 12 % * from 4055 t0 4385’ (330 ft/ 12 hrs / 27.5 FPH)

Note; bit has 67 hrs. Bottem second salt 4509 ¢ top of cement plug 4716 + -
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No.1 { No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 6 Wt 10.7 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12" | Vis 37 I 12 Y4 bit 1.0 3213 W
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mifg Reed WL | 22 1 X-over sub 3.0 3477 3
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | 4/7 1 X-over sub 3.0

Press 1600 Hrs Drlg Out Oil 20 |1 6”DC’s 577.80

In 3325” Solid | 17.75

Fig 1060 f. | PH | 7.5

Bit Wt | 20,000

Total 582.80
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Date 9-4-06 | Report No 46 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell .
Operator: EI Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinai | State: Arizona
Depth 3780 [ Ft.Cut 240 Formation anby Tops New Forn:
Activity at Report Time — Open hole from 7 7/8¢ 12 ¥4
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 10:30 4.5 Drill open hole to 12 4 * from 3540° to 3581” (41 ft /4.5 hrs /9.1 FPH )
10:30 11:00 0.5 Rig service
11:00 06:00 19.0 Drill open hole to 12 % “ from 3581" t0 3780 * (199 i/ 19.0 hrs / 10 5 FPH )
Note : top of second salt at 3796
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 6 Wt 910.7 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev,
Lin & St. | 6X16 { 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12%% | Vis 37 1 12 V4 bit 1.0 3213 ¥
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL 21 1 X-over sub 3.0 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | 3/6 I X-over sub 3.0
Press 1000 Hrs Dilg Out Oil 20 | 6°DC’s 5717.80
In 3325 Solid | 17.75
Fig 455 PH 7.5

Bit Wt | 20/30K

Total 582,80
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Date 9-3-06

| ReportNo 44" /5~

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

—

Operator:  El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor; United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

I State: Arizona

Depth 3540

| Ft.Cut 212

Formation anby

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time -- Drill open hole to 12 %«

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 14:00 8.0 Drill open hole from 7 7/8 to 12 % “ from 3328 t0 3395’ (67 * /8 hrs / 8.4 FPH )
14:00 14:30 0.5 Rig service
14:30 06:00 15.5 Drill open hole from 7 7/8 to 12 % * from 3395 to 3540° (145 ft./ 15.5 hrs / 9.4 FPH )
Note; Drill rate should improve as we_get into salt @ 3796’ records show improved rate at
Starting at 3571° on first pass will watch rate at that point .
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit# 6 Wt 10.5 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12 V4 Vis 30 1 12 ¥4 bit 1.0 3213’ A
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL |32 1 X-over sub 3.0 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | 373 1 X-over sub 3.0
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out il 20 §{ 6" DC’s 577.80
In 3325 Solid | 16.25
Ftg 212 PH 3
BitWt | 20K
Total 582,80
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Date 9-2-06

| Report No 44

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Confractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth 3328’

| Fe.Cut 13

Formation anby

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time -- Drill open hole from 7 7/8to 12 %4 ¢

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 07:00 1.0 Finish trip out of hole
07:00 11:00 4.0 Wait on hole opener
11:00 1200 1.0 Pick up hole opener (12 % * X 7 7/8” ) make up 7 7/8 bit to bottom and strap
12:00 16:00 4.0 Trip in hole with hole opener wash and ream last 45 f, to 3315 fi.
16:60 22:00 6.0 Open hole with 12 % ** by 7 7/8  PDC hole opener from 3315 to 3325° ( 10 ft. / 6 hrs 1.6 FPH)
Most of footage in first 2 hrs / last 2 hrs not even a foot per hour.)
22:00 02:00 4.0 Safety meeting and trip out of hole to change bit ( hole opener) pulled thru tight spot at 3325°
Pull up to 2985 and picked up Kelly and ream back thru 2 time s cleaned up no drag.
02:00 02:30 0.5 Lay out hole opener and pick up Reed Tri-cone insert bit ( 12 % ©)
02:30 05:00 2.5 Trip in hole
05:00 05:30 0.5 Pick up Kelly and brake circulation wash 60” to bottom for safety little fill
05:30 06:00 0.5 Drili open hole 7 7/8 “ to 12 ¥ “ from 3325 (o 3228’
Note ; Hole opener not damaged but would not make hole @ report time insert bit seems to
Be drilling at about 10 - 12 FPH Working with wt, and rotary RPM to get max rate, Due to short
Time sence on bottom not sure what can get rate up to.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 6 Wt 104 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Dilg Size 12 44 Vis 31 1 12 Y4 bit 1.0 3213 wn
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL {21 1 X-over sub 3.0 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | 1/3 1 X-over sub 3.0
Press 1000 Hrs Dilg Out Oil 20 | 6°DC’s 577.80
In 3325 Solid | 16.5
Fig PH 8.5
BitWt | 10/20
Jets 3-14’s
Total 582.80
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Date 9-1-06

[ Report No 43

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

973

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 3215 | Ft.Cut 144 Formation anby Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time -- Trip out of holke to change bit
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 10:00 4.0 Drill open hole from 7 7/8 to 12 % “ from 3171 to 3203’ (32 ft /4 hrs/ 8 FPH )
10:00 10:30 0.5 Rig Service :
10:30 02:00 15.5 Drill open hole from 7 7/8 to 12 ¥%4” from 3203 to 3315’ (112 ft/ 15.5 hrs / 7.2 FPPH )
02:00 06:00 3.0 Trip out of hole had drag 20 K over string wt, from 3315 to 3234’ Ream back thru no drag afier
Reaming thru Not to bit so do not know condition. Pulled bit because ROP dropped to 2 FPH
Note: Bit has 46,5 hrs and is a re-run bit with unknown hours before running ,
PDC hole opener has not arrived on location as of report time
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 4 Wit 10.5 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 124" |Vis |31 | 12 % “ bit 1.0 3213 wh
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Smith WL 1220 |1 | X-ovrsub 3.0 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Miltooth | Gels | 1/3 i X-over sub 1.0
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out 3315 Oil 20 | 6”DC’s 577.80
In 2417 Solid | 1625
Ftg 898 PH 8.5
Bit Wt | 10/30
Total 582.80
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Date 8-31-06 I Report No 42 f Reported by: Curtis Bagwell / )
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21 -
Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 3171 | Ft.Cut 521° Formation anby Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time -- Drilling open hole from 7 7/8” to 12 ¥4 %

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 13:30 7.5 Drill open hole from 7 7/8 to 12 V4 from 2650’ to 2954’ (304 ft /7.5 hrs / 40.5 FPH }
13:30 14:00 0.5 Rig service
14:00 18:00 4.0 Drill open hole to 12 ¥ * from 2954 t0 3072’ (118 /4 hrs / 29.5 FPH )
18:00 06:00 12.0 Drill open hole from 7 7/8” to 12 % * from 3072’ to 3171° (99 ft / 12 hrs / 8.25 FPH )
Note ; From 3060 ¢ in Anhydrite ROP down to 8.2 FPH have 650 feet to drill. Bit has 31 hrs.
Have 12% “ PDC hole opener in route to location will ¢rip out and run as soon as here
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 4 Wi 10.;5 | No | Description | Length | Depth Deyv,
Lin & 8. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 12%" | Vis 31 | 12 % “ bit 1.0 3213 %N
SPM 53 Hrs Misc Mfg Smith WL | 17.2 1 X-over sub 3.0 3477 3%
GPM 375 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | 13 i x-over sub 1.0
Press 750 Hrs Drlg Out Oil 20 | 6”DC’s 577.80
In 2417 Solid | 16.25
Fig PH 8.5
Bit Wt | 1(/12
Total 582.80




SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

1. Name of Operator F/ %JO /(/(/?"ffﬂ/"? / @0 £ 6}&»}4&’/'#*? Vel

/-
2 OILWELL [ ] GASWELL [ | OTHER g] (Specify) g’f’Vfr 7‘557 #zyéx“c, 7243 7

3. Well Name /Q&S ﬂ/"?/

Location /z ?5/0 ! /:"/YZ. # éé o I/["WL-

Sec. Z / Twp. 7 S Rge. gf County %h q / , Arlzona

4, Federal, State, or Indian Lease Number, or lessor's name if fea lease 0:»’44 c’f// /9)/ 4{'7 %10 /%7’2(/»/9/ &'&".f

5. Field or Pool Name f\/ /4

8. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT--OFF WEEKLY PROGRESS
ZﬁS%TTUHE TREAT DIRECTIONAL DRILL FRACTURE TREATMENT REPAIRING WELL
OR ACIDIZE PERFORATE CASING SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ALTER CASING
REPAIR WELL | CHANGE PLANS ABANDONMENT
(OTHER) (OTHER)

(NOTE: Report results of multiple completicn on Well Completion
or Recomplelion Report and Leg, Form 4)

1. Efi?gggiﬁyﬂﬁ;%gg{? v%?k C?f)l;\lllvzli.iETgD (3SEET'A1§O”NC‘S {Qleaﬂ% slarée alt pertinant details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date
. s directionally drilled, give subsurface focati i
e D s y g ace [ocations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and

On August 23" while shut down for rig repairs at a depth of 5,935” we became stuck in
the AGS #1-21. All attempts to free the pipe with lubricant, diesel, and the use of
hydraulic jars have proved unsuccessful. Consequently, we backed off the drill string at
a depth of 5,217 leaving the bif, mud motor, 20 drill collars and two joints of drill pipe in

the hole,

In order to remedy the situation and take this well to its objective total depth, El Paso
Natural Gas intends to ream the existing 7 7/8” hole to 12 %4”, directionally drill around
the fish to the top of the siltstone/sandstone interval we had encountered at a depth of
approximately 5,630, At that point we intend to run 9 5/8” casing and cement to surface
using approximately 1255 sacks of cement. Then we plan to switch back to fresh water
based drilling fluids and proceed to drill out from casing and take this stratigraphic test

to a total depth of approximately 8,000°.

8. | hereby certify that the f%rwd.
Signed .A} W Title ﬂ//f-ﬂ;?/éey/ /’/7/\/4‘ Date y ’3 (/I"Zﬁﬂé

STATE OF ARIZONA
OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
. ? 3 3 Sundry Notice and Reports On Wells
Permit No, Form No, 25 File One Copy

5/96
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Date 8-30-06

| Report No 41

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

-

Operator:  El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No; 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth 2650

| Ft.Cut 400

Formation

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time —Drilling open hole from 7 7/8 “ to 12 4

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 09:00 3.0 Drill open hole from 7 7/8 “ to 12 %  from 2250’ to 2291°
09:60 10:00 1.0 Rig service and jet shaker pit
10:00 15:00 5.0 Drill open hole from 7 7/8 to 12 ¥ * from 2291 to 2417’ (126’ /5 hrs /25.2 FPH)
15:00 21:00 6.0 Trip out of hole change bit and trip in hole '
21:00 22:00 1.0 Work on rotary table and chain
22:00 22;30 0.5 Brake circulation and tag bottom
22:30 06:00 7.5 Drill open hole from 7 7/8 to 12 %  from 2417 to 2650’ (233 ft/ 7.5 hrs / 31 FPH)
Drilled 400 ft with 15.5 drilling tilme / 25.8 FPH
Note: center punch pulled at 30 hrs teeth in good condition but had 1 cone loose
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 4 Wt 10.5 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 122%“ | Vis 30 1 12 Y4 bit 1.0 3213’ Y
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Smith WL [ 308 X-over sub 3.0 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Insert Gels | 111 i 8”X6” xsub | 1.0
Press 800 Hrs Drlg Out Qil 20 | 6”D/C’s 577.80

In 2417 Solid | 1625

Ftg 233 PH 8

Bit Wt

Jets 4-14s

Total 582.80




% PB Energy
Storage

g ie_rvlces, Inc.
Date 8-29-06 | Report No 40 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell
Operator:  El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal State: Arizona
Depth 2250 | Ft.Cut 619 Formation anby Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Drilling open hole from 7 7/8” to 12 %4 ©
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 10:00 4.0 Pick up 20 6” drill collars and run I;n hole with 15 stands 4 % * drill pipe tag bottom at 1631°
Service rig
10:00 18:00 8.0 Drilling — open hole from 7 7/8 to 12 % * from 1631 to 1920 ( 289" /8 hrs / 36.1 FPH )
18:00 06:00 12.0 Drill open hole from 7 7/8" to 12 ¥4 * from 1920’ to 2250 (330” /12 hrs / 27.5 FPH )
Note: Drill rates from 1820 to below 2000 ft dropped to as low as 25 MPF Average ROP
31 ft. per hour
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.i | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # RR Wit 9.9 No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& &8t | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 12 %% | Vis 30 1 12 % H/O 5.80 3213 ¥
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg RR WL 1 X-over sub 3.0 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type centerpun | Gels 1 8x6"x-over 1.0
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Oil 20 | 6" drilicollar | 577.80
In 1604 Solid
Fig 619 PH
Bit Wt | 8-12
Total 587.60
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Date §-28-06 | Report No 39 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell
Operator:  Ei Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal State: Arizona
Depth 1604 | Ft.Cut Formation anby Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time -- Trip in hole picking up driil collars
Time Log Eiapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
0600 10:30 4.5 Wait on Halliburton (bring cmt from Farmington NM)
10:30 12:00 1.5 Make wiper trip pull 18 stands and run back in hole
12:00 16:00 4.0 Wait on Halliburton
16:00 17:00 1.0 Rig up Halliburton to well fest lines to 3500 psi. Mix and pump 2 bbls KCL spacer / mix and pump
161 sacks type G cement with 4/10% Halad 322—2/10 % HR-5 — 2.8 # / Sk KCL yield of 1.05-16.7#
Total 30 bbls with 2.5 bbls KCL spacer behind cmt. Displace with 60 bbls brine mud. Pump rate
2 BPM cement and 4 BPM Displace / pressure 100 psi cmt. And 160 psi displace. Mix 20 sacks
Cmt and top off between 13 3/8 surface and 20” conductor bring cement to surface,
17:00 18:00 1.0 Pull out of hole stand back 15 stands
18:00 18:30 0.5 Circulate pipe clean
18:30 23:00 4.5 Trip out of hole laying down drill pipe
23:00 01:00 2.0 Nipple down well control equipment and flow line
01:00 04:00 3.0 Build Bell nipple weld flow line connection on and nipple up bell nipple
04:00 05:00 1.0 Hook up flow line
05:00 06:00 1.0 Start tripping in hole with 12 14 % X 7 7/8 * centerpunch and new drill collars
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wt No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 { Hrs Drlg Size Vis 3213 ¥
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mig WL 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Gels
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Oil
In Solid
Fig PH
Bit Wt
Total
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Date 8—27-06 | ReportNo 38 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell [ 22—~
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21 -
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 5213 | Ft.Cut Formation Tops New Form;
Activity at Report Time —~Wait on Halliburton to repair pump and deliver cement
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 08:00 2.0 Finish tripping out of hole
08:00 08:30 0.5 Lay down fishing tools
08:30 15;00 6.5 Wait on cement company
15:00 18:00 3.0 Trip in hole with drill pipe / 1 drifl collar and 7 7/8 bit with no nozzles to 5210°
18:00 20:00 2.0 Circulate and work pipe
20:00 21:00 1.0 Rig up Southwest Exploration Service
21:00 00:00 3.0 Run deviation survey on well hole at bottom 8.9 degree
00:00 02:00 2,0 Circulate wait on Halliburton
02:00 02:30 0.5 Rig up Halliburton
02:30 03:30 1.0 Halliburton attempt to pump Kick off plug at 5210° Punip 6-8 bbis and pump failed check
For plugged bit or down hole problems rig pump circ. OK. Clean up Hallilburton equuip and pick
Up Kelly and circ. Cement out of hole.
03:30 06:00 2.5 Circulate and wait on Halliburton to repair pump and deliver cement
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wt 9.9 No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St, | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size Vis 30 3213 W
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg WL 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Gels
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Qil
In Solid
Fig PH
Bit Wt
Total
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Date 8-26-06 | Report No 37 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell I
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 5935 | Ft.Cut Formation anby Tops New Form:
Activity at Report TIME Trip out of hole with fishing tools
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 08:00 20 Work jars attempt to recover fish
08:00 22;00 14.0 Wait on freepoint truck
22:00 04:00 6.0 Rig up Weatherford wire line unit to freepoint to back off above fish and recover pipe
Ran in hole pipe free at 5216 f. no movement at 5249 ft. Freepoint at bottom of fishing tools
Leaving in hole 77/8” PDC bit / mud motor / 20 6” drill collars and 2 jts 4 1% “ drill pipe
Pult out of hole with free point tool and pick up back off tool. Ran in hole to 5180 ft, and could not
Get to bottom of fishing tools, Pull out of hole and check tool had bent rod on bottom of tool. Rig
Up new bottom on back off tool and run back in hole to 5216 fi..Rotate pipe 2 % turns to left.
Back off at bottom of fishing tools @ 5216 ft.
04:00 06:00 2.0 Trip out of hole with fishing tools
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 [ Hrs Trip Bit # Wt 9.9 No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin & 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size Vis | 30 3213 ¥
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg WL 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type Gels
Press 1600 Hrs Drlg Out Qil
In Solid
Ftg PH
Bit Wt
Total
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Date 8-25-06 | Report No 36 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell [
Operator: EI Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21 '
Contractor; United Drilling . Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth - 5935 | Ft.Cut none Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report TIME jarring on fish
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 09:30 35 ‘Wait on fishing tools
09:30 14:30 5.0 Pick up fishing tools and trip in hole
14:30 18:00 3.5 Jar on fish make 3 * after jarring 3.5 hrs continue jarring on fish / in hole with Screw in sub/
X-over sub / bumper sub / Jars
18:00 06:00 i2.0 Ceontinue jarring on fish very little movement getting good jar action total movement 12-14 ©
Note: have jarred on fish for 15.5 hrs getting good jar action from jars. Movement has been
Very little (12-14 inches ) will continue jarring.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No, 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 3 Wt 9.9 No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev,
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 77/8 Vis | 30 1 Screw in sub | 4.25 3213 ¥
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL 1 X-over sub 1.43 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type pDC Gels i Bumper sub | 8,27
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Oil i Hyd. Jar £2.90
In 2720 Solid
Fig 780 PH
Bit Wt | 8-12K
Total 26.85
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Date 8-23-06

| Report No 34

I Reported by; Curtis Bagwell

72

Operator: El Paso Nafural Gas Company

Woll Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

-

Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County; Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 5935 | Ft.Cut 582 fi Formation sand Tops New Form:
Activity at Report TIME  Working stuck pipe
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation

From To Time
06:00 11:00 5.0 Drill from 5353° to 5524° (171 */5 hrs. /34.2 FPH)
1E:00 12:30 0.5 Survey @ 5520’ survey did not take
12:30 23:30 11.0 Drill from 5524 * to 5936 ¢ (412’ / 11.0 hrs. / 37.5 FPH )
23:30 00:30 1.0 Work on rotary chain circulate and work pipe. Pipe stuck at 5935’
00:30 06:00 5.5 Work stuck pipe / lost 70 bbls mud/ pump LCM ( 10 sacks mic.fiber /10 sacks hulls with

30 gals surfdrill and 30 gals, Petrolube / have good circ but will not rotate or move up or down

Stuck with Kelly down to bushings.

Motor 93.5 hrs

Bit /2688 /81 hrs/33.2

Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No,1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 3 Wt 9.9 No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg 7 7/8 Vis 30 1 Bit (PDC) 1.0 3213 W
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Reed WL 1 Mud Motor | 26.58 | 3477 3
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels 20 | 67 DC’s 611.82
Press 1000 Hrs Drig Qil
2720 Solid
780 PH
Bit Wt | 8-12K
Total 639.40
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Date 8-24-06 | Report No 34 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell [
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21 -~
Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal [ State: Arizona
Depth 5935 | Ft.Cut none Formation Tops New Form;
Activity at Report TIME  wait on fishing tools
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 08:00 2.0 Work stuck pipe
08:00 08:30 0.5 Pump 1,000 gals diesel and spot from bottom to top of drill collars
08:30 10:30 2.0 Wait on diesel to penetrate around stuck pipel0:
10:30 18:00 7.5 Gave' diesel 2 hrs attempt to pull pipe can not rotate or move pipe have full circulation work pipe
Mix 40 bbl sweep @ 140 vis. Pump across collars while working pipe woulid not move,
18:00 20:30 2.5 Work stuck pipe while waiting on pipe recovery unit
20:30 23:30 3:0 Pipe recovery unit on location .remove neck on top of swivel rig up Rotary wireline and run in

Hole to get free point . freepoint at 5527° in 6” drili collars. Pull out of hole lay out free point

Tool and pick up back off tool. Run in hole back pipe at 5216° 2 jts 4 ¥ drill pipe above drill collars

Pull out of hele and lay down tools and rig down and release Rotary Wireline

23:30 02:30 3.0 Trip out of hole with drill pipe lay out botton jt
02:30 03:30 1.0 Replace neck on swivel make up Kelly hose
03:30 06:00 2.5 Wait on fishing tools

Fish in hole; 7 7/8 PDC bit / Weatherford motor/ 20 —6” drill collars / 2 jts 4 ¥ “ drill pipe

Bit: 2688 ft / 81 hrs /33.2 ft per hr.

Motor : 93,5 hrs

Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No.1 | No.2 [ Hrs Trip Bit # 3 Wt 3.9 No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St, | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 778 Vis |30 1 | Bit (PDC) 1.0 3213 ¥
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL 1 Mud Motor | 26.58 | 3477’ 3k
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels 20 | 6”DCs 611.82
Press 1000 Hrs Drig Out Oil

In 2720 Solid

Fig 780 PH

Bit Wt | 8-12K

Total 639.40
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Date 8-22-06 ] Report No 33 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell /

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No; 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth 5353’

| Ft.Cut 648°

Formation anhy

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report TIME Drilling ahead

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 08:30 2.5 Trip in hole with motor and 7 7/8” PDC bit
08:30 09:00 0.5 Rig service
09:00 06:00 21.0 Drill from 4705 * to 5353’ (648’ / 21.0 hrs / 30.8 FPH )
648° /21 hrs / 30.8 FPH
Bit: 2106 ft/ 65.5 hrs /32,2 FPH average
Motor : 72 hrs
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. ! | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 3 Wi 10.3 | No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X1i6 | Hrs Drlg Size 778 Vis | 30 1 Bit (PDC) 1.0 3213 W
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL 1 Mud Motor | 26.58 | 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels 20 | 6”DC’s 611.82
Press 1000 Hrs Drig Out Qil
In 2720 Solid
Ftg 2106 PH
Bit Wt | 8-12K
Total 639.40
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Date 8-21-06 | Report No 32 ! Reported by: Curtis Bagwell T
Operator; El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Confractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal , State: Arizona
Depth 4705 ¢ l Ft.Cut 92° Formation anby Tops New Form:
Activity at Report TIME Trip in hole after cutting core # 11
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 07:00 1.0 Drill from 4613’ to 4645
07.00 09:00 20 Circulate bottoms up to recover sample
09:00 10:30 1.5 Survey @ 4645 bad reading new clock not working
10:30 13:30 3.0 Trip out of hole to core
13:30 15:00 1.5 Lay out motor and bit pick up core barrel lay out steel barrel and pick aluminum barrel
15:00 15:30 0.5 Rig service
15:30 19:00 3.5 Trip in hole with core barrel to cut core # 11
19:00 23;00 4,0 Cut core from 4645’ to 4705’ core # 11
23:00 02;30 35 Trip out of hole with core
02:30 063:30 1.0 Recover core # 11 from barrel and stand back core barrel in derrick
03:30 06:00 2.5 Jet cutting from shaker pit and start in hole with motor and bit
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit# 3 Wt 9.9 No | Description | Length | Depth Deyv.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 78 Vis 30 1 Bit (PDC) 1.0 3213 w
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL 1 Mud Motor | 26,58 | 3477’ 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type FDC Gels 20 [ 6”°DC’s 611.82
Press 1000 His Drlg Out Oil

In 2720 Solid

Fig 780 PH

Bit Wt | 8-12K

Total 639.40
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Date 8-20-06

| Report No 31

Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

933 __
=

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No; 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth 4613

| Ft.Cut 302

Formation Salt

Tops New Form;

Activity at Report TIME Drilling ahead

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 15:00 9.0 Rig repairs working on sprocket / guards / install chain / install flow line removed to get to
Sprocket / secure drill line after replacement /
15:00 18:00 3.0 Start in hole with PDC bit and motor spinning chain broke make repair
18:00 22:00 4.0 Trip in hole pick up Kelly and brake circulation
22:00 02:30 4.5 Drill from 4311° to 4550° (239 /4,5 hrs / 53.1 FPH)
02:30 04:00 1.5 Circulate bottoms up to get samples
04:00 06:00 2.0 Drill from 4550 to 4613” (63 /2 hrs /31,5 FPH)
Note : weight on bit 10-12 K / 50-52 SPM / 30 rpm rotary / rpm at bit 137
NOTE ; TOTAL RIG REPAIR TIME - 64.5 HRS
BIT —43.5 HRS.
MOTOR---48 HRS
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 3 Wt 10.0 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | HrsDrlg Size 77/8 Vis |30 1 | Bit(PDC) 1.0 3213 W
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL | 36.8 1 Mud Motor | 26.58 | 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type FDC Gels 20 | 6”DC’s 611,82
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Oil
In 2720 Solid | 12.5
Ftg 780 PH 7.0
Bit Wt | 8-12K | chlor | 210000
Total 639.40
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Date 8-19-06 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell —

| Report No 30

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor; United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth 4311

| Ft.Cut

Formation

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report TIME--- Rig repairs working on sprocket

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 06:00 24 Rig repairs work on replacing sprocket on chain drive off engine had to-cut out chain guard and
Attempt to install sprocket would not fit work to get right size to fit shaft.
Rig repairs 55.5 hrs. total as to date
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 }{ No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 3 Wt 9.9 No [ Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 77/8 Vis |30 1 | Bit{PDC) 1.0 3213 ¥
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Miyg Reed WL 1 | Mud Moter | 26.58 | 3477’ 3k
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels 20 | 6”DC’s 611.82
Press 1000 Hirs Drlg Out Oil
In 2720 Solid
Ftg 780 PH
Bit Wt | 812K
Total 639.40
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Date 8-18-06 | Report No 29 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell o
Operator; El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 4311 [ Ft.Cut NONE | Formation anby Tops New Form:
Activity at Report TIME Rig repairs working chain drive sprockets
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 06:00 24 Rig repairs working on drive sprockets Parts to arrive this a AM repairs early afterncon possibile
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 3 Wt 9.9 No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev,
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 778 Vis 30 1 Bit (PDC) 1.0 3213 %"
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL i | Mud Motor | 26.58 | 3477’ 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels 20 | 6”DC’s 611.82
Press 1000 Hirs Drlg Out Oil
In 2720 Solid
Fig 780 PH
Bit Wt | 8-12K
Total 639.40
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Date 8§-17-06

| Report No 28

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth 4311°

| Ft.Cut 60 fi.

Formation Salt

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Tme : Rig repairs remove and replace main sprocket on drve to draw works

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 07:00 1.0 Circulate bottoms up
07:00 11:00 4.0 Trip out of hole
11:00 11:30 0.5 Rig service
11:30 15:00 35 Lay out motor and PDC bit run in hole with core barrel
15:00 17:00 2.0 Cut core from 4251 to 4311’
17:00 22:30 5.5 Trip out of hole with core barrel retrive core from barrel and lay out same
22:30 06:00 7.5 Rig repairs remove guards on chain sprockets
Note: Rig repairs shut down drilling operations at 10:00 PM until repairs completed parts
Being shipped from Hobbs NM. Old part will be removed and delivered to machine shop
And be rebuilt. Unknown time repairs completed estimate 24 hrs,
Bit # 3--- 37 hrs
Motor --- 40 hrs
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit# 3 Wt 9.9 No | Description | Length | Depth Deyv.
Lin & 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 77/8 Vis 30 | Bit (PDC) 1.0 3213 ¥
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL i Mud Motor | 26.58 | 3477 3k
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels 20 | 6”DC’s 611.82
Press 1000 Hrs Drig Qut Qil
in 2720 Solid
Fig 780 PH
BitWt | 8-12K
Total 639.40
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Date 8-16-06 | Report No 27 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell e
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal 1 State: Arizona
Depth 42501t | Ft.Cut -165ft Formation Sait Taops New Form:

Activity at Report TIME Dirilling with motor and PDC bit

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 07:00 1.0 Circ. Bottoms up clean hole to trip out of hole
07:00 08:00 1.0 ‘Rig Repair
08:00 12:00 4.0 Trip out of hole
12:00 16:00 4.0 Rig service Lay out motor / pick up core barrel and run in hole to cut core
16:00 17:.00 1.0 Cut core from 4088 to 4148’
[7:00 21;00 4:0 Trip out of hole with core
21:00 22:00 1.0 Remove core from barrel and lay out / set core barrel back in derrick
22:00 02:30 4.5 Trip in hole with motor and PDC bit
02:30 06:00 35 Dril from 4148" to 4250 * (102 ¢ /3.5 hrs / 29.1 FPH ) 10K WOB / 52 SPM / 30 RPM rotary
136 RPM at bit
Bit#3 37 hrs
Motor -- 40 hrs
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 3 Wi 9.9 No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin & St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 778 Vis 30 i Bit (PDC) 1.0 3213 "
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mig Reed WL 1 Mud Motor | 26.58 | 3477’ 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels 20 | 6" DC’s 611.82 | 3666 2.0
Press 1000 Hrs Drlg Out Qil 3917 1.75
In 2720 Solid
Ftg 780 PH
BitWt | 8-12K
Total 639,40
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Date 8-15-06 | Report No 26 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell o

Operator:  El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor; United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth 4085

| Ft.Cut 525 Formation

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report TIME Drilling ahead

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 07:30 1.5 Lay out core # 8
07:30 10:30 3.0 Work on rig ( chain from draw works to rotary table) Rig service
10:30 12:00 1.5 Jet sand trap and first pit clean cuttings and sand
12:00 15:30 3.5 Stand back core barrel pick up motor and PDC bit make up and trip in hole
15:30 16:00 0.5 Pick up Kelly brake circ. And tag bottom
16:00 18:00 2.0 Drill from 3560 . to 3648 fi. (88’ / 2 hrs / 44 FPH) 50 SPM 8-12K on bit 30 rotary
18:00 18:30 0.5 Drili from 3648 to 3666’
18:30 19:00 0.5 Survey @ 3666° 2 degrees
19:00 *00:00 5.0 Drill from 3666’ to 3917° (251" / 5 hrs / 50.2 FPH) 50 SPM / 8-12k / Rotary .137 RPM at bit )
60:00 00:30 0.5 Survey @ 3917’ 1% degree
00:30 06:00 5.5 Drill from 3917 fi to 4085 ft, (168 fi /5.5 hrs / 30.5 FPH)
Next core @ 4300 ft, core #9
Bit #3/33.5 hours 1365 ft. / 40.7 FPH
Motor # 1
8-13-06 --- 12.5
8-14-06 --- 10
8-15-06 ---- 13
Total hrs, -- 35.5 hrs
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 [ No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 3 Wt 9.9 No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin & 8t, | 6X16 | 6X16 | HrsDrlg Size 77/8 Vis |30 [ | Bit(PDC) 1.0 3213 V2N
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mfg Reed WL 1 Mud Motor | 26,58 | 3477° 34
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels 20 | 6°DC’s 611.82
Press 1000 Hrs Drig Out Oii
in 2720 Solid
Ftg 780 PH
Bit Wt | 8-12K
Total 639.40




Date 8-14-06

[ Report No 25

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

935
=

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor; United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth 3560

| Ft.Cut 253

Formation anby

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time trip cut of hole with core

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 06:30 0.5 Survey @ 3231° % degree
06:30 11:30 5.0 Drill from 3307 to 3414° ( 107 /5 hrs/21.4 FPH)
11:30 12:00 0.5 Rig service
12:00 15:00 3.0 Drill from 3414’ to 3500° (86 ° / 3 hrs /28.6 fph)
15:00 16:30 1.5 Circulate and run survey @ 3477 3 2 degree (Survey tool not working right United to bring
' New tool to check too giving wide range of readings will run survey when back drilling)
16:30 19:30 3.0 Trip out of hole to run core
19:30 23:30 4.0 Trip in hole with core barrel to cut core at 3500 fi.
23:30 03:00 3.5 Cut core at 3560° to 3560 &.
03:00 06:00 3.0 Trip out of hole with core
Talley out of hole check ok
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 4 Wt 9.9 No | Description | Length | Depth Deyv,
Lin & 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | HrsDrlg Size 77/8 Vis |30 1 Bit (PDC) 1.0 3213’ W
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mig Reed WL 1 Mud Motor | 26.58 | 3477 3%
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels 20 | 6”DC’s 611.82
Press 1600 Hrs Drlg Out 0il

In 2720 Solid

Fig 780 PH

BitWt | 8-12K

Total 639.40
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I Report No 24

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

923
=

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinai

| State: Arizona

Depth 3307 | ¥t.Cut 587 Formation anhy Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time Drilling ahead
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 08:00 2.0 Trip in hole brake circulation had 5 f. fill
08:00 09:00 1.0 Drili core from 2660’ to 2720’ core # 7
09:00 11;30 2.5 Trip out of hole with core
11:30 13:00 1.5 Lay out core # 7
13;00 14:00 1.0 Lay out 7 7/8 bit and lay out stab. Pick up 2.9 mud motor and 7 7/8 Reed PDC bit dressed with
3-15/3-12 nozzles
14:00 16:30 2.5 Trip in hole
16:30 17.00 0.5 Survey @ 2554’ 2 ¥ degrees belive survey not accurate will re- survey
17:00 19:00 2.0 Tag bottom brake circulation and drill from 2720° to 2818’ making adjustments on wt/ pump rate /
Rotary speed
19:00 19:30 0.5 Survey @ 2818 Y depree ( survey @ 2554 not correct )
19:30 06:00 10.5 Drill from 2818’ to 3307° (489’ /10.5 hrs 46.6 FPH) WOB 8-10 /motor RPM 102 / rotary 35 RPM
Total RPM 137
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 4 Wt 10.3 | No | Description | Length | Depth Dev,
Lin & St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 778 Vis | 30 i Bit (PDC) | 1.0 2554 2.5
SPM 50 Hrs Misc Mifg Reed WL 1 Mud motor | 26.58 | 2818 S
GPM 353 Hrs DW Type PDC Gels 20 | DC’s 611.82
Press 950 Hrs Drig Qut il
In 2720 Solid
Fig 587 PH
Bit Wt | 6-10
Total 639.40
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Date 8-12-06 | Report No 23 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell P

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 2660 | Ft.Cut 100° Formation Tops New Form;
Activity at Report Time Trip in hole to cut core @ 2660’ to 2720°
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 08:00 2.0 Trip out of hole with core
08:00 10:00 2.0 Lay out core from 2500” to 2560° / Rig service
10:00 12:30 2.5 Trip in hole to 2560’
12:30 14:00 1.5 Work on shaker (motor burned out) circ and rotate pipe while working on shaker
14:00 20:00 6.0 Stuck pipe could not rotate / circulate / Pull 65K over string would not move attempt to work down
As we were 15 fi. off bottom would not move. (stuck at 2545”) Pulled to 65 K over siring wt.
And wait for 20 min. wt dropped to 40K over string wt of 75K . pick up to 65K over string w.
Had movement pulled up came free. Circulate and rotate pipe for 30 min and pulled up to 1600’
Inside surface pipe. Make repairs to shaker and repack swivel
20:00 00:00 4.0 Drill from 2560° to 2660°
00:00 01:00 1.0 Circulate hole clean
01:00 06:00 6.0 Trip out of hole / start back in hole with core barrel to cu t core at 2660 to 2720’
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hirs Trip Bit # 3 Wt No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin&St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 77/8 Vis i | Bit 95
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg Smith WL 1 Core bbl, 32.00
GPM Hrs DW Type miltooth | Gels 1 | Corebbl 3241
Press Hrs Drlg Out Qil 1 Jar 7.62
In 1622 Selid I X-over 1.53
Fig PH 19 | 6°DC’s 612,14
Bit Wt
Total 686.65
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Date 8-11-06

| Report No 22 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

P

Operator:  El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22 County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth 2552°

| F.Cut 212 Formation SALT Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time Trip out of hole with core

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 7:30 L5 Trip out of hole with bit
07:30 09%:30 2.0 Lay out core change out aluminum inter barrel to steel barrel
09:30 11:30 2.0 Trip in hole to cut core
11:30 12:30 1.0 Cut core from 2340 to 2400 fi,
12:30 14:30 2.0 Trip out of hole with core
14,30 16:00 1.5 Lay out core from barrel and rig service
16:00 20:00 4.0 Trip in hole
20:00 22:00 2.0 Drill from 2300 to 2500 ft. { 100 fi. /2 hrs / 50 FPH)
22:00 23:00 1.0 Circulate hole clean bottoms up
23:00 01:30 2.5 Trip out of hole
01:30 04:00 25 Lay out bit and pick up core barrel
04:00 05:00 1.0 Cut core from 2500 fi. to 2560 .
05:00 06:00 1.0 Trip out of hole with core
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Driiling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.I | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 3 Wit No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& St. {1 6X16 | 6X16 | HrsDrig Size 77/8 Vis 1 Bit .95
SPM Hirs Misc Mfg Smith WL 1 Core bbi. 32.00
GPM Hrs DW Type miltooth | Gels 1 Core bbl 3241
Press Hrs Drlg Out Oil i Jar 7.62
In 1622’ Solid 1 X-over 1.53
Fig PH 19 | 6" DC’s 612,14
Bit Wt
Total 686.65
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Date 89-10-06

| Report No 21 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 2340 | Ft.Cut 260 Formation salt Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 07:00 1.0 Change out core barrel
07:00 09:00 2.0 Trip in hole with bit
09:00 09:30 0.5 Brake circulation
09:30 12:00 2.5 Drill from 2080 to 2181” ( 101 f./2.5/40 FPH )
12:00 13:30 L5 Circulate and rig service / hold safety meeting
13:30 15:30 2.0 Trip out of hole
15:30 18:00 2.5 Pick up core barrel and trip in hole to core
18:00 18:30 0.5 Finish trip in hole
18:30 20:30 2.0 Core from 2180 to 2240°
20:30 22:30 2.0 Trip out of hole with core
22:30 23:00 0.5 Stand back core barrel in derrick
23:00 02:00 3.0 Trip in hole with bit
02:00 04:30 2.5 Drill from 2240 to 2340 ft.
04:30 (5:30 1.0 Circ, And run survey @ 2340° ¥ degree
05:30 06:00 0.5 Start out of hole to core
Cut 260 ft ( drill and core ) 7 hrs drilling time 37.1 FPH
12.5 hrs trip time
7 hrs drill time
4.5 hrs circulate / survey / rig service
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit# 3 Wit 9.9 No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev,
Lin & St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 778 Vis |30 I | Bit 95 2340 Yo
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg Smith WL |43 1 Core bbl, 32.00
GPM Hrs DW Type miltcoth | Gels | 1/1 1 | Corebbl 32.41
Press Hrs Drig Out Oil i Jar 7.62
In 1622’ Solid | 11 1 | X-over 1.53
Fig PH 10 19 1 6°DC’s 612.14
Bit Wt
Total 686.65
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Date 8-9-06 | Report No 20 [ Reported by: Curtis Bagwell S
Operator:  El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Confractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal [ State: Arizona
Depth 2030’ | Ft.Cut 220° Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time Laying out core # 3
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 06:30 0.5 Finsh trip out of hole
06:30 07:00 0.5 Pick up coring tool
07:00 09:00 2.0 Trip in hole to core
09:00 10:30 1.5 Cur core from 1860’ to 1920 core # 2
10:30 12:30 2.0 Trip out of hole with core #2
12:30 14:30 2.0 Lay out core # 2 and set back core tools in derrick pick up bit / Rig service
14:30 16:30 2.0 Trip in hole
16:30 19:30 3.0 Drill from 1920” to 2020° (100 ft. /3 hrs / 33.3 FPH)
19:30 20:30 1.0 Circulate hole clean
20:30 23:00 25 Trip out of hole toc core lay out bit pick up core barrels
23:00 | 01:.00 2.0 Trip in hole to cut core # 3
01:00 03:30 2.5 Coring cut 60 ft. core from 2020 to 208(0°
03:30 05:00 1.5 Trip out of hole
05:00 06:00 1.0 Lay outcore #3
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No. ! | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit# 3 Wt No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& St. [ 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 77/8 Vis 1 Bit 95
SPM Hrs Misc Mfy Smith Wi, i Core bbl, 32.00
GPM Hrs DW Type | miltooth | Gels 1 | Core bbl 3241
Press Hrs Drlg Out il 1 Jar 7.62

In 1622’ Solid 1 X-over 1.53

Ftg PH 19 | 6" DC’s 612,14

Bit Wt

Total 686.65
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Date 8-8-06 | Report No 19 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell -
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County; Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 1860 | Fr.Cut 238 Formation Tops New Form;
Activity at Report Time
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 7:30 1.5 Finish jetting out reserve pit. Change suction lines on pumps and displace fresh water mud in pits
With 10 # brine  Safety meeting discuss laying out core
07:30 09:00 1.5 Drill from 1622° to 1700’
06:00 130 L5 Circulate and run chlorides on brine water checked 220,000
10:30 12;30 2,0 Trip out of hole to cut cores
12:30 14:30 2.0 Brake out 7 7/8 “ bit strap and caliper core tools and pick up / make up to core
14:30 17:30 3.0 Trip in hole to core
17:30 18.30 1.0 Cut core from 1700° to 1760° (60’ / 1.0 hrs / 60 FPH )
18:30 19.30 1.0 ‘Frip out of hole with core
19:30 23:00 1.5 Lay out core / remove from core barrel and place on pipe racks record and box
23:00 01:30 2.5 Trip in hole with 7 7/8 bib to drill
01:30 04:00 2.5 Drili from 1760’ to 1860° (100 * /2.5 hrs / 40 FPH)
04:00 04:30 0.5 Circulate hole clean bottoms up
04:30 06:00 1.5 Trip out of hole to pick up core bharrel
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit# 3 Wt No | Description | Length | Depth Dev,
Lin & St. { 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 77/8 Vis 1 Bit 95
SPM Hrs Misc Mfyp Smith WL I Core bbl, 32.00
GPM Hrs DW Type miltooth | Gels 1 | Core bbi 32.41
Press Hrs Drlg Out 0il 1 Jar 7.62

In 1622’ Solid 1 X-over 1.53

Ftg PH 19 [6”DC’s 612.14

Bit Wt

Total 686.65
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Date 8-7-06

’ Report No 18

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

o
[J

Operator: ElI Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County: Pinal

| State: Arizona

Depth 1622

| Ft.Cut Formation

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time Jet out fresh water mud in reserve pit

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 09:30 3.5 Drill cement and float shoe
09:30 13:30 4.0 Circulate bottoms up / rig service and rig repairs
13:30 16:00 2.5 Trip out of hole lay out 2- 8 * driil collars and centerpunch
16:00 18:00 2.0 Cut off conductor pipe
18:00 22:00 4/0 Weld well head on 13 3/8 “ surface pipe
22:00 00:00 2.0 Nipple up BOP
00:00 02:00 2.0 Trip in hole with 7 7/8 * bit
02:00 02:30 0.5 Test BOP
02:30 06:00 3.5 Rig up to jet fresh water mud out of reserve pit and jet same using fresh water to jet
Note: switch from fresh water mud to brine water mud will remove fresh water mud from
Reserve pit to prevent brine contamination
Bit #3 7 7/8 * Smith type XR+ serial # YE3207 3-14 jets in at 1622°
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 3 Wt No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Iis Drlg Size 7 7/8 Vis 1 7 7/8” bit
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg Smith WL
GPM Hrs DW Type miltooth | Gels
Press Hrs Drlg Out 0il
In 1622 Solid
Fig PH
Bit Wt
Total
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Date 8-6-06 | ReportNo 17 Reported by: Curtis Bagwell A
Operator:  El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 1575 I Ft.Cut 155 cmf. | Formation cmi. Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time Drill out cement after running and cementing casing
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 18:00 12.0 Wait on cement / working on rig change out bearings on cat head shaft and repair chains / Ran temp.
Survey { Southwest Exploration Services ) to locate top of cement,
18:00 22:00 4.0 Work on rig complete installing bearings and replace shaft hook up cat head
22:00 00:30 2.5 Pick up and run in hole with 12 %4 “ X 7 7/8 “ center punch tag top of cement at 1420 ft,
00:30 01:30 1.0 Rig pumps to get suction from fresh water in reserve pit to drill cement and jet cellar
01:30 06:00 4.5 Drill cement from 1420 ft. to 1575 Drill 155 fi. cement Drill float collar @ 1557’
Total 24
Bit 12 %4 “ X 7 7/8 “ centerpunch
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 2 Wt No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin & St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size C/P Vis 1 12 % X77/8
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg DH WL centerpunch | 4.67
GPM Hrs DW Type centerpun [ Gels 2 8” DC’s 60.35
Press Hrs Drlg Out il 1 X-over sub 1.00

In 14247 Solid 20 | 6, DC’s 612,14

Fig PH

Bit Wt

Total 678.16
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Date 8-5-05 | Report No 16 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell B
Operator: Kl Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 1602 i Ft.Cut Formation Tops New Form;

Activity at Report Time Wait on cement and empty pits to change out mud to brine mud

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 07:30 15 Trip out of hele to run 13 3/8 * casing
07:30 08:00 0.5 Rig up Bull Rogers casing equipment and hold safety meeting (Fl1 Paso safety orientation}}
08:00 12:30 4.5 Run 13 3/8” casing ( 13 3/8 ** 54.50# J-55 /STC ) to 1604.24 /KR )
12:30 13:00 0.5 Rig Down Casing crew
13:00 14:00 1.0 Rig up Halliburton hold Safety Meeting with rig crew
14:00 17:00 3.0 Cement surface ( pump 10 bbls fresh water spacer / lead sturry 440 sacks San Juan cement /
12.5 PPG /175 bbls / Tail cement 440 sacks G cement 15.2 PPG 99 bbls / displace with 240 bbls
Fresh Water mud / Cement to surface after 200 bbls flow lines plugged off cement coming over
Bell nipple slow rate from 6 BPM to 3 BPM cement coming over bell nipple slow to 1.5 BPM
Lost returns with 10 bbls flush to pump brought rate back to 6 BPM no returns shut down
With 4 bbls under displacement pressure dropped to zero psi from 100 psi.
17:00 18:00 1.0 Rig down Halliburton rig down flow line clean lines from well to tanks jet shaker pit and cellar
18:00 19:00 1.0 Center casing in hole / waif on cement
19:00 02:00 7.0 Jet fresh water mud out of mud tanks get ready to fill with 10 # brine waiting on cement
02:00 06:00 4.0 Working on rig ( remove bearings on cat head and rotary drive Waiting on cement
Cement job complete @ 17:30 (5:30 PM ) wait on cement 24 hrs / 17:30 8-6-06
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.! | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wt No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size Vis 1
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg WL
GPM Hrs DW Type Gels
Press Hrs Drlg Out il
In Solid
Fig PH
Bit Wt

Total
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EL Paso Natural Gas %

Ariz Gas Storage
#1

APl Well No.:

August 2,2006
Pima

13 3/8 Surface

Customer Representative:
Greg Gettman
Halliburton Operator:
Bruce Astley
Ticket No.:

4542513




SALES OR™ ~ NUMBER TICKET DATE
JOB SUMMARY 45, A3 August 2,2008
REGICN KWA | COUNTRY BDA /STATE COUNTY
NORTH AMERICA ROCKY MOUNTAIN AZ Pima_
HBU K/ EMPL# HES EMPLOYEE NANE TSl DEPARTMENT
183099 Bruce Astley ZONAL ISOLATION
TOGATION COMPANY. CUSTOMER REPTPTIONE
FARMINGTON, NM EL Paso Natural Gas Greg Gettman
TiCKET AMGUNT — WELL TYPE FUTTU T
GAS
WELL | OCATION DEPARTMENT SAP BCMB NLBIBER JOB TYPE
_ZONAL ISOLATION 10003 . 13 3/8 Surface
LEASE NAME Wall No. SEC/ TWP RNG
Ariz Gas Storage
HE & EMP MAME / EMP # / (EXPOSURE HGURS) HRS HRS HRS HRS
B. Astley 183099
R.Pfiefer/391069
D.Core/335668
J.Egleheart/387932 __It
H.E.S. UNIT #5/ ({8 /T MLES) RITMLES R/THELES RiTWAES RITHAES
10286361 10793626
10251407
10804563/10784053
10724579/10713212
Form. Name Type
Form. Thickness From To Called Out On Location Job btarted Job Completed
Packer Type Set Af Date 812106 8/3j06 874105 814106
Bottom Hole Temp. Pressure
R rD . Total Depth Time 7:30 16:00 15:10 17:26
. lools and Accessories : ' “Well bata-.. . SR
Type and Size Oty Make Casing NewlUsed | WWeight |Size  Grade] EFrom To Max. Allow
Fioat Collar Surface New 54.5 1338 0 1,602
Float Shoe ntermediate New
Centralizers Long_String
Top Plug Tubing
Limit Clamp Drill Pipe
BASKET Open Hole Shots/Fi.
ingert Fioat Perforations
Guide Shoe Perforations
Weld-A_ - OV TQ%I : N
st iMateralg s sy casn e Honrs O Loeation. ... Operaling
WMod ivne ﬂ'ao%ng_iw [b/Gall [ Dale Hours
Disp. Fluid H20 Density __ 8.33 Lb/Gal 814106 6.00 8/2/06 2.00 SEE JOB LOG
Prop, Type Size Lb
Prop. Type Size Lb
Acld Type Gal. %
Acid Type Gal. %
Surfactant Gal. In
NE Agent Gal. in
Fluid Loss Gal/Lb In
Gelling Agent GaliLb In
Fric. Red. GaliLb In B
Breaker GallL.b In Total:i:]  6.00 Total -] 2.00
Blocking Agent Gal/Lb
Perfpac Balis Qty. Hydraulic Horsepower
Other Ordered Avail. Used
KCL substityle .-Average RatesinBEM:
Other Treating Disp. 0vera|l
Other :-Cement LeftinPipe
Other Feet 4200 Reason Shoe Joint
S Gl e e L CementData i
Stage | Sacks Cement Bulk/Sks Addilives WIRg. Yield Lbs/Gal
1 440 San Juan Bulk 12.50 2.24 12.1
440 G Bulk 15.20 1.27 58

Circulating
Breakdown
Lost Retumns
Cmt Rirn#Bbl
Average

Shut In: Instant

———

Displacement

ype:
Pad:Bbl -Gal
CaleDispBbl — 240 |

Actual Disp.
Disp:Bbl-Gal

240,

I
Maximum Load & Bkdn Gal - BBI
Excess /ReturnGal BBI
Actual TOC Surface Cale. TOC:
Frac. Gradient _ Treatment:  Gal - BBl
5 Min. 5 Min Cement Slurry Gal - BB}
Total Volume Gal - BBl

Tac-Kin

- — [FracRmg%eg.
THE INFORMATION STATED HEREIN IS CORRECT

CUSTOMER REPRESENTATIVE

TJFracRIng#3~

 Frac Ring #£4.

SIGNATURE




i - Trq_‘ TICKET DATE
L. TCN JOBLOG 4542613 August 2,2006
REGION NWA / COUNTRY BOA fSTATE COUNTY
NORTH AMERICA LAND ROCKY MOUNTAIN AZ Pima
MBUIDEMPL HES EMPLOYEE NAME PSL DEPARTMENT
| 183099 Bruce Astley ZONAL ISOLATION i
LOCATION COMPANY CUSTOMER RE® { PHONE
FARMINGTON, NM EL Paso Natural Gas Greg Gettman "
TICKET AMOUNT, WELL TYPE AFTOVAF
|| 02 GAS |
“ WELL LOCATION DEPARTMENT JOB PURPOSE CODE Descriplion
ZONAL ISOLATION 100603 13 3/8 Surface
TEASEWELL# Well No. SECT
Ariz Gas Storage
o] 7T B s

2-Aug 7:30 - | JOB CALLED OUT
10:00 PRE YARD SAFETY MEETING
3-Aug 156:00 ARRIVED ON LOCATION
16:00 LOCATION ASSESSMENT & SAFETY MEETING
Aud 4 14:00 SPOT AND RIG UP EQUIPMENT ON LOCATION
14:45 Safety Meeting
15:10 START job
15:10 3000 |TestLines
15:15 6 20 X 100 |H20
X
X
15:19 6 175 X 50 |Lead Sluury
15:50 6 99 X 100  |Tail Slurry
16:10 3 240 X 1500 |Displace
17:26 End Job
X
X

End Job




Job Type

CEMENT JOB SUMMARY SHEET

13 3/8 Surface

Casing
Surface
Intermediate
Production
Tubing

Drill Pipe
Open Hole

Size

Weight

Measure

Grade d Depth

CEMENT DATA

Spacer

Cement 1
Additives

Cement 2
Additives

20 Bbls H20

San Juan

Weight (ib/gal) 12.10

G

Weight (Ib/gal) 5.80

Yield (cuft/sk) 2.24

Yield (cuft/sk) 1.27

440 Sacks

Water (gal/sk) 12.50

440 Sacks

Water (gal/sk) 15.20

Displacement H20 240.00 8.33 (Ib/gal)

CEMENTING EQUIPMENT
Provider
Guide Shoe ea. Centralizers ea.
Float Shoe ea. Plug Type ea.
Float Collar ea. Packer ft.
DV Tool ft. Reftainer .
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Date 8-4-06 ] Report No 15 Reported by: Curtis Bagwell . /
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 1610 | Ft.Cut 67 Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time Trip out of hole to run casing
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
£6:00 13:00 7.0 Bit balled up with clay covered up 6 ft. on collar. Clean bit and collar and inspect bit cones tight

Teeth in good condition. Trip in hole first 677 ft of hole tight had several bridges after 677 fi.

Wash down 8 stands out of 11 going in hole ( Collars to 677 ft. ) After 677 fi. had some tight

Places / one at 970 */ 1230° / 1360’ that had to wash thru. Below 1360° hole OK.

13:00 14:30 1.5 Drill from 1543 to 1559’ drill with 10-15 K on bit

14:30 15:00 0.5 Rig service

15:00 19:00 4.0 Drill from 1559 to 1610" TD surface hole at 1610° final chlorides @ 1610 ft,

19:00 20:00 1.0 Circulate to condition: hole to log,

20:00 22:30 2.5 Trip out of hole to log Strap pipe out

22:30 00:30 4.5 Move in rig up Southwest Exploration Ser. To log well . run in hole to 1,100 ft. with logging

Tools tag and could not get any deeper. Pull out of hole pick up Sonic tools run in hole tag at

1100 ft. could not get any deeper. Pull out of hole rig down logger. Rig crew working on chain on

Draw works while logging.

00:30 | 01:00 0.5 Finish working on chain tfo trip in hole
01:00 03:30 2.5 Trip in hole . No tight places did not tag or see any indication of problems at 1100 ft,
03:30 | 05:00 1.5 Circulate condition hole to run casing
05:00 06:00 1.0 Trip out of hole to run casing
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pamp No.l | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 1 Wi 103 No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size 17.5 Vis 36 1 17.5 bit 1.60
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Smith WL |25 1 Bit sub 2.60
GPM 290 Hrs DW Type milltooth | Gels | 22/24 | 2 8” DC’s 60.35
Press 600 Hrs Drig Out 1610 Oit 1 X-over sub 1.0
In 95 Solid | 1475 | 20 | 6" DC’s 612.14
Ftg 1515 FH 8
Bit Wt | 25-30K
Total 677.69
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Date 8-3-06 | Report No 14 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona
Depth 1543 | Ft.Cut 343 Formation Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time  Trip out of hole to check bit

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 09:30 35 Flow line stopped up with gumbo clay brake out flow line and clean Work on rotary table
09:30 15:30 6.0 Drill from 1200 to 1287> ROP dropping off try different weight on bit and RPM at rotary
Could not get rate up
15:30 16:00 0.5 Pump 5 gals. Petrolube and 5 gals surfdrifl across bit to clean bit
16:00 16:30 0.5 Drill from 1287 to 1305 ¢ (18’ /0.5 hrs / 36 FPH ) rate back up
16:30 17:00 0.5 Survey @ 1274° % degree
17:00 18:00 1,0 Drill from 1305’ to 1320° (15° /1 hr / 15 FPH ) Make connection pump 5 bbls fresh water past bit17
18:00 03:30 9.5 Drill from 1320’ to 1543 (223" / 9.5 hrs / 23.5 FPH) drill rate fell off to 2-3 FPH bit torquing up
And bouncing up and down like bit locked up. Will pull out of hole to check condition of bit.
03:30 04:00 0.5 Circulate bottoms up after attempting to clean bit with Petrolube and water
04:00 06:00 2.0 Trip out of hole to check bit had drag all the way out of hole ( 5-15 K over string wt. 3
Note: After repori time bit at surface locked up cones with clay clean bit and will run back in
hole
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 1 Wi 10.4 | No | Description | Length | Depth Deyv,
Lin & 8t. | 6X16 | 6X16 | s Drlg Size 17%“ 1 Vis |48 I 17 2 “ bit 1.60 954’ 172
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Smith WL | Bit sub 2.60 1148’ 12
GPM 290 Hrs DW Type milltcoth | Gels 2 |8 DCs 60.35 | 1274’ 12
Press 600 Hrs Drlg Qut Oil 1 X-over sub 1.00
In 95’ Salid 20 | 6”DC’s 612,14
Ftg 1448 PH
Bit Wi | 25-35K
Total
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| Report No 13 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Driiling

Rig No: 22 County: Pinal | State: Arizona

Depth 12007

| Ft.Cut 620 Formation Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time Drilling ahead with 17 1 “ bit

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 14:30 8.5 Safety meeting / Drill from 580° to 739’ (159 * 7.5/ 21.2 FPH )Rig service Survey @ 708’ %~
14:30 17:30 3.0 Drill from 739" to 829" (90’ /3 hrs/ 30 FPH)
17:30 18:30 1.0 Rig Repairs /work on chain guard to cat head)
18:30 23:00 4.5 Crill from 829’ to 991’ (162 / 4.5 hrs / 36 FPH)
23:00 23:30 0.5 Survey @ 954° ¥ Degree
23:30 03:00 35 Drill from 991° to 1148* ( 157° /3.5 his / 44.8 FPH)
03:00 03:30 0.5 Survey @ 1148 / ¥ degree
03:30 06:00 2.5 Drilt from 1148 to 1200” (52° /2.5 /20.8 FPH)
Note: Casing being delivered today / Cement co. called out. / casing crew on stand by to be on
Location tonight / logging co en standby / should be at 1600° after noon / will monlitor
Chlorides today
3-2-06
4 S/W/ oA Alest wAF
/ < 20 ppa oD lo<
pud = 29.pp
- u/l %
X Z/ L
iy /0 7N /CC ( 4
# e
Klis 64 SLE
Total
Pump Record ..o Aol Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Puinp No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # 1 Wt 9.8 No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev,
Lin & St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 171/2% | Vis 40 I 17 %2 “ bit 1.60
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mig Smith WL | 316 1 Bit sub 2,60
GPM 290 Hrs DW Type MT Gels [ 12/i18 {2 | 8" DCs 60.35
Press 600 Hrs Drlg Out QOil 1 X-over sub 1.00
In 95 Solid | 11 20 | 6” DCs
Ftg 1105 PH 3.5
Bit Wt | 25/35
Total
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Date 8-1-06

[ Report No 12

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

RigNo: 22

County: Pinal | State: Arizona

Depth 580 &.

| Ft.Cut 449 &.

Formation

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time Drilling ahead

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 09:00 3.0 Start and check engines on rig and all equipment work on mouse hole
09:00 1100 2.0 Pick up and run in hole with 11 % “ magnet to 95” rotate and circulate. Trip out of hole with
Magnet had no recovery. ( fishing for angle iron dropped while running conductor pipe)
11:00 12:00 1.0 Lay out magnet and pick up used 17 % * bit
12:00 15:30 35 Trip in hole with 17 % “ bit to 95 ft. Drill 27 f. Circ. Bottoms up and trip out of hole with bit
Run in hole with 11 % “ magnet circ. On bottom and tag bottom several times,
15:30 16:60 0.5 Circulate on bottom
16:00 17:30 L5 Trip out of hole with magnet recovered fish (2” angle iron)
17:30 18:00 0.5 Lay out magnet release and load on truck for return pick up new Smith 17 % © miil tooth bit
18:00 19:00 1.0 Trip In hole with new 17 % © bit
19:00 20:30 i.5 Drill (mix gel with fresh water to increase Vis.
20.30 01:00 4.5 Drill from 131” to 308’ (177 f. / 4.0 Hrs /44.25 FPH) Survey @ 271 ft. % degee
01:00 06:00 5.0 Drill from 3068° to 580° (272 ft. / 5 Hrs / 54.4 FPH )
Note; Hole staying straight with a % degree survey at 271 f. average ROP 42.76 FPH
Rotary 70 RPM
Spud date: 7-31-06 @ 15:30 hrs
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # i Wt 8.8 No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin & St. 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size 1712 Vis 39 1 17 3 “ Bit 1.60
SPM 60 Hrs Misc Mfg Smith WL |96 1 Bit sub 2.60
GPM 60 Hrs DW Type Milltoth | Gels | 4/9 2 {8 DCs 60.35
Press 400 Hrs Drig Out Oil 1 X-over sub 1.0
In 95 Solid | 8.75
Fig PH 8.5
Bit Wt
Total
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Date 7-31-06

| ReportNo 11

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: | State: Arizona
Depth | Ft.Cut Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time Rigged up wait on diesel fuel for rig
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 15:00 2.0 Welders build manifolds for mud pump suction lines, Fill mud pits with fresh water, Hang tongs and
Finish rigging floor, Attempt to install Mouse hole stop about 4 feet high. Could not wash down,
Appears fill from dirt falling in hole has packed off. Will cut off mouse hole at bottom and drive
In to proper depth. After getting mouse hole down will wash out with Kelly and dump bagged
Cement to plug bottom and give solid bottom. Magnet to be on location early AM. Rig Out
Of diesel had load ordered but could not get in due to high water.
Note: Water over road east of rig on Shed Road To deep to cross. Have diesel ordered for AM
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wi No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | HrsDrig Size Vis 1
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg WL
GPM Hrs DW Type Gels
Press Hrs Drlg Out Qil
In Solid
Ftg PH
Bit Wt
Total
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Date 7-30-06 , Report Noi0 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell
Operator: EI Paso Natural Gas Company Weil Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No; 22 County: | State: Arizona
Depth | Ft.Cut Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time Rigging up
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 18:00 12.0 Pick up mouse hole working on pump lines / rig up floor / running electric lines / scope up

Derrick / set slide in V-door Rig 90% rigged up will have Magnet on location 06:00 Manday

To recover 2” angle iron dropped by welder while welding conductor.

Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wt No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size Vis 1
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg WL
GPM Hrs DW Type Gels
Press Hrs Drlg Out Oil

In Solid

Ftg PH

Bit Wt

Total
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Date 7-29-06 | Report No 9 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell -
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: | State: Arizona
Depth | Ft.Cut Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time Rigging up
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 18:00 12.0 Set rig mud tanks and level Set pumps build bell nipple and weld flow line nipple on bell nipple

Set generator house / fucl tank and parts house / Set water tank and dog house on top / Cat walk

In place. 75% equipment in place but not tied in. Water came up during day and started washing

Out rig road. Had 3 loads gravel delivered and front in loader, Road in bad condition at poin{ where

Water running over. Ordered 3 more loads gravel had to cancel as ditch filled up and was to

Deep to allow truck to cross. Canceled cement truck to cement anchors, Water crested about

2:00 PM and started down by 5:00 PM down enough to allow United Drilling hands to go in for

Night.

Shut down for night

Need to build manifold for mud pumps to go to mud pits. Appox. 60% rigged up

Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wt No | Description | Length | Depth | Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size Vis 1
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg WL
GPM Hrs DW Type Gels
Press " { Hrs Drlg Out Oil

In Solid

Fig PH

Bit Wt

Total
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Date 7-28-06 | Report No 8 Reported by: Curtis Bagwell —
Operator:  EI Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County; | State: Arizona
Depth | Ft.Cut Formation Tops New Form;
Activity at Report Time Rigging Up
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 6;00 12.0 Rigging up had heavy rain in morning shut down location soft . Got unit on ramps and raised
Derrick but did not scope out. Unload load of drill pipe . finish hooking up hyd. Lines on unit to
Mast . Place anchors in holes will need to cement in place. Water rising on road due to run off from
Surrounding area. May block road tonight. . Had light rain .
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.i | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wt No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St, | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size Vis 1
SPM Hrs Misc Mifg WL
GPM Hrs DW Type Gels
Press Hrs Drig Out Oil
In Solid
Fig PH
Bit Wt
Total
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Date 7-27-06

| Report No 7

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

75%
— L

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County:

| State: Arizona

Depth

| Ft.Cut

Formation

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time Rigging up

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:60 Set and level subsiructure install mast on unit and hook up hyd. Hoses and chains / spot ramps and
Back unit on ramps to substructure 98% rig on location including pumps, Have more pipe to arrive
Today.. Will have to fill in trench for mud tanks today. Had heavy rains during night with wilnd,
Tatal 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No. 1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wit No | Description | Length | Depth Dev,
Lin & St, | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size Vis 1
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg WL
GPM Hrs DW Type Gels
Press Hrs Drig Out 0il
In Solid
Ftg PH
Bit Wi
Total
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Date 7-26-06 | Report No 6 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: , State: Arizona
Depth | Ft.Cut Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time  Moving in rig
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 Unload Substructure mud tank /pipe/ Drill collars already on location / Unit and mast on location.
90% ofrig on location will stait putting things in place today. Will have to put mast back on unit
Before it can be spotted but should get tanks set and sub spotted over hole. Mud pumps to be in
Today.
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly BDeviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wit No | Description | Length { Depth | Dev.
Lin&St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size Vis 1
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg WL
GPM Hrs DW Type Gels
Press Hrs Drlg Out Oil
In Solid
Fig PH
Bit Wi
Total
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Date 7-24-06

| Report No 4

| Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

Operator:  EI Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No: 22

County:

| State: Arizona

Depth

| Ft.Cut

Formation

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time — No Activity

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 United has part of rig at Az. State line can not move on weekend will arrive on Monday
Had to remove Derrick from unit to move Unit and mast in Hobbs to be shipped Monday
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No.1 [ No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wt No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin & St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size Vis i
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg WL
GPM Hrs DW Type Gels
Press Hrs Drig Out Oil

In Solid

Ftg PH

Bit Wt

Total
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Date 7-23-06 | Report No 3 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell —
Operator: EI Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor: United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: | State: Arizona
Depth | Ft.Cut Formation "Fops New Form:
Activity at Report Time — Wait on Rig
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 Western Mud Services unload 240 sacks Gel and 50 sacks Soda Ash-—United Drilling unload
4 loads of rig. HB Rental arrived and set up office Trailer Will not have water on location untili
Monday
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation

Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit# Wit No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin&St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size Vis 1
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg WL
GPM Hrs DW Type Gels
Press Hrs Drlg Out Oil

In Solid

Ftg PH

Bit Wit

Total
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Date 7-22-06 | Report No 2 | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell —
Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21
Contractor; United Drilling Rig No: 22 County: | State: Arizona
Depth | Fe.Cut Formation Tops New Form:
Activity at Report Time -- Wait on rig
Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 United Drilling brought in one load . DH Rock Bit unload 2- 17 % “ bits / 6 — 7 7/8 * bits
112 Y% “ X 7 7/8 “ centerpunch
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wt No [ Pescription | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St. | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drig Size Vis i
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg WL
GPM Hrs DW Type Gels
Press Hrs Drlg Out Oil
In Solid
Fig PH
Bit Wit
Total
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Date 7-21-06 i Repert No | Reported by: Curtis Bagwell

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Well Name Arizona Gas Storage # 1-21

Contractor: United Drilling

Rig No; 22

County:

| State: Arizona

Depth

| Ft.Cut

Formation

Tops New Form:

Activity at Report Time --Wait on rig

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation
From To Time
06:00 Arrive at location 4 loads on location unload one load Shut down wait on rig
Total 24
Pump Record Hour Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation
Pump No.1 | No.2 | Hrs Trip Bit # Wt No | Description | Length | Depth Dev.
Lin& St, | 6X16 | 6X16 | Hrs Drlg Size Vis 1
SPM Hrs Misc Mfg WL
GPM Hrs DW Type Gels
Press Hrs Drig QOut Oil
In Solid
Ftg PH
Bit Wt
Total




AGS #1-21 Monsoon Update and PBESS Dai" Mrilling Report

Subject: AGS #1-21 Monsoon Update and PBESS Daily Drilling Report
From: "Gettman, Greg W" <Greg.Gettman@EIPaso.com> 9 78
Date: Sat, 29 Jul 2006 11:54:22 -0600 —

7/21/2006 to 7/26/2006 o
Deliver drill rig and numerous loads of associated drilling equipment (substructure, drill pipe, ceollars, mud pumps,

mud tanks, fork lifts, drilling mud, bits, trailers, efc.) to iccation.

7/27f2008 ' _ '
Set and level substructure. Reinstall mast on drilling rig and hook up hydraulic hoses and chains. Back unit on

ramps to substructure. Had heavy rain during the night.

7/28/2006
Rigging up. Had heavy rain in morning. Shut down due to soft location. Held El Paso Natural Gas Safety

Orientation. Got unit on ramps and raised derrick but did not scope out. Unload drill pipe. Fin{sh hooking up
hydraulic lines to mast. Place anchors in holes, will need to cement in place. Water rising on rig road due to
run-off from surrounding area down the McClellan wash. May block road tonight. Had light rain.

7/29/2006

The runoff from heavy rains in the Picacho Mountains on Thursday July 28 made its way down the
down local drainages to the McClellan wash and our job site cresting at approximately 2 PM on July

29M " The McClellan wash, which is just west of our site, overflowed its banks partially washing out
our rig road and overflowed La Palma Road on the opposite bank. The water has receded and the rig
road has been repaired to the point to the point we can resume rigging up. Rig up details are included in
the attached PBESS Daily Drilling Report.

The magnitude of this Monsoon storm is evidenced by the news report that Union Pacific’s rail road
tracks were washed out or damaged by high water at 16 locations along the Picacho mountain front,
Hopetully, this is the last Monsoon storm of this intensity we see on this job.




PERMIT TO DRILL

This constitutes the permission and authority from the

OilL. AND GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION,

STATE OF ARIZONA,

BLo PASCO HATURAL AR

o

issued this .~

To:
(OPERATOR)
to drill a well to be known as
ARTZORA (AR STORACE #1791
(WELL NAME)
TaS0Y BRI L OAG0Y UL
located b B, & Rl BT,
i 2 : It 8K PIRAL .
Section___“"__ Township__/ Range i . GRS County, Arizona.
wy f oA
SRRy
The of sald

Section, Township and Range is dedicated to this well.

Said well is to be drilled substantially as outlined in the attached Application and must be drilled

in full compliance with ail applicable laws, statutes, rules and regulations of the State of Arizona.

day of

SR TR v
MARGH, 2008

PERMIT

RECEIPT NO. #ti39

AP NO, Gae-l2 20009

OIL AND GAS COMMISSION

CONSERVATION

A

A
EXECUTHVE-DIREGTOR

PROGRAH ADD

By.

G716 & GAS

State of Arizona

Oil & Gas Conservation Commission

Permit to Drill

FORM NO. 27




APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR RE-ENTER

AMENDED APPLICATION TO DRILL [} RE-ENTER OLD WELL [

NAME OF COMPANY OR OPERATOR
E1 Paso Natural Gas Company

Address ' Ciy State Phone Numbar

2 North Nevada Ave Colorado Springs €0 80903 719.520.4533

Driling Contracior

United Drilling Inc

adxsss P Box 2488 Roswell, NM 88202

DESCRIPTION OF WELL AND LEASE

Federel, State or Indian Leasa Number, or ¥ fes [ease, name of lessor Wed number Efevation {ground)
Owned by £1 Paso Natural Gas . 1-21 1527"' .
Nearest distance from proposad iocation to proparty or laasa ina: Distance from buﬁonlomaddri&rg.eompteleduappﬂod—for
660' FHL well on the sama
(- none fael
Nuninfduntinloul Mumber of wells on lsase, ncluding this wel, compietad in o driling 1o this resarvoir;
234 none
mﬁmm“umm ' Name Addrass
. N/A
Well Sectiorn - Townshin - Range Dadication AA.C. R12-T-104{AX3)
P IR and 660" FWL P75 -BE,C.45.R.B. &M, N/A *
F}ddmdm&(l’wld?t,mﬂlll) : County
Stratigraphic Test Pinal

Distance in miles snd direction from nesrest lown or post offica

3 mﬂes north east of Eloy Arizona, 1/8 mile east of incorporated citylimit
Pw 8 000‘ Rohtyorclb(uloohgotary Approximats date work will stert
bondwaws . £i}ad—03/02/05 | Orvanteston Report Fling Fee of 26,00

| Amount__¢25.000- onte_ X orstisched Atiached X
Remarks

Stratigraphic test per Arizona Administrative Code, Title 12, Chapter R12-7-128
Amended Drilling Procedure is Attached

APL# 02- 0 - 20009

CERTNICATE: |, the undersigned, under the penally of psijury, slale that ] am the: Hanager’ Facili ty Planni ng of the

j]_gnsg_mlma_]_ﬁas_cgmany___ {company), and that } am authorized by sald company 1o make this report; and that this

. report was prepaned under my supervision and direction and that the facts stated thereln are trus, correct and complete to the bast of my knowisdge,

0/“1;\5}'}%([“/ "tﬁ{’WU?’/? 32~ 2006 Slgnat‘%?/ /li/ﬁ:/

Ntorfdomts 3/ g/ZéOG

ATAW, ’ :?g:m Date
Tucson, AZ B5701-1318

z
Permit Number: ’{ ‘;{;’ -5 ’ STATE OF ARIZONA
Approvai Date: L& ' &2(9(8 OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
Approved By: < { / FL/L/L»‘;Z’ : Application to Oriff or Re-enler
NOTICE: m'u‘ﬂ ﬁdﬂg in this form be m Lhat you have m:ﬂ h'ormtlon - s Flie Two Coples

O N

{Complete Raverss Side) 5/96




. "' PERMIT 933

1. Operator shall outiine on the plat the acreage dedicated to the well in compliance with A.A.C. R12-7-107.
2. Aregistered survayor shall shaw on the plat the location of the well and certiiy this Information In the space providad,
ALL DISTANCES SHOWN ON THE PLAT MUST BE FROM THE OUTER BOUNDARIES OF THE SECTION,

L

1s the operator the only owner in the dedicated acreage outlined on the platbelow? YES No _X

L

if the answer to question four is no, have the interests of all owners been consolidated by communitization agreement or otherwisa?
YES NO _% - Hanswerls yes, give type of consolidation

6. If the answer to question four s na, st all the owners and thelr respective Interests below: Operator (EPNG) is the owner o
100% of‘the surface acreage.Ownership of a portion of underlying mineral interests is

AL F!|I

7:" i o []
E1 Paso Natural Gas Company NW% + N% SW% Sec 21, T7S, RSE

G.4S.R.BAM Survey Pinal Co. AZ

— —r

CERTIFICATION

1

t

H

|

! | hereby certify that tha in/ormation aboy
: s true and completa

t knowledge and bellef,
t

|

]

1

i

g
980"

______ e — — — . &

™ 244/ zoog

e e

R LR

i
[ . i -
0 330 660 990 1320 1650 1p80 2310 2 2000 1500 1000 500 a L

ficale N,
a1i18
PROPOSED CASING PROGRAM
Size of Casing Wm Grade & Typs Top Bottom Camenting Ospths Sacka Cement Type
20" 104+ Grade B |0 120 120’ 145 sacks |Class A
13 3/8" 54 .5#| K-55 0 1600’ 1600 885 sacks | Bt Lite &

Class A




»

© ® N O as W

10.
1.

12.
13.

14,

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

EL PASO NATURAL GAS COMPANY
ARIZONA GAS STORAGE #1-21

DRILLING PROGRAM - -
a3/
Prepare the location

Drill 24 - 26" conductor hole to approx. 80 ft. ground level {GL). Run 20” conductor casing
and cement to surface. Construct cellar. (Gills Drilling)

Drill rat hole, and mouse hole according to rig contractor's specs. (Gills Drilling)
Conduct El Paso Natural Gas safety orientation '
Move in and rig up drifling rig.

Nipple up (NU) flow line from conductor pipe to rig tanks.

Fill rig tanks with water. Make up (MU) spud mud.

Pick up (PU) 17-1/2" bit and run in the hole (RIH) to approx. 80 ft GL.

Drill 17-1/2" hole to approx. 1,600 ft. GL, surveying approx. every 150 feet. Monitor the
chloride content of the drilling fluid returns. Stop drilling at the earlier of: 1) the chloride
levels in the drilling fiuid exceed 30,000 mg/l or 2) upon reaching a depth of 1,600 feet.

Conduct a wiper trip and circulate the well clean. Circulate and condition mud for logging.
Pull out of hole (POOH) laying down the bottom hole assembly (BHA).

Rig up (RU) logging company, and log well per attached logging program.
RIH and circulate and condition mud to run casing. POOH

RU casing crews. Run approx. 40 joints of 13-3/8", 54.5 Lb/ft, ST&C surface casing to
approx. 1600 ft GL. Fioat shoe and float collar (stinger type) will be bucked onto first joint of
13-3/8” casing. Fiil each joint of casing with drilling fluid as it is being run in. The
centralizers will be placed as per the attached casing program.

MU 13-3/8” ST&C cementing head and circulate well till cementing units are rigged up.
Circulate the well with the rig pumps until the cementing units are rigged up.

RU cementing company. Pressures test all cementing lines. Cement the 13-3/8" surface
casing to surface per the cementing program.

Note: From Information gathered during the drilling of the surface hole, it may become
necessary to run a cementing diverter tool and cement in two stages.

Note: Notify Steve Rauzi (520-770-3500} with the Arizona Geological Survey (Oil and
Gas Administrator) 48 hours prior to cementing,

Wait on cement (WOC) approx. 24 hours. After 6 hours of WOC, test the float equipment.
Remove the cementing head. Top off cement in the 13-3/8" x 17-1/2” annulus if necessary.
After 18 hours of WOC, remove the flow line and cut off the 20" conductor pipe. Cut (at a
pre-determined elevation) and lay down the 13-3/8" surface casing.

Weld on a temporary 13-5/8” 3M flange. Nipple up a 13-5/8" 3M by 13-5/8” 3M drilling
spool with two 4” 5M outlets. On one outlet, install a 4” HCR valve and pipe to the rig's
choke manifold. On the other outlet, install a 4" 5M by 2” 5M DSA and a bull plugged 2" 5M
Halliburton valve. Nipple up a 13-5/8" 3M annular BOP and a 13-3/8” 3M bell-nipple.
Nipple up a fill-up line and a 8” flow-line. Function-test the annular BOP.

PU 12-1/4” x 8-1/2" center punch assembly and RIH to the float collar at approx. 1560 ft.
GL. Drill out the float collar from the 13-3/8” surface casing.

ll
|

|
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20.

21.
22,

23.

24,

25,
26.

27.

28.
29,

30.

31.
32.

33.

34.
35,

36.

37.
38.

Pressure test the 13-3/8” casing (2486-psi Internal Yield Resistance) to 850-psi ~ 1 psifft
gradient (assuming 9.0 Ib/gal mud, 1600’ casing shoe (750-psi hydrostatic head) gives
1600-psi bottom hole test pressure. Confirm that bottomhole pressure does not exceed
70% of 2486 (1740-psi)) and hold for 30 minutes. Use a chart recorder to record the test
results. There shall not be more than a 10% drop in pressure. If so, then test must be
repeated,

Clean surface tanks and fill with salt saturated mud.

Orill out cement, fioat shoe and 10 ft — 15 ft of new formation. Circulate and condition the
drilling fluid. POOH.

PU 8-1/2" pilot bit and RIH to approx. 1610 ft. GL.

Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of approx. 1700 ft. GL or to a depth where the chloride
levels in thef drilling fluid exceed 200,000 mg/l. Circulate and condition mud for coring.
POCH and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4", 60 ft. conventional core barrel} and RIH.

Cut a 60 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 1700 ft. to 1760 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #1
(Cut in 3 ft sections. Pack up cores), Lay down (LD) coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 1760 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 1860 ft. GL. Circulate and condition mud for coring. POOH and rack back the
BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2” x 4”, 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH.

Cuta g0 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 1860 ft. to 1920 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #2
(Cut in 3 ft sectlons. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 1920 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 2020 ft. GL. Run a deviation survey (TOTCO). The deviation shall be kept at a
minimum and should be controlled using the BHA (stabilizer/reamer placement) and
operating parameters {(weight on bit (WOB) and rotary speed). Circulate and condition mud
for coring. POOH and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4", 60 ft. conventional core barrel} and RIH.

Cut a 60 ft,, 4” non-oriented core from 2020 ft. to 2080 ft. GL.. POOH and lay out core #3
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly,

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 2080 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 2180 ft. GL. Circulate and condition mud for coring. POOH and rack back the
BHA. -

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 47, 60 . conventional core barrel) and RIH.

Cut a 60 ft., 4” non-oriented core from 2180 fi. to 2240 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #4
(Cut in 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 2240 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 2340 ft. GL. Run a deviation survey (TOTCO). The deviatlon shall be kept at a
minimum and should be controlled using the BHA (stabilizer/reamer placement) and
operating parameters (weight on bit (WOB) and rotary speed). Circulate and condition
mud for coring. POCH and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4", 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH.

Cut a 60 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 2340 ft. to 2400 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #5
(Cut In 3 ft sectlons. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.
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39,

40.
41,

42.

43.
44,

45,
48,

47.
48,

48,

50.
51.

52,

53.
54,

55,

58,

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 2400 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 2500 ft. GL. Mud logger to take samples every 10 ft from 2400 ft to 2500 ft.
Circulate and condition mud for coring. POOH and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4", 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH.

Cut a 60 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 2500 ft. to 2560 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #6
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 2560 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 2660 ft. GL. Run a deviation survey (TOTCO). The deviation shall be kept at a
minimum and should be controlled using the BHA (stabilizer/reamer placement) and
operating parameters (weight on bit (WOB) and rotary speed). Circulate and condition
mud for coring. POOH and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 47, 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RiH.

Cut a 80 ft., 4” non-oriented core from 2660 ft. to 2720 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #7
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

Rig up mud logger.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 2720 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 3,500 ft. GL (anhydrite above claystone). Mud iogger to take samples every 10 ft
from 2720 ft to 3,500 ft. Circulate and condition mud for coring. POCH and rack back the
BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4", 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH.

Cut a 60 ft., 4” non-oriented core from 3,500 ft. to 3,560 fi. GL. POOH and fay out core #8
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 3,560 ft. GL. Drili 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 4300 ft. GL (claystone directly above the Lower Aquifer Unit). Mud logger to take
samples every 10 ft from 3,560 ft to 4300 ft (samples should be watched to ensure that the
evaporates have been fully penetrated), Circulate and condition mud for coring. POOH
and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4”, 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH.

Cut a 60 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 4300 ft. to 4360 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #9
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly,

PU 8-1/2” bit assembly and RIH to approx. 4360 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 4500 ft. GL. Run a deviation survey (TOTCQ). The deviation shall be kept at a
minimum and should be controlled using the BHA (stabilizer/reamer placement) and
operating parameters (weight on bit (WOB) and rotary speed). Mud logger to take samples
every 10 ft from 4360 ft to 4970 fi. Circulate and condition mud for logging. POOH and
rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4", 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH,

Cut a 60 ft., 4” non-oriented core from 4970 ft. to 5030 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #10
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" pilot bit assembly and RIH to approx. 4970 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total
depth of approx. 5820 ft. GL. Run a deviation survey (TOTCO) every 250 feet. The
deviation shall be kept at a minimum and should be controlied using the BHA
{stabilizer/reamer placement) and operating parameters (weight on bit (WOB) and rotary
speed). Mud logger to take samples every 10 ft from 5030 ft to 5920 ft. Circulate and
condition mud for coring. POOH and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4, 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH.
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57.

58,

59,
60.
61.
82.
63.
64,
65.
66.
67.
68.
69,
70,
71.

Cut a 80 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 5920 ft. to 5980 ft, GL, POOH and lay out core #11
(Cutin 3 ft sectlons. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" pilot bit assembly and RIH to approx. 5920 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total
depth of approx. 7500 ft. GL. Run a deviation survey (TOTCOQ) every 500 feet, The
deviation shali be kept at a minimum and should be controlled using the BHA
(stabilizer/reamer placement) and operating parameters {(weight on bit (WOB) and rotary
speed). Mud logger to take samples every 10 ft from 5980 ft to 7500 ft. Circulate and
condition mud for coring. POOH and rack back the BHA,

Circulate and condition mud for logging. POOH and rack back the BHA,
RU logging company, and log well per attached logging program,

Conduct multiple micro-fracture testing at Intervals determined from the open hole logs.
Rig up & run Drill stem tests if indicated by open hole logs

RIH and circuiate out the drilling fluid with salt blended water.

Puli the work string up to 1650 ft. GL,

Rig up cementing unit and spot a 200 ft cement plug from 1650 ft to 1450 ft.
Puil the work string up to 100 f. GL.

Spot a 100 ft cement piug from 100 ft to surface.

POOH and lay down the work string.

Nipple down the well contro! equipment.

Rig down and move out the drilling rig.

Remove the temporary flange from the 13-3/8" casing. Cut the 20" conductor and 13-3/8”
surface casing approx. 3 ft below ground level. Weld on Isolation cap/plate steel. Fill cellar
and cover casing stubs to grade.
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26" - 30" Bore Hole

80 ft-1201ft

17-1/2" Bore Hole

Approx. Base of Useable Water 1500 it.

Approx. Top of Sait 1570 ft.
1600 ft.

8-1/2" Bore Hole

Approx. Base of Salt 3050 ft.

8-1/2" Bore Hole

——————
——

st
[T
—
—
f—
—

_—
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TD - 7500 ft.

20" 0.500" Wall, 104.13 lb/it, 5L-Gr.B Line Pipe
Cemented to Surface

13-3/8", 0.380" Wall, 54.5 Ib/ft, K-55, ST&C
Cemented io Surface

Estimated Formations

Surface - 1600°
1600 - 3050°
3050° - 3600°
3600" - 4500°
4500' - 5100°

5100' - 7100
7100 - 7500

Services, Inc.

INIATERNS . CRAFTRCT - (FLRARSAY - RIATINACE
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Salt

Anhydrite/Claystone
Clay/Claystone
Unconsolidated Sandstone/
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Shist

A Parswms Brimckerhiaf Company




1.

MUD PROGRAM

Spud / Freshwater Mud: Depth 0 ft. to approx 1,600 ft.

Mud Weight 8.8 ~ 9.2 Ibs/gal
Viscosity 35 — 45 sec/qt.
Filtrate Control <25 ce

pH <9

% Solids <10%

Freshwater mud will consist mainly of freshwater mix with bentonite drilling clay. The mud
weight and % solids can be controlled by application of good surface solids confrol equipment
(i.e. shale shakers, desander, desilter and/or mud cleaner). The viscosity will be regulated
with water, bentonite and sodium bicarbonate (soda ash). A polyanionic ceilulose additive
(DRISPAC) will be used to control the filtrate loss of the fllter cake.

Saltwater Mud: Depth approx. 1,600 fi. to 7,500 fi.

Mud Weight 10.0 - 10.4 Ibs/gal
Viscosity . 35— 45 sec/qt.
Fiitrate Control <25¢cc

pH <9

% Solids <10%

Saltwater mud will consist mainly of make-up brine mixed with attapulgite clay. The mud
weight and % solids can be controlied by application of good surface solids control equipment
(i.e. shale shakers, desander, desilter andfor mud cleaner). The viscosity will be reguiated
with water saturated with salt and attapulgite. A pregelatinized starch additive (IMPERMEX)
will be used to control the fiitrate loss of the filter cake.

To counter any potential drilling problems such as abnormal formation pressures and lost
circulation, a supply of barite and loss circulation materials (LCM) will be kept on site.

The drilling fluid properties will be checked and recorded periodically during each 12-hour
tower (shift). A drilling fluids engineer from a third party (Baker Inteq, Bariod, etc) will set up
each of the driling mud (freshwater and saltwater) systems and check the drilling fluid
properties daily. The mud engineer will also be used as needed to deal with any problems

encountered during drilling.
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LOGGING PROGRAM

Surface Hole: Surface fo Approx. 1,600 ft. - Welenco

Electric Line Logging:  Duat Induction Resistivity Log w/SP
Gamma Ray
Combined Caliper Log

Mud Logging: None

Interval of Interest: 1,600 ft to Approx. 7,500 ft. - Schiumberger

Electric Line Logging:  Dual Laterolog Resistivity Log
Compensated Neutron (Porosity L.ogging)
Litho Density (Bulk Density Logging)
Eiemental Capture Spectrocopy
Combinable Magnetic Resonance CMR
Sonic Scanner
Combined Caliper Log
Formation Evaluation ELAN

Mud Logging: 10 ft Samples from 4,500 ft to 7,500 ft,

= PB Energy
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CASING PROGRAM

Conductor Casing:

24 - 26” Borehole
Surface to Approx. 80 fi.
20" - 0.500" Wall, 108.5 Ib/ft, J/KK-55, BT&C

El Paso Natural Gas Company
Picacho Storage Project
Strat Well

20" Conductor Casing & Cementing Hardware Program

Cc
2
c
c 1
SHOE
80 1. GL

C - 20" x 26" Bow Type Centralizers

PB Energy
Storage
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Surface Casing:
17-1/2" Borehole

Surface to Approx. 1,600 ft.
13-3/8" - 0.380” Wall, 54.5 Ib/it, JIK-565, ST&C

[+
c

1626° GL

El Paso Natural Gas Company
Picacho Storage Project
Sirat Well

13-3/8" Casing & Cementing Hardware Program

[+
14 28
13 27
12 26
c
1 25
10 24
9 23
Cc
8 22
7 21
6 20
c
s 19
4 18
3 17
c
2 16
COLLAR
15
1 .
SHOE ] |

G - 13-3/8" x 17.1i2" Bow Type Centralizers

‘“unnm
I
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CEMENTING PROGRAM

1. Conductor Casing:

26" X 20" Borehole Surface to Approx B8O ft,
(26° - 209 x /4 x 11144 = 1 5053 ft*/ft

80 ft x 1.5053 ft’/ft = 120 ft*

Excess: 50% of Open Hole Volume

145 sacks Standard/Class A Cement + 0.25 |bs/sack Cello Flake + 2% Calcium Chioride

Slurry Weight (Ib/gal) 15.20
Slurry Yield {ft*/sack) 1.27
Amount of Mix Water (galfsk) 5.75
Estimated Pumping Time 2:23
Compressive Strength

24 hrs @ 80 ° F (psl) 3000

2. Surface Casing:

17- 1/ " x 13-3/8" Borehole - Surface to A:Pprox. 1,600 ft,
(19 - 13.375%) x 11/4 x 1/144 = 0.9933 ft'/ft

80 ft x 0.9933 ftalft =79.5 ft*
{(17.5% ~ 13.375%) X /4 x 1/144 = 0.9757 ftsft

1020 ft x 0.9757 ft/ft = 975.7 ft

500 ft x 0.9757 ft'/ft = 487.8 f°
Excess: 50% of Open Hole Volume or 15% over caliper

Lead Slurry: 500 sacks Standard Lite Cement + 0.25 Ibs/sack Cello Flake + 2%
Calcium Chloride
385 sacks Standard/Class A Cement + 0.25 ibs/sack Cello Flake + 2%

Tail Shurry:
Calcium Chioride
Lead Tail
Slurry Slurry
Slurry Weight {Ib/gal) 12.00 15.20
Slurry Yield (ft/sack) 2.12 1.27
Amount of Mix Water (galfsk) 12.11 575
Estimated Pumping Time ‘ 5:00 2:30
Compressive Strength .
24 hrs @ 80 ° F (psi) : 340 3000
__'__:::-:- PB Energy
= == Storage
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APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR RE-ENTER
APPLICATION TO DRILL [J RE-ENTER OLD WELL O3

NAME OF COMPANY OR OPERATOR
E1 Paso Natural Gas Company

Address - Ciy Sigte Phone Number

2 North Nevada Ave Colorado Springs ~C0 80903 719.520.4533

g Goniadr United Drilling Inc

adssess P () Box 2488 Roswell, NM 88202

DESCRIPTION OF WELL AND LEASE

Federal, Stale or Indian Lease Number, or ¥ fee lease, name of lessor Well number Elevation {ground)
Owned by E1 Paso Natural Gas o 1-21 1527"
Nearest distance from proposad location to property or laasa line: Distance from proposed location In nearsal dritling, oompieledorappﬁed!nr
. well on tha same lease:
660 FHL i
' feal ] none faat
Nun'burofmhleau .| Murber of wedis on laass, induding Lhis wel, completed in or dri#ing to this raservolr:
234 . . none
i lease purdsasedﬁhmwmwdls Nama Addrass
drifled, from whom purchased. s
N/A & .
Wail ) foolage[mm "] Section - Township - R, orBlockmdSuwuy Dadication per AA.C. R12-7-104{A}3)
T8 R  and 20" FuL LTS 8E, G 4S. R.B &M, N/A
F_leldandreser_wk‘(ﬁ’wide_ﬂ. s0 stala)} K County
Stratigraphic Test _ Pinal

Dhmnmhnﬂessnd&edbnfromnemwmwpostomce

7 miles north east of Elm Arizona
Proposed depth: ' _ Rotary or cable tools Approximatas date work wilf start
8,000 _ Rotary April 2006
sondetmius  —Filad 03/02/05 - . | Ogenkation Repod Filing Fes of $25.00
Amount  $98 000 : On file X Or sitached Attached X
Remarks

Stratigraphic test per Arizona Administrative Code, Title 12, Chapter R12-7-128

APL# 02-02]- ?_ca.cmfi

CERTFICATE: |, the undersigned, under the penalty of perjury, state that1 am the: Manager ? Facili t‘Y Planni ng of the

E1 Paso Natural Gas Company _  (company), and that  am suthorized by sald company to make this raport; and that this

report was prepared under my supervision and direction and that the facts stated therein are true, coract and complete to the best of my knowledge.

Signatur

Hﬂm&bﬂfwmh 2/22(/2006
cm%'s’?ﬂi 1315 Date
433
Permit Number: 3 ’/ 2(- 2004 STATE OF ARIZONA
Approval Date; Oil. & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
Approved By: {NC_. /) A "’""‘"‘7<P Appiication to Drill or Re-enler
NOTICE: Befors sandlng in this form be sure lhatyou have File Two Coples
requestad. Much unnecessary corm w%lven sbaavoklod
Form No. 3
{Camplete Raverse Side) 5/96
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i { PERMIT 933

1. Operator shall outline on the plat the acreage dedicated to the well in compliance with A.A.C. R12-7-107.
A registered surveyor shall show on the plat the location of the well and certify this information In the space provided.

ALL DISTANCES SHOWN ON THE PLAT MUST BE FROM THE OUTER BOUNDARIES OF THE SECTION.
No _X

Is the operator the only owner in the dedicated acreage outlined on the plat below ?  YES

U

if the answer to question four is no, have the interests of all owners been consolidated by comrmunitization agreement or otherwise?
YES NO .Y} Ifanswerls yes, give lype of consolidation

8. Ifthe answer to question four is no, list all the owners and thelr respective inferasts below: Operator (EPNG) is the owner of |

100% of_the surface acreage.Ownership of a portion of underlying mineral interests is

Registered Land Surveyor

r
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Cqriificate N
8118
PROPOSED CASING PROGRAM
Size of Casing Walght Grade & Type Top Bottom Cementing Deplhs Sacks Cement Type
20" 104+# Grade B |0 120 120" 145 sacks |(Class A
13 3/8" 54.5#| K-55 0 1600 160¢' 885 sacks (&ttiLite &
: Class A
9 5/8" 40# | K-55 0 4500 4500 1520 sacks | Std Cemen
35% sa]ij
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10.
1.

12.
13.

14,

15.

16.

17.

18.

El. PASO NATURAL GAS COMPANY
ARIZONA GAS STORAGE #1-21
DRILLING PROGRAM (Revised 3/15/06) ? 3
G%

Prepare the location

Drill 24 - 26" conductor hole to approx. 80 ft. ground level (GL). Run 20" 104 Ib./#.
conductor casing and cement to surface. Construct cellar. (Gills Drilling)

Drill rat hole, and mouse hole according to rig contractor's specs. (Gills Drilling)
Conduct El Paso Natural Gas safety orientation

Move in and rig up drilling rig.

Nippie up (NU) flow line from conductor pipe to rig tanks.

Fill rig tanks with water. Make up (MU) spud mud.

Pick up (PU) 17-1/2" bit and run in the hole (RIH) to approx. 80 ft GL.

Drill 17-1/2" hole to approx. 1,600 ft. GL, run TOTCO survey approx. every 150 feet.
Monitor the chloride content of the drilling fluid returns. Stop drilling at the earlier of: 1) the
chloride levels in the drifling fluid exceed 30,000 mg/i or 2) upon reaching a depth of 1,600
feet. .

Conduct a wiper trip and circulate the:wéll clean, Circulate and condition mud for logging.
Pull out of hole (POOH) laying down the bottom hole assembly (BHA).

Rig up (RU) logging company, and log well per attached logging program.
RIH and circulate and condition mud to run casing. POOH

RU casing crews. Run approx. 40 joints of 13-3/8", 54.5 Lb/ft, ST&C surface casing to
approx. 1600 ft GL. Float shoe and float collar (stinger type) will be bucked onto first joint of
13-3/8" casing. Fill each joint of casing with drilling fluid as it is being run in. The
centralizers wilt be placed as per the attached casing program.

MU 13-3/8" ST&C cementing head and circulate well till cementing units are rigged up.
Circulate the well with the rig pumps until the cementing units are rigged up.

RU cementing company. Pressures test all cementing iines. Cement the 13-3/8" surface
casing fo surface per the cementing program.

Note: From information gathered during the drilling of the surface hole, it may become
necessary to run a cementing diverter tool and cement in two stages.

Note: Notify Steven Rauzi (520-770-3500) with the Arizona Geological Survey (Oil
and Gas Administrator) and Nancy Rumrill (415-972-3293 with the EPA 48
hours prior to cementing,

Wait on'cement (WOC) approx. 24 hours. After 8 hours of WOC, test the float equipment.
Remove the cementing head. Top off cement in the 13-3/8" x 17-1/2" annulus if hecessary.
After 18 hours of WOC, remove the flow line and cut off the 20° conductor pipe. Cut (at a
pre-determined elevation) and lay down the 13-3/8” surface casing.

Weld on a temporary 13-6/8” 3M flange. Nipple up a 13-5/8" 3M by 13-5/8" 3M drilling
spool with fwo 4" 5M outlets. On one outlet, install a 4" HCR valve and pipe to the rig’s
choke manifold. On the other outlet, install a 4" 5M by 2" 5M DSA and a bull plugged 2" 5M
Halliburton valve. Nipple up a 13-5/8" 3M annular BOP and a 13-3/8" 3M bell-nipple.
Nipple up a fill-up line and a 8" flow-fine. Function-test the annular BOP.
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18.

20.

21.
22,

23.
24,

25,
26.

27.

28.
28

30.

31.
32.

33.

34,

35.

36.

37.
38.

PU 12-1/4" x 8-1/2" center punch assembly and RIH to the float collar at approx. 1560 ft,
GL. Drill out the float collar from the 13-3/8" surface casing.

Pressure test the 13-3/8" casing (2486-psi Internal Yield Resistance) to 850-psi — 1 psifft
gradient (assuming 9.0 Ib/gal mud, 1600’ casing shoe (750-psi hydrostatic head) gives
1600-psi bottom hole test pressure. Confirm that bottomhole pressure does not exceed
70% of 2486 (1740-psi)} and hold for 30 minutes. Use a chart recorder to record the test
results. There shall not be more than a 10% drop in pressure. If so, then test must be
repeated.

Clean surface tanks and fill with salt saturated mud.
Drill out cement, float shoe and 10 ft — 15 ft of new formation. Circulate and condition the
drilling fluid. POOH.

PU 8-1/2" pilot bit and RIH to approx. 1610 ft. GL.

Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of approx. 1700 ft. GL or to a depth where the chloride
levels in the drilling fluid exceed 200,000 mg/l. Circulate and condition mud for coring.
POOH and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4", 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH,

Cuta 60 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 1700 ft. to 1760 ft. GL., POOH and lay out core #1
(Cut in 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). Lay down (LD) coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 1760 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 1860 ft. GL. Circulate and condition mud for coring. POOH and rack back the
BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2” x 4", 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH.

Cut a 60 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 1860 ft. to 1920 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #2
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 1920 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 2020 ft. GL. Run a deviation survey (TOTCO). The deviation shall be kept at a
minimum and should be controlled using the BHA (stabilizer/reamer placement) and
operating parameters (weight on bit (WOB) and rotary speed). Circulate and condition mud
for coring. POOH and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 47, 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH,

Cut a 60 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 2020 ft. to 2080 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #3
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx, 2080 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 2180 ft. GL. Circulate and condition mud for coring. POOH and rack back the

BHA.
PU coring assembly (8-1/2” x 4", 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH.

Cuta 60 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 2180 ft. to 2240 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #4
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 2240 ft. GL. Dril! 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 2340 ft. GL. Run a deviation survey (TOTCO). The deviation shall be kept ata
minimum and should be controlled using the BHA (stabilizer/reamer placement) and
operating parameters (weight on bit (WOB) and rotary speed). Circulate and condition
mud for coring. POOH and rack back the BHA,

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4", 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH.

Cut a 60 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 2340 fi. to 2400 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #5
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.
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39.

40.
41,

42,

43.
44,

45,
46.

47.
48.

49,

50,
51.

52,

63.
54,

56.
66.

57,

58,
59,

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 2400 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 2500 ft. GL. Mud logger to take samples every 10 ft from 2400 ft to 2500 ft.
Circuiate and condition mud for coring. POOH and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4”, 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH.

Cut a 60 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 2500 ft. to 2560 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #6
{Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 2560 ft. GL. Drili 8-1/2" hole to a totai depth of
approx. 2660 ft. GL. Run a deviation survey (TOTCO). The deviation shall be kept at a
minimum and should be controlied using the BHA (stabilizerireamer placement) and
operating parameters (weight on bit (WOB) and rotary speed). Circulate and condition
mud for coring. POOH and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 47, 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH.

Cut a 60 f., 4" non-oriented core from 2660 ft. to 2720 #. GL. POOH and lay out core #7
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

Rig up mud iogger.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 2720 ft. GL. Drili 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 3,500 ft. GL (anhydrite above claystone). Mud logger to take samples every 10 ft

- from 2720 ft to 3,500 ft. Circulate and condition mud for coring. POOH and rack back the

BHA.
PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4", 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH,

Cut a 60 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 3,500 ft. to 3,560 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #8
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 3,560 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx. 4300 ft. GL (claystone directly above the Lower Aquifer Unit). Mud logger to take
samples every 10 ft from 3,560 ft to 4300 ft (samples should be watched to ensure that the
evaporates have been fully penetrated). Circulate and condition mud for coring. POOH
and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4°, 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH.

Cut a 60 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 4300 ft. to 4360 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #9
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" bit assembly and RIH to approx. 4360 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a total depth of
approx, 4500 ft. GL. Run a deviation survey (TOTCO). The deviation shall be kept ata
minimum and should be controlled using the BHA (stabilizer/reamer placement) and
operating parameters (weight on bit (WOB) and rotary speed). Mud logger to take samples
every 10 ft from 4360 ft to 4500 fi. Circulate and condition mud for logging. POOH and
rack back the BHA.

Conduct a wiper trip and circulate the well clean. Circulate and condition mud for logging.
POGH laying down the BHA.

RU logging company, and log well per attached logging program.
Conduct multiple micro-fracture testing at intervals determined from the open hole logs.

PU 12-1/4" rock bit assembly and RIH to approx. 1600 ft. GL. Open the 8-1/2" pilot hole to
12-1/4" from 1600 ft to a total depth of approx. 4500 ft. GL.

Circulate and condition mud to run casing. POOH,
RD well control equipment. Install bradenhead/starting head and wellhead spool.
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60.

61.

62,

63.

€4,
65.
66.
67.

68.

69.

70.

71.

72.

73,
74,

75,

RU casing crews. Run approx. 112 joints of 9-5/8", 40 Lb/ft, LT&C casing to approx. 4500

it GL. Float shoe and float collar will be bucked onto first joint of 9-5/8" casing. Fill each

joint of casing with drilling fluid as it is being run in. The centralizers will be placed as per

the attached casing program.

MU 9-5/8" LT&G cementing head and circulate well till cementing units are rigged up.

Circuiate the well with the rig pumps until the cementing units are rigged up.

RU cementing company. Pressures test all cementing lines. Cement the 8-5/8” surface

casing to surface per the cementing program.

Note: From information gathered during the drilling of the intermediate hole, it may become
necessary to run a cementing diverter tool and cement in two stages.

Note: Notify Steven Rauzi (520-770-3500) with the Arizona Geological Survey (Oil
and Gas Administrator) and Nancy Rumrill (415-972-3293 with the EPA 48
hours prior to cementing.

Wait on cement (WOC) approx. 72 hours. After 12 hours of WOC, test the float equipment.
Remove the cementing-head. Top off cement in the 9-5/8" x 13-3/8" annulus, if necessary.
After 48 hours of WOC, remove the flow line and cut off the 13-3/8” pipe. Cut (ata pre-
determined elevation) and lay down the 13-3/8" surface casing. Clean surface tanks and
fill with fresh water “drill in” mud.

PU 8-1/2" bit and RIH to the float collar at approx. 4460 ft. GL.
Disptace salt saturated mud from the well with fresh water “drill in" mud and dispose.

Drill out the float collar from the 9-5/8" casing.

Pressure test the 9-5/8" casing (3590-psi Internal Yield Resistance) to 520-psi — (assuming
8.5 ib/gal mud, 4500’ casing shoe (1990-psi hydrostatic head) gives 2510-psi bottom hole
test pressure, which is 70% of 3590 (2510-psi). 1 psi/ft gradient (4500-psi bottom hole test
pressure would exceed the burst of the 9-5/8" casing)). Hold test pressure for 30 minutes.
Use a chart recorder to record the test results. There shall not be more than a 10% drop in
pressure. If so, then test must be repeated.

Drill out cement, float shoe, wellbore cement and drill approx. 10 feet of new formation,
Circulate and condition the driliing fluid. .

Drill an 8-1/2" hole to a depth of approx. 4970 ft. GL. Run a deviation survey {TOTCO).
Mud logger to take samples every 10 ft. Circulate and condition mud for coring. POCH
and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4", 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH.

Cut a 60 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 4970 ft. to 5030 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #10
(Cutin 3 f sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" pilot bit assembly and RIH to approx. 4970 ft. GL. Drill 8-1/2" hole to a tota}
depth of approx. 5920 ft. GL. Run a deviation survey (TOTCO) every 250 feet. The
deviation shall be kept at a minimum and should be controlled using the BHA
(stabilizerfreamer placement) and operating parameters (weight on bit (WOB} and rotary
speed). Mud logger to take samples every 10 ft from 5030 ft to 5920 ft. Circulate and
condition mud for coring. POOH and rack back the BHA.

PU coring assembly (8-1/2" x 4", 60 ft. conventional core barrel) and RIH,

Cut a 80 ft., 4" non-oriented core from 65920 ft. to 5980 ft. GL. POOH and lay out core #11
(Cutin 3 ft sections. Pack up cores). LD coring assembly.

PU 8-1/2" pilot bit assembly and RIH to approx. 5920 ft. GL. Dril 8-1/2" hole to a total
depth of approx. 7500 ft. GL. Run a deviation survey (TOTCO) every 500 feet. The
deviation shall be kept at a minimum and should be controlled using the BHA
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76.
77.
78.

79,
80.

81.
82.
83.
84,

85.
86.
87.

(stabilizer/reamer placement) and operating parameters (weight on bit (WOB) and rotary
speed). Mud logger to take samples every 10 ft from 5980 ft to 7500 ft. Circuiate and
condition mud for coring. POOH and rack back the BHA.

Circulate and condition mud for logging. POOH and rack back the BHA.
Rig up & run open-hole logs per logging program.

Rig up & run micro fracture tests and collect formation fluid samples as indicated by open
hole logs

RIH and circulate out the drilling fluid with salt blended water. POOH.

RU pumping and transport units and spot mud flush/mud acid (210 bbls) across the open
hole section. POOH. Let acid work on filter cake.

RIH with work string. Circulate out spent acid and dispose.

RU casing crews. Run approx. 75 joints of 7%, 23 Ib/ft, LT&C, slotted/pre-perforated casing.

Prepare 7" x 9-5/8" packer with a “polished bore receptacle” (PBR).

RIH and set the packef in the bottom 50" of the 9-5/8" casing (approx. 4450°). Set packer
according to manufacturer's instructions.

POOH and lay down the work string.
Nipple up the remainder of the wellhead.
Rig down and move out the driiling rig.
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All Depth from GL

26~ - 30" Bore Hole

soft-1201

17-1/2" Bore Hole

Approx. Base of Useable Water 1500 ft,

Approx. Top of Sait 1570 fi,
1600 f.

12-1/4™ Bore Hole

Approx. Base of Salt 3050 f1,

12-1/4"™ Bore Hole

4500 ft.

8-1/2" Bore Hole

gl

207 0.500" Wall, 104.13 Ibift, 5L-Gr.B Line Pipa
Cemented to Surface

13-3/8%, 0.380" Wall, 54.5 Ib/ft, K-55, ST&C
Cemented to Surface

Proposed Completion
7" Tubing wi7" x 9-5/8" Liner Hanger
Packer w/PBR

8-5/8" 0.385" Wall, 40 Ib/ft, K-55,
Cemenfed {o Surface

(o]
o
o 77, 0.317" Wall, 23 Ih/ft, J/K-55
Stotted/Pre-Perforated Liner
o]
o Estimated Formations
Surface - 1600 -  Clay/Claystone/Sand
o 1600'- 3050° - Salt
3050'-3600° -  Anhydrite/Claysione
o 3600'-4500' - - Clay/Claystone
4500'-5100" - Unconsolidated Sandstone/
o Siltsone
5100'-7100' -  Unconsolidated Conglomerate
o 7100'-7500° -  Shist
o]
TD - 7500 1.
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MUD PROGRAM

Spud / Freshwater Mud: Depth 0 ft. to approx 1,600 ft.

Mud Weight 8.8 - 9.2 Ibs/gal
Viscosity 35 — 45 sec/qt.
Filtrate Control <25cc

pH <9

% Solids < 10%

Freshwater mud will consist mainly of freshwater mix with bentonite drilling clay. The mud
weight and % solids can be controlled by application of good surface solids control equipment
(i.e. shale shakers, desander, desilter and/or mud cleaner). The viscosity will be regulated
with water, bentonite and sodium bicarbonate (soda ash). A polyanionic cellulose additive
(DRISPAC) will be used to control the filtrate loss of the filter cake.

Saltwater Mud: Depth approx. 1,600 ft. to 4,500 ft.

Mud Weight 10.0 — 10.4 Ibs/gal
Viscosity 35 ~ 45 sec/qt.
Filtrate Control <25cc

pH <9

% Solids <10%

Saltwater mud will consist mainly of make-up brine mixed with attapulgite clay. The mud
weight and % solids can be controlled by application of good surface solids control equipment
(i.e. shale shakers, desander, desilter and/or mud cleaner). The viscosity will be regulated
with water saturated with salt and attapulgite. A pregelatinized starch additive (IMPERMEX)
will be used to control the filtrate loss of the filter cake.

Light Brine Mud: Depth 4,500 ft. to approx 7,500 ft.

Mud Weight 9.0 — 9.4 lbs/gal
Viscosity 35 — 45 sec/qt,
Filtrate Control <1i0ce

pH <8

% Solids <10%

Light Brine mud will consist mainly of a brineffreshwater mix with xanthan gum and minimal
amount of bentonite drilling clay. The mud weight and % solids can be controlled by
application of good surface solids control equipment (i.e. shale shakers, desander, desilter
and/or mud cleaner). The viscosity will be regulated with water, xanthan gum. A polyanionic
cellulose additive (DRISPAC) will be used to control the filtrate loss of the filter cake.
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To counter any potential drilling problems such as abnormal formation pressures and lost
circulation, a supply of barite and loss circulation materials (LCM) will be kept on site.

The drilling fiuid properties will be checked and recorded periodically during each 12-hour
“tower (shift). A drilling fiuids engineer from a third party (Baker Inteq, Bariod, etc) will set up
each of the drilling mud (freshwater and saltwater) systems and check the drilling fluid

properties daily. The mud engineer will also be used as needed to deal with any problems
encountered during drilling.
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1.

LOGGING PROGRAM

Surface Hole: Surface to Approx. 1,600 ft. - Welenco

Electric Line Logging:  Dual Induction Resistivity Log w/SP
Gamma Ray
Combined Caliper Log

Directional Survey
Mud Logging: 10" Samples from 0’ to 1,600’

Production Hole: 8-5/8" casing to Approx. 4,500 ft. - Schiumberger

Electric Line Logging:  Dual Laterolog (Resistivity & Spontaneous Potential Log)
Compensated Neutron (Porosity Logging)
Litho Density (Bulk Density & Porosity Logging)
Elemental Capture Spectroscopy (Mineralogical Identification)
Sonic Scanner (Rock Properties and Fracture [dentification)
Combined Caliper Log (Hole Size)
Formation Evaluation ELAN (Computer Processed Log)

Cement Bond and Variable Density Log -0 to 1,600"
Directional Survey if in question

Mud Logging: 10 ft Samples from 1,600 ft to 4,500 ft

Interval of Interest: 4,500 ft to Approx. 7,500 ft. - Schlumberger

Electric Line Logging:  Dual Laterolog (Resistivity & Spontaneocus Potential Log)
Compensated Neutron (Porosity Logging)
Litho Density (Bulk Density & Porosity Logging)
Elemental Capture Spectroscopy (Mineralogical Identification)

Combinable Magnetic Resonance CMR (Permeability Identification)

Sonic Scanner (Rock Properties and Fracture ldentification)
Combined Caliper Log (Hole Size)

Formation Evaluation ELAN (Computer Processed Log)
Temperature Log

Cement Bond and Variable Density Log CBL - 0 ft. to 4,500 ft.

Mud Logging: 10 ft Samples from 4,500 ft to 7,500 ft.
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CASING PROGRAM

Conductor Casing:

24 - 26" Borehole
Surface to Approx. 80 it.

20" - 0.500" Wall, 108.5 Ib/ft, J/K-55, BT&C

El Paso Natural Gas Company
Picacho Storage Project
Strat Well

20" Conductor Casing & Cementing Hardware Program

c
2
c
c 1
SHOE
80t GL

C - 20" x 26" Bow Type Centralizers
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Surface Casing:

17-1/2" Borehole
Surface to Approx. 1,600 ft.
13-3/8" - 0.380" Wall, 54.5 Ib/ft, J/K-55, ST&C

El Paso Natural Gas Company
Picacho Storage Project
Strat Well
13-3/8" Casing & Cementing Hardware Program

]
14 28
c
13 27
12 26
[
11 25 39
c
10 24 38
c
23 37
c
22 38
3| 36
c
20 34
c
19 33
4 18 32
c
3 17 31
c
16 30
COLLAR
c 16 29
¢ 1
oL SHOE f | _.J

C - 13-3/18" x 17-1/2" Bow Type Centralizers

PB Energy
Storage

gl
Illlllillllll

Services, Inc.

—— ISTHEERAT - CONLTRATON . DPTRATOA . SAATINDECE

A Boreong Brinchaboff Compeny




3. Final Casing:
12-1/4" Borehole

Surface to Approx. 4,500 ft.
9-5/8" - 0.395”" Wall, 40 ib/ft, JIK-55, LT&C

El Paso Natural Gas Company
Picacho Slorage Project
Strat Well
7" Casing & Cementing Hardware Program

[
14 28
c
13 27
12 28
c
1 25
c
10 24
8 23
C
8 22
[
7 21
8 20
[+
5 19
c
4 18
3 17
[+
2 16
toLLAR
c 15
[ 1
500 oL SHOE f

c ]
42 §6 70 84 9B
c c
41 55 69 B3 97
c
40 54 68 82 96
c
3 53 67 81 85
c c
38 52 66 g0 o4
c
37 & 85 ) 93 107
c
36 50 64 78 92 108
c c
35 49 83 77 8t 165
c
34 48 62 78 80 104
c
33 47 61 75 8g 103
c [
32 45 60 74 [T} 162
c
EZ] 45 59 73 87 101
c
30 4 58 72 g6 190
G ¢
20 43 57 A 85 o9

C - 7" x 9-7/8" Bow Type Centralizers

PB Energy
Storage
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i

Services, Inc.
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1.

CEMENTING PROGRAM

Conductor Casing:

26" X 20" Borehole Surface to Approx 801t
(26% - 20%) x W4 X 1/144 = 1 5053 ft*/ft

80 ft x 1.5053 ft’fft = 120

Excess: 50% of Open Hole Volume

145 sacks Standard/Class A Cement + 0.25 Ibs/sack Celio Flake + 2% Calcium Chloride

Slurry Weight (ib/gal) 15.20
Slurry Yield (ft*/sack) 1.27
Amount of Mix Water (gal/sk) 5.75
Estimated Pumping Time 223

Compressive Strength
24 hrs @ 80 ° F {psi) 3000

Surface Casing:

17- 1/2" X 13- 3/8” Borehole - Surface to Aapprox 1,600 #.
(19% - 13.375%) X T7/4 X 1/144 = 0.9933 ft/ft
80ftx09933ftlft 795 ft*

(17.5% - 13.376%) x /4 x 1/144 = 0.9757 o/t

1020 ft x 0.9757 ft/ft = 975.7 >

500 ft x 0.9757 {t/ft = 487.8 #°

Excess: 50% of Open Hole Volume or 15% over caliper

Lead Slurry: 500 sacks Standard Lite Cement + 0.25 lbs/sack Cello Flake + 2%
Calcium Chiloride
Tail Slurry: 385 sacks Standard/Class A Cement + 0.25 ibsfsack Cello Flake + 2%
Calcium Chloride

Lead Tail
Slurry Slurry
Siurry Weight {lb/gai) 12.00 15.20
Slurry Yield (ft*/sack) 2.12 1.27
Amount of Mix Water (gal/sk) 12.11 5.76
Estimated Pumping Time 5:00 2:30
Compressive Strength
24 hrs @ 80 ° F {psi) 340 3000
=== PB Energy
= ; Storage

S=== Services, Inc.

ENFATERNG | CNSTRATTEN - CPETERE  SAUTIRINTE

A Pargame Brinikerbed Compony
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3. Final Casing:

12.25" x 9.625" Borehole - Surface to Approx. 4,500 ft.
(12.615% — 9.925% x 11/4 x 1/144 = 0.3627 ft*/ft

1600 ft x 0.3627 ft*/ft = 580.3 f°

(12.25% - 9.625%) x /4 x 1/144 = 0.3132 /it

2900 ft x 0.3132 ft/ft = 908.2 #*

Excess: 50% of Open Hole Volume or 15% over caliper

Lead Slurry: 1520 sacks Standard Cement + 35.2% Salt + 0.7% Attapulgite+ 0.25
Ibs/sack Cello Flake + 2% Calcium Chloride + 0.25% Defoamer

Lead
Slurry
Slurry Weight {Ibfgal) 16.20
Slurry Yield (ft%sack) 1.28
Amount of Mix Water {gal/sk) 523
Estimated Pumping Time 5:30 +
COMPRESSIVE STRENGTH
24 hrs @ 80 ° F (psi) 1292
=== PB Energy
= E= Storage

Services, Inc.

o EWFREELAS - (AL TR BN - DFTRABCAS - MANTIRINCE
——
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GREG GETTMAN

LOUISE GETTMAN

PH, 719-685-1556

2640 WHITE ROCK N,
COLORADO SPRINGS, CO 80904

§2-8928/ 1021

e Y/ Z00C
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' REMITTANCE ADVICE

EL PASO NATURAL GAS COMPANY CHECK DATE 01/19/2006
P.O. BOX 4430 CHECK NUMBER (7530562
HOUSTON, TX 77210-4430 VENDOR NUM FOo00004071
ARIZONA OIL & GAS CONSERVATION
COMMISSION N - . IR
416 WEST CONGRESS STE 100 S
TUCSON, AZ 85201 (M i
/7’h15 bk( ////
| lo ok //
,/;//
RETAIN FOR YOUR RECORDS Refer Payment Inquires to EPGTR - 713-420-4200
Voucher ID Invoice Number Invoice Date v Discount Pald Amount
00255412  CKREQ060113 01/13/2006 0.00 25.00
Off 1032 Colorado Springs, CO
TOTAL $0.00 $25.00
EL PASO NATURAL GAS COMPANY , _ 01/19/2006 07530562
0.0, O 4430 CITIBANK DELAWARE '
. HOUSTON, TX 772104430 A Subsidiary of Citicorp —3-621* 10
o One Penn's Way 3 Amonnt
$ *4%25.00
YOID AFTER ONE YEAR
Pay *S*TWENTY-FIVE AND XX / 100 US DOLLAR***
To The ARIZONA OIL & GAS CONSERVATION

Order OF COMMISSION

07530562 031100204918

JAE9LE0




PERFORMANCE BOND
KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS
" Bond Serial No, 23—007-048 -

Thatwe: El1 Paso Natural Gas Company

of the County of El Paso inthe State of ___Colorado

as principal, and Liberty Mutual Insurance Company

175 Berkeley Street, Boston, MA 02117
AUTHORIZED TO DO BUSINESS WITHIN THE STATE OF ARIZONA

as surety, are held and firmly bound unto the State of Arizona and the Oil and Gas Conservation Commission, hereinafter referred to
as the "Commission”, in the penal sum of _Twenty Five Thousand and 00/100 Dollars, ($25,000,00)

lawful money of the United States, for which payment, well and fruly to be mads, we bind ourselves, and each of us, and each of

our heirs, executors, administrators or successors, and assigns jointly and severally, firmly by these presents.

The conditions of this obligation are that, whereas the above bounden principal proposes 1o drill a well or wells for oil, gas or strati-
graphic purposes in and upon the following described land situated within the State, to-wit:

Sections 11 + 20 T7S, RBE Pina} County, Arizona

of

(May be used as blanket bond or for single well) ) :

NOW THEREFORE, If the above bounden principal shall comply with all the provisions of the Laws of this State and the rules,
regulations and orders of the Commission, especially with reference to the requirements of A.R.8. § 27-5616, providing for the proper
drilling, casing and plugging of sald well or wells, and filing with the Oil and Gas Conservation Commission all notices and records
required by said Commission, then in the event said well or weils do not produce ol or gas in commercial quanfites, or cease to produce
oil or gas in commercial quantites, this obligation is void; otherwise it shall remain in full force and effect,

Whenever the principal shall be, and declared by the Oil and Gas Conservation Commission in viclation of the Laws of this State and
the rules, requlations and orders of the Commission, the surety shall promptiy: '

1. Remedy the violation by its own efforts, or _
2. Obtain a bid or bids for submisston to the Commission to remedy the violation, and upon determination by the Commission and the
surety of the lowest responsible bidder, arrange for a contract between stich bidder and the Commission, and make available as work
progresses sufficient funds to pay the cost of remedying the violation; but not exceeding, including other costs and damages for which
the surety may be liable hereunder, the amount set forth in the first paragraph hereof,

Liabliity under this bond may not be terminated without written permission of this Commission.

WITNESS our hands and seals, this . 2. day of _March _ ,20 853

FEl1 Paso Natural Gps Company

/{% //g X%Wéf%ior Vice President

Principal
WITNESS our hands and seals, this . lat : day of March ,20_05.
(E,;i_ he,t’ty Mutual Tnsurance Company
- ,:::) Z/’)—\F’M fezl s Q’\'/‘\_/\

Suzanne Holden, Attorney-In—surety Fac

Countersignature Not Reguired
{Suraty, Resident Arizona Agent
iFissued In a slate other than Arizona}
{If the principat is a corporation, the bond should be executed by its duly authorized officers, with the seal of the corporation affixed.

When principal or surety executes this bond by agent, power of attorney or other evidence of authority must accompany the bond.)

gg?éoved 32-21-2005 STATE OF ARIZONA
STATE OF ARIZONA | OIL & GAS CONSEBFxQTION COMMISSION

OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

By: {L /e a"’/\g Form No. 2

Permit No. /3/ ff’h’/l/{&%

File Two Copies




Bond No. 23-007-048

NOTICE FROM SURETY REQUIRED BY
TERRORISM RISK INSURANCE ACT OF 2002

In accordance with the Terrorism Risk Insurance Act of 2002 (referred to
hereinafter as the “Act”), this disclosure notice is provided for surety bonds on
which one or more of the following companies is the issuing surety: Liberty
Mutual Insurance Company; Liberty Mutual Fire Insurance Company; LM
Insurance Corporation; The First Liberty Insurance Corporation; Liberty
Insurance Corporation; Employers Insurance Company of Wausau (formerly
“EMPLOYERS INSURANCE OF WAUSAU A Mutual Company”); Peerless
insurance Company; and any other company that is a part of or added to the
Liberty Mutual Group for which surety business is underwritten by Liberty Bond
Services (referred to collectively hereinafter as the “Issuing Sureties”).

NOTICE FORMS PART OF BOND

This notice forms part of surety bonds issued by any one or more of the Issuing
Sureties.

DISCLOSURE OF PREMIUM

The premium attributable to any bond coverage for “acts of terrorism” as defined
in Section 102(1) of the Act is Zero Dollars ($0.00).

DISCLOSURE OF FEDERAL PARTICIPATION
IN PAYMENT OF TERRORISM LOSSES

The United States will reimburse the Issuing Sureties for ninety percent (90%) of

any covered losses from terrorist acts certified under the Act exceeding the
applicable surety deductible.

LMIC-6539 2/03




,-each iridividually-if there be more than one named, its trus and Jawiul attr
- execution ‘of such undertakings, honds, recognizances:

 That this power is made and execut ant to and by authiority & ) 3y-laivand Authorizatio

- the extent hereln stated,” - - -

Not valid for mortgage, note, loan, letter of credit, bank deposit,

_currency rate, interest rate or residual value guarantees. :

CCOMMONWEALTH OF PENNSYLVANIA ss

|, the undersigned, Assistant S&cretaryof Libér
. 1 & full, true-and correct copy, 1s7in full foicé and effect on:fhe

THIS POWER OF ATTORNEY IS NOT VAL!D UnLESS IT IS PRINTED ON RED BACKGROUND. o - 1 65 13 1 0
This Power of Attorney fimits the acts of those named-herein, and they have no authority to bind the Company except in the manner and to

*. LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY
- BOSTON, MASSACHUSETTS
- POWEROF ATTORNEY

company, pursuant to and by authority of the By-law and Authorization hereinafter set forth, does hereby name, constitute and appofnt

- KNOW ALL PERSONS BY THESE PRESENTS: That Liberty Mutual insurance Company -(1he 'Company”), a Massachusetts stock insurance

PPATRICK D. DINEEN, HEIDI BOCKUS, THOMAS J. JOCHUMS, KATHIE L, WIEGERS, SUZANNE HOLDEN, THERESAA.

LAMB, KRISTA M. LEE,;ALL O

CETEET PP YLDV LI T T Y T PP Y £

F THE CITY OF SEATTLE, STATE OF WASHINGTON cerrs s e

T T O P TP T T YT LY LTI Iy Y

ledge and deliver, for and on its
ln the_pena] sum not exceeding

3re. Tamec e g fu -fact 10 make, execiite, seal, ackn
behalf as surety and as its act and daed, a.nyi:aﬁd_ all undertakings, bonds, recognizanées and other-suraty obligatiohs
SEVENTY-FIVE-MILLION AND 00/100* s xestaitasataras. 7 " = DOLLARS ($ .75',000,000.08***3_*
d_other surety obligations, in pursuance. of
nd-attested by the Secretary of the Comp:

Company as if they had been duly signed by the: presiden in thelr own proper persons.

“ARTICLE XIll - Execution of Coniracts: Section 5. Surety Bondé arid Undertakings. o L : s
-Arniy officer of the Company authorized for that purpose-in writing by the chairman or the president,-and subject to such limitations -as the
- “chalfman of-the president may prescribi, shal appoint such attomeys-in-fact, as may be necessary to-act in behalf.of the Gompany to maks,
-7 -executs, seal, acknowledge and deliver as ‘surety any-and all undértakings, bonds, recognizances and ofther: surety obfigations. . Such

o attorneys-in-fact, subject to the limitations ‘set forth in their respective powers of attomney; shall have full-power to bind the Company by their |
- ssighaiure and execution of any such Instruments and to attach thereto tha seal of,th__e‘ Compqny. "jWhen:so exacuted such instruments shaltbe |

- “asbinding as if signed by.the president and attested by the secretary. - . . 4 _ _
By the following Ihs’imfh’ent_ the chalrman or the president has authofized the officer or other.official named therein to appoint attorneys-in-fact - ©

 Pursuant to-Atticle XIll, Section 5 of the By-Laws, Gamiet W. Elliott, Assistant Secretary of Liberty Mutual Insurance Company, is hereby

“-authorized to-appoint stich attorneys-in-fact as may be necessary to act In behalf of the Company to make, execute; seal, acknowledge and

-deliver.as surety any and’all undertakings, bonds, recogrizances and other surety obligations: - ..
That the By-law and the Authorization set forth above aie true copies thereof and'are riow in full force and effect. -~ . -

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, this Powar of Attomey has been subscribed by an authorized officer or-official of the Company ‘and the corporate seal of
Liberty Mutuat Insurance Company has been affixed thereto in Plymouth Meeting, Pennsyivania this __16th__ day of December . - - |

© "LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY

- Garmel W, Elliott, Assistant Secrotary

COUNTY.OF MONTGOMERY =~ -

On this _16th - day of ﬁébemb'er 2004 , before me, a Notary Publlc, personally came Gamet W. Elliott, to me knowin, and acknowledged
that he is an Assistant Seretary of Libérly Mutiral Insurance CGompany; that he knows the seal of said corporation; and that he executed the above
Power of Altorney and affixed the g corporate seal of Liberty Mutual Insurance Company thergto with the authorily and at the direction of said corporation.

st

IN TESTIMONY. WH EQ% _ﬁ%@%«anm subscribed -my name and affixed my natarfal seal éu__Plymouth Meeting, Pennsylvania, on the day and year
(&1

first above written, 4

4 if gﬁaw% ;

WSS ' o i /N ;

s’té!la, Notary Publ'ic;

CERTIFICATE . N[O,

nce Company,

erty Mutual I by-certify tha po
tate.of this: terlificate; and | do' further-certify that the officer. or official who executed the

e }each, andthe -
-these presants, 'shall be as binding upon the -

ty of this waer of Attorne

- 1-610-832-8240 between 9:00.am and 4

‘To confirm the validi

do hereby certify that the original power of attorney of which the foregoing L.

yeall- . o0
30.pm EST on any business day. . .

said power of attorney Is an Assistant Secretary specially atttiorized by the chairman orthe president to.appaint aftoreys-in-fact as provided in Article -

This certificate and the above. pt i lly
following vote of the board of directors of Liberty Mutual Insurarice Gompany at a meeting duly called and field on’the 12th day-of March, 1980,

X, Sectton 5 of the.By-laws of Liberty' Mulual Insurance Company: - -2 ; _ & . T e o _ -

ower of atforney-may be signed by facsimile' or mechanically reproduced signatures under-and by authority of the .- - .

. 1 VOTED that the facsimile or mechanically reprod"uéed signature of many‘ a'ssi's_tan! séc}etary of the'céfnpany,'ﬁhefever éppe,aﬁng upon a
: certifted copy of any.power. of attomey issued by the company in corinection with surely bonds, shall be.valld and binding upon-the company - -

- . with the same force and éffect as though manually affixed.. *° T
i . RS | : . st

wﬁg%gg@wv WHEBE’OEOH?VQ h;greg“nto su?sc.riibf_ed my name and afﬁxgd the porporafé seal of t.he s"aiﬂd compajng, t_his

o Ll Y oy

_ Davifl M. Carey, Assistant Secretary

- daybf__:




AII_-lPurpose | |
Certificate of Acknowledgment

State of  Washington
County of King }
On March 1, 2005 before me, Kathie L. Wiegers .
DATE NAME OF NOTARY PUBLIC
personally appeared Suzanne Holden
NAME(S) OF SIGNER(S)
] personally known to me - OR D proved to me on the basis of satisfactory evidence fo be the
person(s) whose name(s) is/are subscribed to the within instrument
awiiiig, o and acknowledged to me that he/she/they executed the same in
°§\:€,\\<?._‘.};-;;,;3-/g{§@% ' his/her/their authorized capacity(ies), and that by his/her/their
A A signature(s) on the instrument the person(s), or the entity upon
E¥T00TAR, T0E behalf of which the person(s) acted, executed the instrument.
Zoh  ABUC  EE . .
Ty O o Witness my hand and official seal.
Wl

Neckos X Weeg

SIGMTURE OF NOTARY PUBLIC

Though the data below is not required by law, it may prove valuable to persons relying on the document and
prevent fraudulent reattachment of this form.

CAPACITY CLAIMED BY SIGNER DESCRIPTION OF ATTACHED DOCUMENT(S)

3 Individual(s) Type of Document
O Corporate Officer:

O] Title(s) Performance Bond

O Partner(s) Number of Pages
i Attorney-in-Fact

[J Trustee(s) Two (2)

O Subscribing Witness Date of Document
[0 Guardian/Conservator

O Other: March 1, 2005

Signer(s) Other Than Named Above

El Paso Natural Gas Company

SIGNER IS REPRESENTING:
NAME OF PERSON(S) OR ENTITY(IES)

Liberty Mutual Insurance Company

Document?2




ORGANIZATION REPORT

Full Name of the Company, Organization, or Indhn'dual

E1 Paso Natural Gas Company
Mailing Address and Phone Number

PO Box 1087 Colorado Springs C0__80944-1087 (719)473.,2300

Flan of Organization (State whether organlzahon is a corporation jeint stock assoclanon. firm or partnership, or individuat
Corporation

Purpose of Organization (State typs of business in which engaged)
Natural Gas Transmission

if a reorganiztion, give name and address of previous organization

I(f1;=1 g‘:r?!gn hcorp?ratlon g[tv% {2) Name and mailing address of state agent (3} Date of permit to do business in slate
ate where lncarporate CT Corporation System
Delaware 3225 N. Central Avenue (AZ) May 22, 1936
Phoenix A7 88012
Principal Officers or Partners (if partnership) TITLE. MAILING ADDRESS
NAME
James J. Cleary President P 0 Box 1087 Co Springs CO 8%?%&-
William H. Healy, Jr. Vice President o S e 09041087
- - P 0 Box 1087
Thomas P. Morgan Yice President Co_Springs CQ 80944-1087
Catherine E. Palazzari Vice President ﬁnoqigﬁniggzn a0044- 1027
Donald J. Zinko Vice President PO EET Eggz‘ onaAA 1nom
LA H L k3 3 APA RN AV oy Jadi m Vi r g
DIREGCTORS NAME ' MAILING ADDRESS

James J. Cleary P 0 Box 1087 Co Springs CO 80944-1087

Greg G. Gruber , 1001 Louisiana St HouSton TX 77002

John W. Somerhalder 1] 1001 Louisiana St Houston TX 77002
CERTIFICATE |, the undersigned, under the penalty of perjury state that | amthe __ L0 cporate_Secretary of the
ET Paso Natural Gas Company (company}, and that | am authorized by said company to make this report; and that this

reportwas prepared under my supervision and direction and that the facts stated therelyhr true, correct and cofinlete i?:lhe best of my knowledge.
Stgn;!ure é ;

Date
STATE OF ARIZONA
OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION

Mail completed form o ot
Qil and Gas Program Administrator Orgf;mlzahon Report
Arizona Geological Survey File One Copy
416 W Congress., #100 Form No. 1
Tucson, AZ 85701

2/96




EL PASO NATURAL GAS

Operator: El Paso Natural Gas Company

Bond Company: Liberty Mutual Insurance

Bond No.: 23-007-048
Amount: $25,000.00

Date of Bond: 3/2/2005

Date approved: 3/21/2005

Permits covered by this bond:

925
926
928
933

Plugged_ 9/5/05
Plugged 8/6/05
Expired, not drilled
TA 10/16/06




Natural
Gas

elpaso

August 8, 2007

Mr, Steven Rauzi

State of Arizona

Qil and Gas Conservation Commission

416 West Congress

Suite 100

Tucson, AZ 85701 6233

Re:  El Paso Natural Gas Company
AGS #1-21 \
Section 21, T7S, R8E . [ 69
Pinal County, AZ Al— peasn 0 2 { R
AZOGCC Permit #933 e

.,f/

"

Dear Mr. Rauzi:

Pursuant to the Arizona Administrative Code R12-7-121-C El Paso Natural Gas
Company (EPNG) requests that all well completion information from the captioned wells
be kept confidential for an additional two years (three years total). As you are aware
EPNG is working toward the development of a salt cavern gas storage facility in Section
21, T7S, R8E, Pinal County AZ. The disclosure of this information could harm our
competitive position with relation to the development of the facility and the possible need
to purchase additional acreage.

Please let me know if you have any questions or concerns.

Sincerely Yours,

A MZL RECEIVED
AUG 13 2007

Greg W. Gettman

Manager, Business Development
El Paso Natural Gas Company
Office 719-520-4533

Cell 719-351-4093

El Paso Natural Gas
PO Box 1687 Colorado Springs, Colorado 80944
tel 719.473.2300 fax 719.520.4318
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Lack of natural gas storage space means
volatility

Mark Shaffer

The Arizona Republic

Mar. 21, 2007 08:15 PM

When the coldest weather in a quarter-century struck the state in January, it was more than just a meteorological
phenomenon.

Thousands of Southwest Gas customers, from Bullhead City to Maricopa to just north of the Mexican border, were
without heating fuel, some for up {o two days.

The event highlights a continuing concern in the state.

Arizona is the only state in the Four Corners region with no natural-gas storage, leaving it open to potential
shortages. In addition, consumers have no cost protection except the skill of gas traders in hedging the volatile

natural-gas spot market.

On top of that, natural gas is increasingly used as a power source for electric generation, especially during the
summer months.

With the closest storage facilities 700 miles away in west Texas and California’s prohibition on natural-gas storage
for out-of-state users, the situation could beceme critical if there is a terrorist attack on pipelines or an accident
such as Kinder Morgan's 2003 pipeline break in Tucson. Cold weather, at times, also has slowed natural-gas
delivery to Arizona from northwestern New Mexico to a trickle.

In-state storage

The Arizona Corporation Commission conducted a special hearing last month after losing patience with the
proposed El Paso Natural Gas Co. storage project just outside Eloy's city limits. The hearing was triggered by the
company's failure to file any preapprovai paperwork with government agencies that would officiaily sign off on the

project.

Last year, the company announced that it would excavate a series of deep salt caverns next to privately owned
prisons and store about 3.5 billion cubic feet of natural gas, or enough to serve about 735,000 homes.
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But questions have been raised about how El Paso Natural Gas, which is the transmission company, would
remove brine, which is the mix of salt and water created when water is used to hollow out subterranean sait
deposits about 3,000 feet below ground,

El Paso Natural Gas officials said Tuesday that the project has been defayed but that it is still expected to be up
and running by 2011.

"The project is very much alive," said Richard Wheatley, an El Paso Natural Gas spokesman in Houston. "We're
doing test digs below the salt to know if it is good for brine disposal.”

Wheatley said the project would cost between $100 million and $175 million, depending on the uitimate size and
contracts struck with other energy companies. Wheatley said the method of financing the project had not been
determined.

Tom Dobson, manager of the Arizona gas-storage project, said an application is expected to be filed with the
Federal Energy Reguiatory Commission by December or early 2008.

Residents of Eloy have been largely supportive of the project because it is expected to bring in about $3 million
annually in city taxes, said Joe Blanton, Eloy's interim city manager. Blanton said the city is working on a
development agreement and rezoning issues with El Paso Natural Gas.

"The big picture for Arizona first and foremost is reliability of supply," Dobson said. "Fossil fuels have to be
imported basically because if they aren't out of state they are far away in-state from the Phoenix area. Our project
would move production to within 40 miles of Phoenix."

Vanishing options

The Eloy site appears to be the last alternative for the Phoenix area for natural-gas storage.

A promising salt cavern was discovered a decade ago in Glendale near Luke Air Force Base. El Paso Natural Gas
purchased the land, but the state Legislature prohibited development of the site for natural-gas storage.

Likewise, another potential site was found near Kingman and purchased by Aguila Energy Co. five years ago. But
that area in northwestern Arizona is too far away to help natural-gas needs in the Valley and was recently
purchased by real estate development interests.

According to a recent filing with the commission, Arizona Public Service Co. officials said they have sufficient
pipeline reliability and natural-gas storage space in the Permian Basin and Waha sites of west Texas, after
increased ailocations were made five years ago.

But an increase in the price of pipeline use this year and "substantial financial penalties" from imbalances in
pipeline usage have APS officials looking for other alternatives in natural-gas storage, according to the document.
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Randy Dietrich, fuels manager for Salt River Project, said pipeline imbalances typically catch shippers by surprise.

"if all the shippers don't buy sufficient quantities, the pressure in the pipeline can fall dramatically and the supplier
says they can't overburn (produce more to rectify the loss of pressure). And if they do, we all have to pay a lot of
penaities,” Dietrich said. "In cases like that, it sure would be great to have local storage that can be called on at

short notice.”

Dietrich also said that even the additional storage capacity near Eloy could have an impact on prices to
consumers.

"You used to be able to count on gas costs going up in the winter and down in the summer, but during the past 10
years, there has been so much construction of gas-fired plants that summer demand is almost the same,” Dietrich
said. "Trying to hedge that is increasingly speculative and having gas stored at home could help some on price."

But the main advantage of local storage is having gas at hand when state consumers need it, said Damon Gross,
an APS spokesman.

“That will ensure reliability and it can help against price volatility, but there's no guarantee,” Gross said.

Reach the reporter at mark.shaffer@arizonarepublic.com or (602) 444-8057.
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December 11, 2006

M. Steven Rauzi 7
Oil and Gas Program Administrator ﬁ 3
Arizona Geological Survey /
416 W. Congress #100

Tucson, AZ 85701-1315

Re:  ElPaso Natural Gas Company
AGS #1-21
Section 21, T7S, R8E
Pinal County, Arizona
AZOGCC Permit #933

Dear Steve:

Attached for your records is the color copy of the Schlumberger Combinable Magnetic
Resonance Log from covering the interval from 7,700° to 8,795°. Please keep this and
the other logs, drilling and completion data from the AGS #1-21 confidential as provided
for in R12-7-121(C).

If you have any questions or problems with the attached, please give me a call at (719)
520-4533.

Sincerely,
RECEIVED
Greg Gettman DEG T8

Manager, Facility Planning
El Paso Natural Gas Company

El Paso Natural Gas
FC Box 1087 Colorado Springs, Colorado 80844
tel 719.473.2300 fax 719.520.4318
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November 15, 2006

Mr, Steven Rauzi
Oil and Gas Program Administrator
Arizona Geological Survey ﬂ Z—g

416 W. Congress #100 /
Tucson, AZ 85701-1315
Re: Bl Paso Natural Gas Company

AGS #1-21

Section 21, T7S, R8E

Pinal County, Arizona
AZOGCC Permit #933

Dear Steve:

Attached for your review are two copies of the revised Sundry Notice and Reports Form
requesting authority from the Arizona Qil and Gas Conservation Commission to
temporarily abandon the AGS #1-21 for a period of up to three years. This form
incorporates the additional information you requested from R12-7-125.

Also attached are two copies of the Detail of Formations Penetrated Log for inclusion

with the previously filed Well Completion or Recompletion Report. In addition I have
included:

/1. Zia Geological Mud log with sample descriptions from 2,720° to 7,922

~~ 2. EPNG sample descriptions from 95 to 2,800 and 7,922 to 8,784’

¢ 3. Schlumberger Color PEX Array Induction, Gamma, SP Log 5,639’ — 7,927’

« 4. Schlumberger Color Combinable Magnetic Resonance Log 5,639’ — 7,927

«” 5. Schlumberger Color Elemental Capture Log 5,639° — 7,927

v 6. Schlumberger Color PEX Compensated Neutron Litho Density 5,639° - 7,927
v 7. Schlumberger Cement Bond Log 60°-5,612’

I'will provide you with color copies from of the third Schiumberger logging run covering
the interval from 7,922” to 8,795 once Schlumberger gets copies to me. If you have any
questions or problems with the attached, please give me a call at (719) 520-4533.
Sincerely,

Greg Gettman
Manager, Facility Planning

El Paso Natural Gas Company

£l Paso Weslern Pipelines

Two North Nevada Avenue  Colorado Sorings, CO 80203
PO Box 1087 Coforado Springs, CC 800244

tel 719.473.2300
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Qctober 5, 2006

Mr. Steven Rauzi

Oil and Gas Program Administrator
Arizona Geological Survey

416 W. Congress #100

Tucson, AZ 85701-1315

Re:  El Paso Natural Gas Company

AGS #1-21
Section 21, T7S, RRE
Pinal County, Arizona
AZOGCC Permit #933 RECEIVED
0CT 10 2006
Dear Steve:

Attached for your review are two copies of the Sundry Notice and Reports Form
requesting authority from the Arizona Qil and Gas Conservation Commission to
temporarily abandon the AGS #1-21 for a period of up to three years, This Temporary
Abandonment is necessary for El Paso Natural Gas to apply for a Temporary Aquifer
Protection Permit with the Arizona Department of Environmental Quality and a Class I
disposal permit from the Environmental Protections Agency to conduct injection testing
in this well bore. If you have any questions or problems with the attached, please give
me a call at (719) 520-4533.

Sincerely,

/57/ A

Greg Gettman

Manager, Facility Planning
El Paso Natural Gas Company

El Paso Natural Gas
PO Box 1087 Colorado Springs, Colorado 80944
tel 719.473.2300 fax 719.520.4318




SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

1. Name of Operator [/ %-SC’ /(/67"611/?/ 6:95 é”"/?‘“f
2, olbweLt [1° GASWELL [ ] OTHER [ {Specify) Wéﬁa /2 a

3. Wall Name 4 &S # / "Z/
Locaﬁnn/;?goff:/“/é-(: QQQ’FWL.
Sec. 2 / Twp. 7 S Rge. 5 /5 County ﬁ vt § / , Arizona

4, Federal, Stale, or Indian Lease Number, or lessor's name if fee lease

0&/»«:/ ;J?/ £/ ¢ So /I/Fruyu/ G‘J‘

5. Fleld or Pool Name A A
6. Check Appropriate Box to [ndicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL ORALTER CASING WATER SHUT--OFF WEEKLY PROGRESS
FRACTURE TREAT DIRECTIONAL DRILL FRACTURE TREATMENT REPAIRING WELL
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE PERFORATE CASING SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ALTER CASING
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS Tmﬂgﬁﬂ,{’y ABANDONMENT

(OTHER})

(OTHER)

{NOTE: Flelgort results of multiple completion on Well Completion
or Racompletion Report and Log, Form 4)

1. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give penlinant dates, including estimated date
of starting any proposed work. If well Is directionally drilled, give subsurface Jocatlons and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and

zones pertinent to this work.

El Paso Natural Gas Company (EPNG) is in the process of drilling the AGS #1-21 stratigraphic
test well. We currently anticipate completing the drilling and initial testing of this well during the
week of October 9th, 2006. At the completion of drilling the AGS #1-21 we will have surface 13
3/8” casing set and cemented from 1,604’ KB to the surface and 9 5/8” intermediate casing set at
5,640’ KB and alsc cemented to the surface. The remainder of the well bore from 5,940° KB fo
the projected total depth at approximately 7,900° will be left open hole. At the conclusion of drill
stem testing EPNG intends to install a master valve at the surface and set a Baker cast iron bridge
plug depth of approximately 5,420" to seal off the well bore.

EPNG is requesting approval from the Arizona Qil and Gas Conservation Commission to
temporarily abandon the AGS #1-21 a period of up to three years while we apply for and wait on
the processing of the necessary permits from the Arizona Department of Environmental Quality
and the Environmental Protections Agency to conduct injection testing in this well bore to
evaluate the suitability of the open hole portion of this well bore for brine disposal associated
with the potential development of a salt cavern natural gas storage facility at this site.

8. | hereby certify that the foregoing is trus and correct.

Title /I/?“Lq/(?‘?"/ Date /ﬂ*f‘ZéUé

Signed
STATE OF ARIZONA
CiL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
3 3 R E C E i V E D Sundry Notice and Reports On Wells
Parmit No. ? acT 19 7006 Form No. 25 File One Copy
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SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ONWELLS

1. Name of Operator f/ %—50 /%TQV‘*/ 6'-:05 ém/?an;/

2. OLWELL [ GASWELL [] oTHER [XI {Specify) St f;yw} oty i Test

3. Weli Name 45— AY # / ‘Z/

Loca!ion/.,?g’d’lr//é-{; ’GQQIFWL-

Sec. 2 / Twp. 7 S Rge. 6/ F County %‘ﬂ ¢ / , Arizona

4, Federal, State, or Indian Lease Number, or lessor's name if feo fease

0&)‘:4!’/ A}/ E/ ¢ ro /I/frﬂkff/ G‘J‘

5. Field or Pocl Name A A
6. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report, or Other Data

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REFPORT OF:
TEST WATER SHUT-OFF PULL OR ALTER CASING WATER SHUT--OFF WEEKLY PROGRESS
FRACTURE TREAT DIRECTIONAL DRILL FRACTURE TREATMENT REPAIRING WELL
SHOOT OR ACIDIZE PERFORATE CASING SHOOTING OR ACIDIZING ALTER CASING
REPAIR WELL CHANGE PLANS Tm,r%m,fy ABANDONMENT

{OTHER}

(OTHER}

{NOTE: He’gort results of multipla complation on Well Completion
of Recompletlon Report and Log, Form 4)

1. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly stale all pertinent detalls, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date
of starting any proposed work. if well is directionally drifled, give subsurfaca locations and measured and frue vertical depths for all markers and
zones pertinent to this work.

El Paso Natural Gas Company (EPNG) is in the process of drilling the AGS #1-21 stratigraphic
test well. We currently anticipate completing the drilling and initial testing of this well during the
week of October 9th, 2006. At the completion of drilling the AGS #1-21 we will have surface 13
3/8” casing set and cemented from 1,604’ KB to the surface and 9 5/8” intermediate casing set at
5,640° KB and also cemented to the surface. The remainder of the well bore from 5,940° KB to
the projected total depth at approximately 7,900” will be left open hole. At the conclusion of drill
stem testing EPNG intends to install 2 master valve at the surface and set a Baker cast iron bridge
plug depth of approximately 5,420 to seal off the well bore,

EPNG is requesting approval from the Arizona Oil and Gas Conservation Commission to
temporarily abandon the AGS #1-21 a period of up to three years while we apply for and wait on
the processing of the necessary permits from the Arizona Department of Environmental Quality
and the Environmental Protections Agency to conduct injection testing in this well bore to
evaluate the suitability of the open hole portion of this well bore for brine disposal associated
with the potential development of a salt cavern natural gas storage facility at this site.

8. | hereby certify that the foregoing Is true and corredt.

Tille /’//9“4}’7?"’ Date /ﬁ—f-Zmé

Signed
STATE OF ARIZONA
RECEIVED OIL & GAS CONSERVATION COMMISSION
? 3 3 Sundry Notice and Reporls On Wells
Permit No. 0CT 1 0 2006 Form No. 25 File Ona Copy
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FW: Southwest Gryo Deviation Survey to the top of Fish on AGS #1-21
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Subject: FW: Southwest Gryo Deviation Survey to the top of Fish on AGS #1-21
From: "Gettman, Greg W" <Greg.Gettman@EIPaso.com>

Date: Thu, 21 Sep 2006 14:18:33 -0600

To: Steve Rauzi <steve.rauzi@azgs.az.gov>

Greg W. Gettman

Manager, Facility Planning
El Paso Western Pipelines
2 North Nevada Ave.
Celeorade Springs, CO 80903
{7138) 520-4533 Office
(719} 351-4093 Cell

(719) 520-3792 Fax

————— Original Message---—--

From: Gettman, Greg W

Sent: Monday, August 28, 2006 9:57 AM

To: Gentges, Richard J (Rick); Lentz, Jac; Veatch, David I (David)
Subject: FW: Southwest Gryo Deviation Survey to the top of Fish on AGS
#1-21

fyi

----- Original Message--—-

From: Varcoe, Brian E. [mailto:Brian.Varcoe@weatherford.com]

Sent: Sunday, August 27, 2006 3:25 PM

To: Kennedy Jr, Larry D; Rasmussen, Pat D.

Cc: Brugeman, John P (Dan}; Gettman, Greg W

Subject: RE: Southwest Gryo Deviation Survey to the top of Fish on AGS
#1-21

Based upon new info here is a revised draft plan. Since we have some
inclination it would be best just to drop to 0 inclination and hold to
casing point. TIf I understand the location correctly as 1980 FNL and
660 FWL (well center is in the NW 1/4 of Section 21) and you own the NW
1/4 and the north 1/2 of the SW 1/4 this should be okay unless you have
other offset requirements.

I'm sorry the fax number {281-260-4730) didn't work., I did a test fax
here and it is working so I do not know what the problem is.

Regards, Brian

————— Original Message-—-—=—--

From: Kennedy Jr, Larry D [mailto:Larry.Kennedy@ElPaso.com]

Sent: Sunday, August 27, 2006 12:55 PM

To: Varcoe, Brian E.; pat.rasmussenfprecision-es.com

Cci Brugeman, John D (bDan); Gettman, Greg W

Subject: FW: Southwest Gryo Deviation Survey to the top of Fish on AGS
#1-21

Pat and Brain
Attached is the survy run from yesterday. Please include in the plan

getting the well back to vertical and away from the lease line which is
660' to the west of the well's surface location,

Larry

From: Gettman, Greg W

e
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Wi Southwest Uryo Deviation Survey to the top of Fish on AGS #1-21

i !
Sent: Sun 8/27/2006 11:31 aM
Te: Brugeman, John D (Dan); Gentges, Richard J (Rick); Kennedy Jr, Larry
D; Lentz, Jac; Veatch, David I (David):; Buschbom, Klaus

Cc: CurtisBagwell@aol.com .

Subject: Scouthwest Gryo Deviation Survey to the top of Fish on AGS #1-21

The attached files contain the results of the Southwest Exploration gyro
deviation survey we ran on the AGS #1-21. As you can see, the deviation
begins at 1,300' and continues to increase to over 8 degrees at the top
of the fish. Consequently, I recommend that we have Weatherford develop
a directional program to get us back to vertical and away from the lease
line by the casing set depth.

I do not have the e-mail addresses for the Weatherboard directional
personnel we talked to yesterday about designing the program. Dan or
Larry, please forward to Weathorford ASAP.

Thanks,

Greg G.

****************************k*************************************

This email and any files transmitted with it from the ElPaso
Corporation are confidential and intended solely for the

use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed.
If you have received this email in error please notify the

sender,
******************************************************************

******************************************************************

This email and any files transmitted with it from the ElPaso
Corporation are confidential and intended solely for the

use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed.
If you have received this email in error please notify the

sender.
******************************************************************

| Content-Descri tion';!“&kGiS #1-21 SIDETRACK :
| PHOR: R ART rev.pdf ?
AGS #1-21 SIDETRACK DRAFT rev.pdf:

IR T i U U U S SR e e - ML Ll oo

Content-Type: application/octet-stream
i : Content-Encoding: base64 g
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FW: Southwest Gryo Deviation Survey to the ton of Fish on AGS #1-21
[.

Subject: FW: Southwest Gryo Deviation Survey to the top of Fish on AGS #1-21
From: "Gettman, Greg W" <Greg.Gettman@EIPaso.com>

Date: Thu, 21 Sep 2006 14:21:27 -0600

To: Steve Rauzi <steve.rauzi@azgs.az.gov>

Greg W. Gettman

Manager, Facility Planning

El Paso Western Pipelines

2 North Nevada Ave.

Colorado Springs, CO 80803

(719) 520-4533 Office

(719) 351-4093 Cell

(719) 520-3792 Fax

From: Gettman, Greg W

Sent: Sunday, August 27, 2006 11:31 AM
To: Brugeman, John D (Dan); Gentges, Richard J (Rick); Kennedy Jr, Larry D; Lentz, Jac; Veatch, David I (David);
Buschbom, Klaus

Cc: CurtisBagwell@aol.com

Subject: Southwest Gryo Deviation Survey to the top of Fish on AGS #1-21

The attached files contain the results of the Southwest Exploration gyro deviation survey we ran on the AGS
#1-21. As you can see, the deviation begins at 1,300’ and continues to increase to over 8 degrees at the top of the
fish. Consequently, | recommend that we have Weatherford develop a directional program to get us back to
vertical and away from the lease line by the casing set depth.

I do not have the e-mail addresses for the Weatherboard directional personnel we talked to yesterday about
designing the program. Dan or Larry, please forward to Weathorford ASAP.

Thanks,
Greg G.

khkbthkhkdrhkhhkdtrhhdhibhhkhkhhkhkhbhdhhddhbhdbhdbhhkdbhddbhdtdddhdddhbthhdhdddsd
This email and any files transmitted with it from the ElPaso
Corporation are confidential and intended solely for the

use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed.

If you have received this email in error please notify the

sender,
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FW! Southwest Uiryo Deviation Survey to the top of Iish on AGS #1-21
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FW: Southwest Gryo Deviation Survey to the top of Fish on AGS #1-21
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FW: Southwest Gryo Deviation Survey to the top of Fish on AGS #1-21

50f7

Depth AZIMUTH TILT Easting Northing
TVD Closure Distance Closure Angle DLS
ft Deg Deg [£t] [ft]
[ft] [ft] deg fdeg/100ft]
0.00 -999.000 ~999,000 0.000000 0.000000
~5,00616e~-005 0.000000 G0.000000 0.000000
100.00 42.1400 0.250000 0.292754 0.323543
99.99%0 0.436331 42.1400 0.0762000
200.00 141,380 0.210000 0.521517 0.0371811
199.998 0.522841 85.9221 0.107097
300.00 166.510 0.200000 0.602946 ~-0,302254
299,998 0.674463 116.624 0.0273487
400.00 248.770 0.130000 0.391451 -0.384414
389.997 0.548642 134.480 0.0680849
500.00 95,3601 0.300000 0.912758 -0.433326
499.996 1.01040 115,396 0.128107
600.00 176.480 0.210000 0.935262 -0.,799153
599,995 1,23018 130,513 0.103205
700.00 141.270 0.230000 1.18641 -1.11231
699.995 1.62628 133.154 0.0409764
800.00 43,3800 0.220000 1.45014 -0.833230
799,994 1.677247 119.881 6.103449
900.00 192.250 0.270000 1.35015 -1,29374
899.993 1.86994 ’ 133.778 0.143933
1600.00 310.550 0.120000 1.19101 -1.15758
999.992 1.66087 134.184 0.104712
1100.00 281,950 0.180000 0.883663 -1.09253
1099,99 1.40516 141.033 0.0287080
1200.00 199.190 0.0500001 0.854878 -1.17495
1199.99 1.45310 143,958 0.0550596
1300.00 187.530 0.730000 0.688019 ~-2.43802
1299,98 2.53324 164,241 0.207601
1400.00 221.150 1.35000 -0.862289 -4.21204
1399.96 4.29%40 191.570 0.257563
1500.00 210.380 1.921000 -2.54788 -7.08735
1499.90 7.53142 199,773 0.193833
1600.00 216.050 2.35000 ~-4.96091 -10.4025
159%.82 11.5249 205,496 0.148542
1700.00 217.230 2.09000 -7.16736 -13.3063
1699.75 15.1138 208.309 0.0804589
1800.00 218.380 2.11000 -9,45330 ~-16.1925
1799.68 18.7500 210.277 0.0142172
1800.00 212,090 2.25000 -11.539%0 -19.5186
1899.80 22,6743 210,591 0.0844311
2000.00 211,740 1.88000 -13.2648 -22.3086
1999.55 25.9544 . 210.736 0.1t2841
2100.00 211.750 1.97000 -15.0737 -25.2318
2099.49 29,3915 210.855 0.0274320
2200.00 210.180 2.11000 -16.,9246 -28.4145
2199.42 33.0731 210.779 0.0459427
2300,00 208.920 1.79000 ~-18.4827 -31.121¢%
2299.38 36.1964 210.705 0.0975728
2400.00 218.850 2,03000 ~20.7047 -33.8806
2389.31 39.7061 211.429 0.116327
2500.00 218,360 2.34000 -23.2386 -37.0821
2499.23 43.7620 212.075 0.0946586
2600.00 211.260 2.33000 -25.3482 -40.5574
2599.15 47.8271 212.005 0.0881654
2700.00 212.150 1.94000 -27.1497 ~43,4236
2699.09 51,2124 212.015 0.119297
2800.00 205.550 1.96000 -28.6248 -46.5093
2799.03 54.6122 211.611 0.0686844
2900.00 207.470 1.68000 ~29.9772 -49.1105
2898.9% 57.5367 211.400 0.0873326
3000.,00 213.190 1.68000 -31.5820 -51.5639

9/21/2006 2:11 PM




FW: Southwest Gryo Deviation Survey to the top of Fish on AGS #1-21
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2998.94 60.4670 211,487 0.0510821

3100.00 210.910 1.73000 -33.1329 -54.1541
3058.90 63.4859 211.459 0.0256836

3200.00 210.820 2.13000 -35.0371 ~57.3459
3198.83 67.2023 211.424 0.121923

3300.00 213.850 2.53000 -37.4959 -61.0120
3298.73 71.6129 211.573 0.127528

3400.00 218.400 2.91000 -~40.6493 -64,9905
3358.60 76.6560 212.025 0.133128

3500.00 218.480 2.63000 ~43.5045 -68.5826
3498.50 81.2171 212,388 0.0853512

3600,00 218.800 3.08000 -46.8822 ~-72.7836
3598.35 86.5760 212,787 0.140291

3700.00 217,530 3.82000 -50.9407 -78.0670
3698,13 93.2170 213.125 0.223710

3800.00 219.880 4.54000 -56.0159 ~84.1413
3797.82 101,082 213.653 0.225535

3900.00 220.420 4.73000 -61.3626 ~-90.4191
3897.48 109.275 214.163 0.0594192

4000.00 223.430 4.28000 -66.4932 -95.8389
3997.20 116,647 214,753 0.15488%2

4100.00 223,670 3.78000 ~71.0454 ~100., 807
4096,98 123.164 215.228 0.15248¢

4200.00 222.760 4£.07000 ~75.8641 -105.818
4196.73 130.203 215.638 0.0904040

4300.00 223.270 4.47000 ~81,2062 -111.493
4296.42 137.932 216,068 0.122467

4400.00 224,490 4,97000 -87.2774 ~117.674
4396.05 146.507 216.564 0.155434

4500.00 226,040 6.26000 -95.1264 ~125.243
4495,45 157,273 217.218 0.395863

4¢00.00 230.720 6.70000 -104.,157 -132.629
4594.77 168.639 218.144 0.209423

4700, 00 227.490 6.81000 ~-112.898 -140,642
4694.06 180.350 218.755 0.120539

4800.00 227,260 6.66000 -121.416 -148,513
4793.39 191.828 2192.268 0.0464531

4900.00 226.560 7.54000 ~130.944 -157.535
4892.52 204,850 219.733 0.269512

5000, 00 226.540 7.64000 ~140.594 ~166.680
4991.64 218.057 220,148 0.0304899

5100.00 225.010 6.88999 -149.078 -175.161
5090.91 230.013 220.401 0.236065

5200.00 226,350 8.35000 -160.335 -185.900
5189.70 245.491 220 777 0. 630365
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State of Arizona

Arizona Geological Survey

416 W. Congress, Suite 100
Tucson, Arizona 85701

(520) 770-3500

. Janet Napolitano M. Lee Alfison
Governor -AZgS.AZ.EOV Director and State Geologist

September 5, 2006

o

12
Greg Gettman .

El Paso Natural Gas Company
PO Box 1087

Colorado Springs CO 80944

Dear Mr. Gettman:

I received your letter and Sundry Notice dated August 30, 20086. | approve your
proposed course of action in light of the problems you have encountered in the AGS #1-

21 hole.
Sincerely,
Sl /@W;/

Steven L. Rauzi
Qil & Gas Administrator

Enciosure




August 30, 2006

Mr. Steven Rauzi

State of Arizona

0Oil & Gas Conservation Commission
416 West Congress

Suite 100

Tucson, AZ 85701

Re:

El Paso Natural Gas Company
AGS #1-21

Section 21, T7S, R8E

Pinal County, AZ

AZOGCC Permit #933

Dear: Mr. Rauzi;

Natural

S0 Gas

Q-
\j\)'
o~

Attached for your review and approval is the Sundry Notice to notify the Arizona Oil and
Gas Conservation Commission of the problems we have experienced on the AGS #1-21.
Also detailed are the steps I discussed with you over the phone on August 25 that we plan
to take to resolve the situation. Please let me know if you have any questions or

concerns.
Sincerely Yours,
Greg Gettman

Manager, Facility Planning

El Paso Natural Gas Company
Office 719-520-4533

Cell 719-351-4093

El Paso Natural Gas
PO Box 1087 Celorado Springs, Coloradn 80944
tel 719.473.2300 fax 719.520.4318
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- Staff photo by Temple A, Stark

El Paso Natural Gas employees are drilling a well in Eloy to~

test the possibility of building natural gas storage caverns.
The well, which will be 7,500 to 8,000 feet deep, is for what’s
. called a stratigraphic test, and the data analysis will-give El

‘Paso Natural Gas engineers further information about the
geology in the area. They will use that information to deter-
mine the sultability of constructing salt caverns.to store the
gas deep below ground. The first of the caverns would open | -

- In mid-2010.7 Drilling began July 31.and is expected to con-
tinue for another five to six weeks. L

=




7-(2-06 ﬂ
Teest #I\ggr'rlj o o Enlerpbse Lo le

5/17’(#/917‘5( bole o /4§7L_ ('/04(?/{ (asted /70 6{?/5
WAL Clean b0 ot Dipe Sttt Fracle o next incek
/{Jr(. # 5/0(.6/ e -39 ' | ,
/Mac/h(: o o et o 7‘{57[

,,{(,// Clhrostie Kilsobe ADCQ /U‘t‘zfy f&imﬁ-,'/(.
5?1(*"(; ﬁr‘m—»/ Wayf abF o (- 7”(-(; /9
5(»7 Jrcle coifos Seone '&/éVf/erb’ 07/0‘.&/'9%(/”4&74




Casa Grande Valley Newspapers Inc. http://www.zwire.co “ite/news.cfin?newsid=16903949&BRD=181...

1 Your House
SOLM

A Sure §i

150
WHB

Hawkms &Asoc:tes

23

‘% o Valleyt ‘m&‘al.com

Home -> News -> Casa Grande Dispatch -> Top Stories Wednesday 12 July, 2006
r’

" NEWS SEARCH

" Top Stories

Natural Gas Storage Facility Comes to Eloy

! Advanced search |

i by Jerilyn Martin, Editor July 10, 2006

. 1 Casa Grande |

: Dispatch & Email to a friend ] Voice your oplnion
©. Top Slories
Polica/Courts Pinal County is expected fo see Arizona's first natural gas CLICK HERE
Obituaries storage facility within the next four years. The project is INTERNET
Locat News proposed in Eloy, near the CCA prison, around La Palma and
Around Arizona | Arica roads.
National i
Headlines According to James Cleary, president of El Paso Natural Gas Company,
AP News Link | Bisbee and Douglas became the first Arizona towns to receive natural gas
Sports-Local  ; by pipeline in 1931, thanks to a burgeoning copper industry scrambling for

energy to fuel its smelters. Within two years, a natural gas pipeline was

Sports - Arizona 4 |
also serving Tucson and Phoenix,

Sports - National

s::'e"ye;sfe i Natural gas fines have served Arizona and crossed the state from Texas to
N | California and back to New Mexico. Now, a storage facility will help to push

Editorial this gas through the state and serve more areas in between for greater

Entertainment efficiency. In fact, the Federal Energy Regulatory Commission recently

World News concluded that Arizona is one of the most natural gas storage-poor states

Weather in America,

Guestbook

: &Rea[ Estate -
_Buyers’ Guide

: ?D’;s:::t::"ey ! consumers. While sterage is pot a substitqte fc_;r more _su_pplies, it. does

"+ coolidge significantly enhance the efficiency and reliability of existing pipelines.
(Examiner | E|pagp Natural Gas' Western Pipelines has purchased 240 acres with salt
. R"’ F’":"“e | domes beneath the desert floor. The salt beds act as a barrier, a poison of
":Reminder

. »Eloy Ente'rrbrlse
¥ AZ City Ind/Ed

b Maricopa A .

. Monitor community, benefiting the Eloy area. Even though there are no housing
) Pinal Ways units near the site, there soon will be as the population grows over the next
, .Magazme five to 10 years. "We want to be active and we have this asset,” Tom

L PTV Roundup

j rSporl;s Wire
“* ¥ Personal Dobson also said that there are not many places in Arizona that have the

. Finance salt dome formations. Kingman was one site, but it was too far away from
. yFunand Phoenix. The location, ideal for natural gas storage, is well suited to ensure
:'Games | steady supplies to meet the increasing heating and elfectricity generation
b Our i needs of Arizona's growing economy. More than 70 percent of Arizona's
. Newspaper natural gas consumption is used to generate electricity. That number is

Cleary said development of substantial underground naturai gas storage is,
therefore, critical to Arizona's energy future. Storage also promotes supply
diversity and mitigates market price volatility, all of which benefit

sorts, that prevents piant growth, making the iand area impractical for
farmers and ideal for gas storage. Only 70 acres will house buildings and
piping, enclosed with a fence. The storage facility wiil be very low profife
and the company hopes the remaining acres wili be ufifized by the

Dobson, business development manager for El Paso Western Pipelines,
said. "We'll be here a long time. We want to find out what we can do."

pretty impressive compared to only 20 percent in most states,

7/12/2006 1:17 PM
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"Arizona is predicted to be ane of the top five fastest-growing states in the
nation during the next 30 years," said Cleary. "That growth will increase
demand for energy to sustain economic development in the state, and
natural gas storage is one of the most efficient, low-cost and least
environmentally distuptive ways to provide that energy to mest the needs of
consumers,”

El Paso is the largest operator of natural gas storage in the United States
and has safely operated storage facilities across the United States since
the 1940s to meet energy demand in major natural gas markets. The
Arizona Natural Gas Storage project is to include state-of-the-art safety and
efficiency features, such as remote emergency shutdown capabiiities,
below-suiface shutoff valves, gas-leak detection with alarms, and
advanced fire detection and suppression technology.

"Most people don't realize that we don't own the gas in our pipelines,”
Loren H. Locher, regional director of the Ef Paso Pipeline Group of Texas,
said. "We're a transportation company like Federal Express.”

Uses

Natural gas is one of the nation’s fastest-growing, clean-buming, domestic
energy sources, according to the EIA Annuai Energy Outlook 2008,

It Is used across the U.S., and most of the supply comes from North
Amerlca. There are many uses for natural, clean-burning gas across the
board: 57 percent of househelds use the gas for heat and more than 90
percent of electricity capacities built in the last five years use natural gas,

Other uses for natural gas include fuel for cooking, cooling homes and
providing an energy source for production of daily supplies such as fabrics,
steel, processed foods and medical supplies.

Supply/demand

The Energy information Administration predicts that consumption of natural
gas will Increase by 22 percent over the next 20-some years. Today the
supply of natural gas to the United States is about 24 percent. The
development of new natural gas supplies will offset declining production
from older producing natural gas fields.

Recent estimates by the Minerals Management Service and U.S. Geologic
Survey for future undiscovered natural gas resources range as high as
1042 tcf (trillion cubic feet), enough to last more than 47 years at current
production rates. Federal lands contain about 60 percent of the nation’s
estimated undiscovered natural gas. The United States produced 18.2
trillion cubic feet of natural gas in 2005.

In the past decade, demand for natural gas by Arizona's power plants has
increased ten-fold. Since 2001 alone, more than 9,500 megawatts of new,
natural gas-fired power generation has been instalied. Moreover, the
state's electric load, totaling 15,000 megawaits at summer peak, will
continue to increase as the population and economy expand, according to
the Governor's Essential Services Task Force. This will drive even greater
demand for natural gas and place additional strains on limited
pipeline-delivered supplies of natural gas.

Pinal County is leading the charge, Issuing a reported 30 percent of 2005
Arizona housing permits. According to University of Arizona projections,
residential permits for the Metro Phoenix area - Pinal and Maricopa
counties - could average more than 56,000 units annually through 2015
and population growth could be 140,000 on an average annual basis.

22006 1417 PM
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Eloy facility

The facility will bring much-needed storage capacity to Arizona - helping to
meet rapidly growing demand for clean-burning natural gas and to ensure
the reliability of Arizona's energy supplies well into the 21st century.

Nine miles of pipeline wili be needed to link the storage caverns with the
company's current network of pipes at a point somewhere along Arizona
87. One special feature for the Eloy facility is to have an automatic shut-off
switch underground, activated by rapid changes in pressure differences. It
is not, however, required for inland facilities.

One fear that always eventually comes out in the discussion is one of
smeil. Natural methane, Locher said, is almost entirely odorless and smells
nothing like bovine- generated, hay-based emissions.

By 2010, El Paso Natural Gas plans to create storage deep underground,
north of the city near the CCA prisons. The total capacity will be 3.5 billion
cubic feet of methane. That's the equivalent of 2,000 megawatts of power
or about a sixth of what Phoenix uses in a typical summer day.

The facility would be able to deliver 350 million cubic feet of natural gas per
day, enough to meet the electricity needs of 735,000 homes on a daily
basis.

El Paso expects to file an application for project approval with the Federal
Energy Regulatory Commission in the third quarter of 2007. Subject to
federal and state regulatory approvals, construction could begin in 2008.
The company estimates the first cavern will be in service by mid-2010 and
the remaining three caverns by 2011-2012.

Just as the Pinal Partnership, area chambers of commerce and leaders in
towns such as Casa Grande, Fiorence and Eloy - and a host of others in
the region - are working diligently to plan for sound growth and economic
development, so too does El Paso have to work hard to ensure proper
natural gas transportation and storage infrastructure is in place, where it's
needed, when it's needed.

Cleary said that as the company looks to the future, it is incumbent that it
does the job correctly and works closely with local and state officials and
key area stakehoiders to plan diligently for Arizona’s energy future. That's
how innovative solutions were found for Arizona's nascent copper industry
three quarters of a century ago when El Paso Natural Gas built its first
pipeline here.

Ei Paso Corporation provide natural gas and related energy products in a
safe, efficient and dependable manner. The company owns North
America's largest natural gas pipeline system and one of North America's
largest independent natural gas producers. El Paso has 27 other storage
facilities throughout the country. For more information, visit online at
www.elpaso.com.

©Casa Grande Valley Newspapers Inc. 2006
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El Paso planning new natural gas storage project in Arizona

L Paso Corp said its Western
EPipeline Group plans to

develop a new underground
natural gas storage facility near Eloy
in southern Arizona.

Plans call for the Arizona Natural
Gas Storage project to be located in a
currently unincorporated area about
40 miles southeast of Phoenix,

Based on customer demand and
final determination of geologic
suitability, the project could consist
of four underground salt caverns

capable of storing approximately 3.5
billion cu ft of natural gas, El Paso
said.

The facility would be able to
deliver 350 million ca ft of gas per
day, enough to meet the electric
energy needs of 735,000 homes on a
daily basis. The storage caverns will
support the company’s nearby
interstate pipelines.

El Paso expects to file an applica-
tion for project approval with the
Federal Energy Regulatory Commis-

Pl/Dwights PLus Drilling Wire™

sion in the third quarter of 2007.
Subject to federal and state regulatory
approvals, construction could begin
in 2008. The company estimates the
first cavern will be in service by mid-
2010 and the remaining three caverns
by 2011-2012.

In the past year, El Paso has
scheduled four stratigraphic tests near
Eloy in Pinal County as part of an
effort to evaluate the potential for gas
storage in the area (RMRR 4-19 &
7-21-05, 3-24-06),
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Eloy natural-gas plant in works 577

$100M facility to guard against in-state shortfall
By Scott Simonson

ARIZONA DAILY STAR

El Paso Corp. said Wednesday that it plans to build Arizona's first natural-gas storage facility in underground
salt caverns outside Eloy, about 50 miles northwest of Downtown Tucson.

If approved by federal regulators, the $100 million storage facility could help Arizona natural-gas companies,
inciuding Southwest Gas Corp., protect against shortages or interruptions in supply, said Richard Wheatley, an
El Paso Corp. spokesman.

Bill Moody, vice president of gas resources for Southwest Gas Corp., called the plan "a positive step” for local
utility customers. Southwest Gas has never experienced a short-term natural-gas supply shortage affecting
Arizona customers, Moody said.

UniSource Energy Services, which provides natural-gas service in Santa Cruz County, also views El Paso Corp.'s
plan as a positive step, said Joe Salkowski, spokesman for UniSource Energy Corp., whose subsidiaries incilude
UniSource Energy Services and Tucson Electric Power Co.

El Paso Corp.’s plan has several hurdles to clear. First, the company needs drilling tests to confirm that
underground salt caverns will accomimodate the project, Wheatley said,

Then, the company needs approval from federat regulators.

If federal and state regulators approve, the company anticipates that construction will begin in 2008, with the
first storage available in 2010,

The proposed storage facility would hold up te 3.5 billion cubic feet of natural gas in salt caverns more than
1,000 feet underground.

The natural gas stored at the faciiity would not belong to Ef Paso Corp., but to whoever paid to store it there,
Wheatley said.

That could benefit power plants, which are large consumers of natural gas, Moody said.

A 500- to 1,000-megawatt power plant operating at peak capacity on a summer day can use as much natural
gas as 800,000 Southwest Gas residential customers in Arizona, Moody said.

Gas companies could use the storage facility the same way a homeowner can use a rain-collecting cistern if
regular water service is disrupted, Mocdy said.

Currently, the natural-gas storage facility nearest to Tucson is in Carlsbad, N.M., Wheatley sald.

Storage facilities are useful during a shortage because natural gas moves slowly through supply pipelines. It
takes 24 to 30 hours for natural gas to travel from supply sources in West Texas {0 customers in Arizona,

Wheatley said.

The plant would be maostly automated, and would create four jobs at most, said Loren Locher, regional director
of state government affairs for El Paso Pipeiine Group.

¢ Confact reporfer Scoft Simonson at 573-4176 or al simonson@azstarnet.com.

6/22/2006 8:15 AM
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El Paso
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Subject: El Paso
From: Lee Allison <lee.allison@azgs.az.gov>
Date: Fri, 16 Jun 2006 09:10:00 -0700

To: Steve Rauzi <steve.rauzi@azgs.az.gov> ( Cf 'ﬁy

CC: Jon Spencer <jon.spencer@azgs.az.gov>

Steve, I've heard that El Paso NG discovered they did not have full access to mineral
rights for their Picacho basin well. Reportedly there are many family owners of
some of the properties that were not involved in the leasing, and EPNG is tracking
them down prior to drilling.

LA

Lee Allison, PhD, PG

State Geologist & Director
Arizona Geological Survey
416 W, Congress, #100
Tucson, AZ 85701
520-770-3500 fax-3505
WWH.azgs, az.dov

/\[jw( N"em%ﬂ/\
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Re: AGS #1-21 Update

lofl

Subject: Re: AGS #1-21 Update
From: Steve Rauzi <steve.rauzi{@azgs.az.gov>

Date: Fri, 09 Jun 2006 11:19:06 -0700

To: "Gettman, Greg W" <Greg.Gettman@ElPaso.com>

Thanks for the update.

Gettman, Greg W wrote:

Steve,

Just thought I would drop you a quick note and let you know that our United
Drilling rig #22 is taking longer on the current job just outside of Hobbs, NM
than anyone expected. At this point, we do not anticipate starting to drill the
AGS #1-21 until the week of June 26~th .

all is well.

Thanks,

Greg W. Gettman

Manager, Facility Planning
El Paso Western Pipelines
2 North Nevada Ave.
Colorado Springs, CC 80903
(719) 520-4533 Office
{719) 351-4093 Cell

(719) 520-3792 Fax

933

It should be hot enough by then.

LR EAEEEEEEEEEREEEEEEEREERS SRS S SRR SRS EEEE R e R R EEE R R R

This email and any files transmitted with it from the ElPasc
Corporation are confidential and intended solely for the

use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed.
If you have received this email in error please notify the

sender,
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Re: Picacho Reservoir well

Subject: Re: Picacho Reservoir well

From: Steve Rauzi <steve.rauzi(@azgs.az.gov> —
Date: Tue, 16 May 2006 08:57:17 -0700 ? ? g
To: Tom Shaw <thshaw@msn.com> :

v
Yes, El Paso permitted the 1-21 hole in 21-7s-8¢ in March. El Paso has not yet started drilling, I've
attached a copy of this permit, number 933. Steve

Tom Shaw wrote:

Last question, have any other permits been issued for deep tests in the Eloy area? If so, can | get a copy(s)?
From: Steve Rauzi [mallto:steve.rauzi@azgs.az.gov]

Sent: Tuesday, May 16, 2006 10:08 AM

To: Tom Shaw
Subject: Re: Picacho Reservoir weli

Tom, Here is the approved permit 926 for the El Paso 1-20 well. El Paso finished drilling the 1-20
in August 2005. By the way, I need to correct an error in my previous email: El Paso finished
drilling the 1-11 well in September 2005 not 2006. Steve

Tom Shaw wrote:
Thanks. Can | aiso get a copy of the permit for the well they drilled on State fands over behind the prison?

T-

From: Steve Rauzi [maiito:steve.rauzi@azas.az.qov]
Sent: Monday, May 15, 2006 5:35 PM

To: Tom Shaw
Subject: Re: Picacho Reservoir well

Hi Tom, Here's the approved permit 925 for the El Paso 1-11 well south of the Picacho Reservoir,
El Paso finished drilled the 1-11 in September 2006 and the completion report will be confidential
for one year from that date in accordance with R12-7-121(C). Steve

Tom Shaw wrote:
Steve,

Can | get scanned copies of the well permit and completion report for the well drilled by El Paso just south of
the Picacho reservoir? | believe it was Sec. 10, or 12, on State lands.

Tom

No virus found in this outgoing message.
Checked by AVG Free Edition.
Version: 7.1,392 / Virus Database: 268.5.6/339 - Release Date; 5/14/2006
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April 7, 2006

Mr. Steven Rauzi

Oil and Gas Program Administrator

Arizona Geological Survey

416 West Congress #100

Tucson, AZ 85701-1315 67

Re:  Arizona Gas Storage #1-21 /

Section 21, T7S, RSE
Pinal County, AZ
AZO&GCC Permit # 933

Dear Steve,

Attached for your review and approval are two copies of the Amended Application for
Permit to Drill or Re-Enter for the planned Arizona Gas Storage #1-21. Also attached are
two sets of the revised drilling procedure for this well. As we have discussed, El Paso
Natural Gas has revised the design of this stratigraphic test well to alleviate concerns
express by the Environmental Protection Agency with our original plan. If you have any
questions or concerns with the attached, please give me a call at (719) 520-4533.
Sincerely,

Greg Zl:l

Manager, Facility Planning
El Paso Natural Gas Company

El Paso MNatural Gas
PO Box 1087 Colorado Springs, Colorado 80944
tel 719.473.2300 fax 719.520.4318
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March 31, 2006

Mr. Greg Gettman

Manager of Facility Planning
El Paso Western Pipelines
P.O. Box 1087

2 North Nevada Avenue
Colorado Springs, CO 80944

Re: Response to Holland & Hart’s letter dated March 8§, 2006
Dear Mr. Gettman:

Thank you for the letter dated March 8, 2006 from Michael Brennan of Holland &
Hart on behalf of E] Paso Natural Gas Company concerning plans to drill a stratigraphic
test well in Section 21, Township 7 South, Range 8 East, Pinal County, Arizona (AGS
#1-21 well). A thorough review of your submittal indicates that you are proposing an
underground injection well, and therefore you are required to have a UIC perrmt prior to
all construction and drilling act1v1tles associated with the well. :

As my staff informed you during our joint March 3, 2006 meeting, the federal
UIC regulations require a UIC permit prior to construction of a proposed injection well..
The relevant federal regulations prohibit injection activities, including construction of an
injection well, unless and until the operator is authorized by permit. (See 40 C.F.R. §
144.31(a)). Thus, to the extent an injection well is proposed, a federal permit would be
required.

EPA recognizes that El Paso would not need a UIC permit to drill a "stratigraphic
test well” if the sole purpose of this test well was to obtain geological information, as
regulated by and described in Arizona’s Oil & Gas Conservation Commission
regulations. In contrast, you have already proposed this well to have a dual purpose,
which is to obtain geological information and to test the formation for-suitability of
injection. Although testing is proposed through the salt zone, the proposed depth of
drilling would also include evaluation of the potential injection zone.
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Further, a review of your drilling plan indicates construction consistent with a
proposed injection well. Speczﬁcal]y, you propose in your drilling plan to use casing
strings that are sized and designed ideally for injection purposes. The intent of the UIC
permitling program is to regulate such construction through issuance of a UIC permit.
The typical stratigraphic test well would use smaller diameter and less weight of casing,
such as you proposed in your stratigraphic test well.in 2005 (per Arizona Qil & Gas
Conservation Commission Permit Nos. 925 and 926).

We recognize that El Paso has limited information regarding the suitability of the
site for injection. This is acceptable since we are accustomed to writing the UIC permit
with limited available information. Information can be generated during construction of
the well, and the permit would require the submission of well logs, formation testing, and
injection parameters, as described at 40 CFR §§ 146. 14(b), prior to granting approval for
operation of the well. We can assist you with developing a UIC Permit application that
meets the requirements of the UIC program.

We appreciate the invitation for EPA’s early involvement in this project and
look forward to working with you in the future. If you have any questions concerning
this letter or want additional guidance on providing a UIC Permit application, please
contact Nancy Rumrill of my staff at 415-972-3293.

Sincerely,

DAL

“David Albright
Manager, Ground Water Ofﬁce

cc: V' Steve Rauzi, Arizona Oil & Gas Conservation Commission
Jason Jones, ADEQ
Michael J. Brennan, P.C., Holland and Hart LLP
Christopher Thomas, Squire, Sanders & Dempsey LLP
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EPNG planning fourth stratigraphic test
southeast of Phoenix Arizona

L Paso Natural Gas Co
E (EPNG) has plans to drill a

fourth stratigraphic test in
southern Atizona niear the town of
Eloy southeast of Phoenix, this one
to approzimately 8000 ft.

The 1-21 El Paso, sw nw 21-7s-8e,
Pinal County, is designed to evaluate
the potential for gas storage in the area
of the company’ interstate pipelines.
United Drilling Inc holds the contract.

EPNG last year scheduled three

4500-ft stratigraphic tests in the
vicinity at the 1-20 State, ¢ ne 20-7s-
8e; 1-11 State, sw ne 11-7s-8e; and 1-
14 Hiatt, ne nw 14-7s-8e (RMRR 4-
19 & 7-21-05).

In 2003, EPNG purchased
Copper Eagle Gas Storage LLC, which
was developing a gas storage project
near Luke Air Force Base west of
Phoenix (RMRR 8-27-03). The
company noted that the Luke salt
deposit near Phoenix extends neatly

10,000 ft deep. EPNGs plans called
for up to three underground storage
cavetns for 2 maximum stomge
capacity of 9.6 billion cu ft of gas.

Approximately two miles south-
east of the 1-21 El Paso, Unocal
Picacho Peak Gas Storage LLC a year
ago scheduled a 5000-ft stratigraphic
test at the 1-27 City of Mesa in se sw
27-75-8¢ (RMRR 1-11-05). The latter
project also is designed to evaluate
gas storage potential.

(Coastal, from preceding page)
ft. Log tops at that 4768-ft well
include Chatles at 4509 ft and
Mission Canyon at 4528 ft, measured
from a kelly bushing elevation of
2564 ft. Three yeats ago, Samson
Resources Co plugged its 1-21
Starbuck Coulee-Fee, sw sw 21-36n-
37e, after production tests of two
fract Cretaceous Eagle sand intervals
at 1460-75 and 1760-75 ft proved
unsuccessful. Total depth is 1970 ft.
In an area 18-19 miles to the east-
nottheast, Billings independent Canyon
Natural Gas LLC has plans to dxill two
temote 11,750-ft hotizontal Bakken
wildcats in northern Valley County at

locations in n/2 /2 36-37n-3% and n/
2n/2 25-37n-39% (RMRR 12-28-05).
Drilling permits have yet to be issued
for those ventures.

In an area 22-23 miles to the east-
southeast, Stone Bnergy Corp eatly
this yeat drilled the 31-11H Stahl, hw
ne (proposed bottom-hole location:
se se) 11-35n-40¢, a remote horizon-
tal Bakken wildcat projected to 2
measured total depth of 11,138 ft and
a ttue vettical depth of 6634 ft
(RMRR 10-3-05). No details have
been disclosed. Stone took ovet the
project from Canyon.

Coastal Petroleum Co (CPC), a

Pi/Dwights Prus Drilling Wire™

wholly owned subsidiary of
Apalachicola, Flotida-based Coastal (
Catibbean Qils & Minerals Ltd, has .
leases covering approximately 25,000
acres in southwestern Notth Dakota
as well as smallet areas of Montana,
Eatlier this year, Coastal Catib-
bean concluded a long-running
dispute with the state of Florida
concerning its attempt to obtain a
permit to drill on state leases offshore
Florida. That settlement tesulted in
Coastal Catibbean becoming ownet of
all of the outstanding stock of CPC
and gave it approximately $4.9 million
in cash, after payment of expenses.
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State of Arizona

Arizona Geological Survey

416 W. Congress, Suite 100
Tucson, Arizona 85701

(520) 770-3500

Janet Napolitano M. Lee Allison
Governor WWW.AZgs.aZ.gov Director and State Geologist

March 21, 20086

Terry Doolittle
County Manager

31 N, Pinal Street
Florence, AZ 856232

Re: ElPaso Natural Gas #1-21 AGS, Sec. 21-7s-8e, Pinal Co., State Permit 933.

Dear Mr. Doolittle:

| am enclosing a copy of the approved application to drill the referenced well
because of a policy of the Arizona Oil and Gas Conservation Commission to inform
county government about proposed exploration and drilling activity. The referenced well
is a stratigraphic well to obtain information about subsurface geology.

The Commission issuss a permit to drill under A.R.S. § 27-513. The permit is
issued for wells that are in compliance with applicable statutes (A.R.S. § 27-516) and
rules (12 AA.C. 7), which were promulgated to safeguard the public health and safety
and protect the environment and natural resources.

Sincerely,

Steven L. Rauzi
Oil and Gas Program Administrator

Enclosure

c J. Dale Nations, Chairman, Oll and Gas Conservation Commission
M. Lee Allison, Director and State Geologist




State of Arizona

Arizona Geological Survey

416 W. Congress, Suite 100
Tucson, Arizona 85701
(520) 770-3500

t Napolitan, M. Loe Al
Jméov:ﬂor ° WWW.AZ25.22.20V Disector ad ; ti:lehg);logm
March 21, 2006
Mr. Greg Gettman
El Paso Natural Gas Company
PC Box 1087

Colorado Springs CO 80944

Re:  El Paso Natural Gas #1-21 AGS, Sec. 21-7s-8e, Pinal Co., State Permit 933

Dear Mr, Gettman:

I have enclosed an approved copy of your application for permit to drill, Permit to Drill
#933, and filing-fee receipt #3139.

The referenced application is approved on the condition that El Paso Natural Gas
Company conduct ifs operations in compliance with all applicable statutes and rules of the State
of Arizona and that El Paso Natural Gas or its designated representative notify me at least 48
hours before you:

e Move in drilling equipment and commence operations, and
¢ Run and cement surface casing

An operator shall post a sign at the well site pursuant to A.A.C. R12-7-106 and submit
drilling samples and all other well data and information pursuant to A.A.C. R12-7-121. Several
Sundry Notice forms are enclosed for your use in reporting all pertinent drilling and testing
activity to the Oil and Gas Conservation Commission of the State of Arizona. An operator is
required to keep daily drilling reports detailing the spud date and daily progress (depth) and -
status of the well and to submit the reports to the Commission at the letterhead address on a
weekly basis through the completion of operations.

Sincerely,

§)/{Z¢»&M (. @W

Steven L. Rauzi
Oil & Gas Administrator

Enclosures

c J. Dale Nations, Chairman, Oil and Gas Conservation Commission
M. Lee Allison, Director and State Geologist
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March 14, 2006

. %2
M, Steven Rauzi /
il and Gas Program Administrator :

Arizona Geological Survey
416 W. Congress #100
Tucson, AZ 85701-1315 RECEWED

M

N o fiﬂip‘.
MR L B

Dear Steve:

Attached is a personal check for $25.00 as a replacement for the original check which
was mcluded with the Application for Permit to Drill or Re-Enter the Arizona Gas
Storage #1-21 which was lost by UPS. Also included are two copies of the revised
drilling program for this stratigraphic test well.  If you have any questions or problems
with the attached materials, please give me a call at (719) 520-4533.

Sincerely,
Gregéélan

Manager, Facility Planning
El Paso Natural Gas Company

Et Paso Natural Gas
PO Box 1087 Colorado Springs, Colorade 80944
tel 718.473.2300 fax 712.520.4318




Arizona Qil and Gas Commission Drilling Perre** Application

1 of 2

Subject: Arizona Oil and Gas Commission Drilling Permit Application
From: "Gettman, Greg W" <Greg.Gettman@EIPaso.com>

Date: Wed, 08 Mar 2006 14:43:33 -0700

To: Rumrill.Nancy@epamail.epa.gov

CC: Steve Rauzi <steve.rauzi(@azgs.az.gov>

Nancy,

Steve Rauzi with the Arizona 0il and Gas Conservation Commission
contacted me this afternoon to let me know he had not vet received the
Drilling Permit Application for the AGS #1-21. UPS has placed a tracker
on the letter and they have confirmed it was picked up here on February
28, 2006 and that they never delivered to Mr. Rauzi in Tucson.

I have sent {(via UPS Overnight) Mr. Rauzi two copies of the application
and supporting documents that he should have in the morning. Sorry for
the confusion.

Greg W. Gettman

Manager, Facility Planning
El Paso Western Pipelines
2 North Nevada Ave.
Colorado Springs, CO 80903
(719} 520-4533 0Office
(719} 351-4093 Cell

(719} 520~3792 Fax

Nancy,

For your review, I have attached El Paso Natural Gas Company's Permit
Application with Arizona 0il and Gas Conservation Commission to Drill
the AGS #1-21 stratigraphic test well., BAlso attached are our proposed
drilling and completion procedures for the AGS #1-21 with the planned
casing, logging, cementing programs, etc, and a regicnal map showing the
location of this well in relation to other deep wells in the area.
Please let me know if you have any questions regarding this material.

We intend to send you a formal letter in the near future to follow up on
our March 3rd meeting with you and George, which will also include this
information,

Thanks,

Greg W. Gettman

Manager, Facility Planning

El Paso Western Pipelines

2 North Nevada Ave.

Colorado Springs, CO 80903

{719) 520-4533 Office

{(719) 351-4093 Cell

(719) 520-3792 Fax

uuuuu Original Message-----

From: Rumrill.Nancy@epamail.epa.gov
fmailto:Rumrill.NancyBepamail.epa.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, March 07, 2006 12:36 PM
To: Gettman, Greg W

Cc: Robin.Georgefepamail.epa.gov
Subject: Letter concerning your plans for a new proposed well

Greg,

Per our meeting on friday, 3/3, I had asked for a letter from you
describing your plans for the new proposed well, including its location,
the scheduled rig date, the plans for drilling and construction and
proposed testing. Please also include the permit or type of

12
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Arizona Oil and Gas Commission Drilling Permit Application
r

2o0f2

authorization that you have obtained from Arizona's Qil and Gas
Conservation Commission. If you can e-mail me this information as socon
as possible, this would help me in informing my management and getting
back to you on our management decision concerning this issue.

Thank you, Nancy

Nancy Rumrill

U.S. Environmental Protection Agency, Region 9
Ground Water Office, WTR-9

75 Hawthorne Street

San Francisco, CA 94105

415-972-3293

415-947-3545 (FAX)

hkbkhkdhhhhkdhdbhhbbhkhhdbhbhhhdbhdbhbbddhdd b kb ddhkdkhdhhkhdhhhrdhhhdr b hhbhrhd i

This email and any files transmitted with it from the ElPaso
Corporation are confidential and intended soclely for the

use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed.
If you have received this email in error please notify the

sender.
******************************************************************

} Content—Descnptmn. AGSI- 21Perm1tApp pdf

AGSI-ZlPermltApp pdf Content-Type: application/octet-stream -
; Content-Encoding: base64

AGS 1 -21 Drlllmg Procedures

Content—Descrlpt“’n' Rev3 (2).doc
AGSI-ZI Drilling Procedures Rev3 (2).dec’  Content-Type: application/msword

;:’ Content-Encoding: base64

Content—])escrlptlon- Anzona NG Storage Exh 1 ppt

Arlzona NG Storage Exh l.ppt Content-Type: apphcat1on/vnd.ms-powerpomt J

Content-Encodmg base64

3/8/2006 3:40 PM
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Re: Fw: Requesting information on wells propo~ - by El Paso Natura...

Subject: Re: Fw: Requesting information on wells proposed by El Paso Natural Gas

From: Steve Rauzi <steve.rauzi@azgs.az.gov>

Date: Wed, 08 Mar 2006 10:08:09 -0700 9 '33
To: Rumrill.Nancy@epamail.epa.gov

Hi Nancy, I have not yet received anything from El1 Paso about drilling a
stratigraphic well but the permit you attached to your email looks like a follow-up
to two stratigraphic tests that El Paso drilled last year to obtain information about
the subsurface geology relative to potential subsurface storage of natural gas in the
Picachc basin. El Paso plugged both of those holes shortly after they were drilled.
It normally takes about a week to issue a permit for a stratigraphic test hole if an
application is complete and in order. El Paso currently has a bond and organization
report on file so that part of the application is already in place. Of course the
process for permitting a storage well is far more involved than for a simple
stratigraphic test. Steve

Rumriil.Nancy@epamall .epa.gov wrote:
Steve,

I received the permit application from E1 Paso Natural Gas. Do
they meet all of your requirements for your agency to issue the permit?
How long does your permit application processing take and about when
would you issue the permit? Does El Paso have to get their permit from
you prior to their drilling and constructing the well?

I've reviewed the OGCC website. What would a permit from your
agency authorize them to do? {Conduct stratigraphic testing for the
purpose of oil or gas production?)

Please call me at 415-9272-3293 if you want to discuss my
questions.

Thank you, Nancy

{See attached file: AGS1-21Permitlpp.pdf)

Nancy Rumrill

U.S. Environmental Protection Agency, Region 9

Ground Water Office, WTR-9G

75 Hawthorne Street

San Francisco, CA 94105

415-972-3293

415-947-3545 (FAX)

————— Forwarded by Nancy Rumrill/RS/USEPA/US on 03/07/2006 04:03 PM

Nancy

Rumrill/R9/USEPA

/Us To
: Steve,RauziBazgs.az.gov
03/07/2006 03:20 cc
PM

Subject
Requesting information on wells
propesed by El Paso Natural Gas

1 of2 | 3/8/2006 10:09 AM




Re: Fw: Requesting information on wells proposed by EI Paso Natura...

2 of2

f i

Steve,

The Ground Water Office, USEPA Region 9, is reviewing a proposed
well owned by EL Paso Natural Gas for injection of brine waste . I do
not have all of their information yet or its location. E1 Paso has
confirmed that they have classified the well as an oll and gas
exploratory well to be drilled next month. Are you aware of a recent
oil & gas exploratory permit that you've issued to El Paso Natural Gas?
May I have a copy of the permit?

If you need additional info to look this up, I'11 be getting more
info soon,

Thank you, Nancy

Nancy Rumrill

U.S. Environmental Protection Agency, Region 9
Ground Water Office, WTR-9

75 Hawthorne Street

San Francisco, CA 94105

415-972-3293

415-947-3545 (FAX)

3/8/2006 10:09 AM
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February 28, 2006

Mr. Steven Rauzi e
Oil and Gas Program Administrator /
Arizona Geological Survey
416 W. Congress #100
Tucson, AZ 85701-1315

Dear Steve:

Attached for your review are two copies of the Application for Permit to Drill or Re-

Enter for the proposed Arizona Gas Storage #1-21 along ith the $25.00 application fee.
Also attached are two copies of the proposed drilling program for this stratigraphic test
well. [believe the Organization Report and Performance Bond for El Paso Natural Gas
Company that were filed with the Arizona Oil and Gas Commission on March 18™ of
2005 are still current. If you have any questions or problems with the attached materi
please give me a call at (719) 520-4533.

Sincerely,

/j?/ W Cteoe,

T will  send @ mew
Greg Gettman cdec./f ;7( 0/_( 04:(’& po 7

Manager, Facility Planning s :
El Paso Natural Gas Company / voce7e 7'4 e o7 /"7" “q / /C' 77
7Z0vr é <

Goes 6
ey
704-520-1533

El Paso Natural Gas
PO Box 1087 Coforado Springs, Calorado 80944
tel 719.473.2300 fax 715.5204318




